

EXHIBIT A

Remand Fees

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
1/8/2018	TPK	Review email and communication re Gilbert.	0.30	\$169.50
1/8/2018	SHS	Prepared for and attend meeting with Justice Gilbert; reviewed mediation agreement; analyzed issues regarding same.	5.10	\$2,754.00
1/9/2018	SHS	Reviewed issues regarding mediation; reviewed ongoing conflict issues; analyzed issues regarding impact on discharge; reviewed issues regarding timing of motion for discharge; telephone conference with potential expert.	7.00	\$3,780.00
1/10/2018	AFM	Strategy call with T. Kane regarding fee application and response to motion for discharge.	0.10	\$37.00
1/16/2018	AEK	Review fee application and exhibits.	1.10	\$242.00
1/17/2018	AEK	Exchange communications regarding fee appeal opinion; review fee application for additional fees.	1.20	\$264.00
1/19/2018	SHS	Reviewed discharge issues; reviewed attorney fees and related matters. Telephone conference with Justice Gilbert, analyzed next steps regarding mediation.	1.90	\$1,026.00
1/19/2018	SHS	Reviewed attorney fees and related matters. Telephone conference with Justice Gilbert, analyzed next steps regarding mediation.	1.00	\$54.00
1/22/2018	AEK	Review opinion from court of appeals.; communications regarding same; review prior fee application.	1.30	\$286.00

Remand Fees

1/22/2018	TPK	Analyze court of appeals decision.	0.50	\$282.50
1/23/2018	TPK	Conference regarding mediation regarding Gilbert.	0.40	\$226.00
1/23/2018	JK	Review opinion. Telephone conference with T. Kane regarding same.	0.40	\$290.00
1/24/2018	TPK	Call Cassioppi and address mediation regarding fees.	0.70	\$395.50
1/25/2018	AEK	Communications regarding fee documentation submitted to state court; review order.	1.00	\$220.00
1/26/2018	SHS	Reviewed objection issues; reviewed issues re: mediation; telephone conference with mediator; review related issues; office conference with T. Kane.	4.80	\$2,592.00
1/26/2018	TPK	Emails regarding mediation.	0.20	\$113.00
1/29/2018	JK	Telephone conference with T. Kane.	0.20	\$145.00
1/29/2018	AEK	Update firm docket; review issued order on response to fee appeal and filings; review previously requested fees.	1.40	\$308.00
1/30/2018	TPK	Address mediation preparation with J. Gilbert.	0.90	\$508.50
2/1/2018	AEK	Work on fee application and review of invoices and expenses.	1.50	\$330.00
2/9/2018	SHS	Review mediator agreement.	0.90	\$486.00
2/13/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding ongoing mediation of numerous issues. Analyze issues regarding scope of mediation.	3.20	\$1,728.00
2/14/2018	SHS	Review mediation issues. Email regarding the same.	0.90	\$486.00
2/16/2018	TPK	Address fee issues by preparing material for mediator.	0.90	\$508.50
2/16/2018	AEK	Review e-mail regarding taxation and costs; review rules.	0.50	\$110.00

Remand Fees

2/19/2018	SHS	Review ongoing issues. Meeting with Joe Cassioppi and Mark Greiner. Review going forward plans. Prepare for mediation. Review confidentiality.	2.80	\$1,512.00
2/20/2018	AEK	Review documents for second fee application.	1.20	\$264.00
2/20/2018	AEK	Prepare documents and information for mediation.	0.80	\$176.00
2/20/2018	TPK	Preparation and attend mediation and address fee dispute issue.	2.50	\$1,412.50
2/20/2018	SHS	Travel to and attend mediation. Review resolved issues.	4.40	\$2,376.00
2/21/2018	AEK	Communications regarding submissions for appealed fees; review issues regarding fees.	0.80	\$176.00
2/21/2018	AEK	Work on second fee application; review exhibits.	0.90	\$198.00
2/22/2018	AEK	Update hyper linked pleadings index; review court docket; work on second fee application.	2.00	\$440.00
2/23/2018	AEK	Review invoices for fee application.	0.40	\$88.00
2/26/2018	TPK	Draft mediation statement.	2.10	\$1,186.50
2/26/2018	TPK	Draft mediation statement.	0.40	\$226.00
2/26/2018	AFM	Strategy call with T. Kane and A. Kulbeik regarding fee motion and fee mediation statement. Draft outline for fee mediation statement.	0.70	\$259.00
2/26/2018	TPK	Draft memorandum regarding call with Brunjen regarding mediation statement.	0.40	\$226.00
2/26/2018	TPK	Draft mediation statement.	1.50	\$847.50
2/26/2018	TPK	Fee issue.	1.50	\$847.50
2/26/2018	TPK	Prepare affidavit of new time.	1.50	\$847.50

Remand Fees

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
2/26/2018	AEK	Conference with T. Kane and A. Mistry regarding mediation statement: revise second fee application and supporting documents and addendums; update firm docket with new memoranda deadline for fee appeal.	2.10	\$462.00
2/27/2018	AEK	Work on fee exhibits for mediation; conferences regarding same.	3.10	\$682.00
2/28/2018	AEK	Work on exhibits for fees and mediation.	2.60	\$572.00
3/1/2018	AFM	Strategy call with T. Kane and A. Kulbeik regarding fee motion and fee mediation statement. Draft outline for fee mediation statement.	0.50	\$185.00
3/1/2018	AEK	Meeting with T. Kane and A. Mistry regarding mediation and fees; work on spreadsheets of fees.	1.30	\$286.00
3/2/2018	AFM	Draft memorandum in support of request for attorneys' fees from February 2017 to December 2017. Correspond with A. Kulbeik and M. Jones regarding same.	3.70	\$1,369.00
3/2/2018	AEK	Work on fee exhibits for mediation.	2.30	\$506.00
3/5/2018	AEK	Docket hearing; exchange emails regarding same; work on time entry exhibits for mediation.	0.50	\$110.00
3/6/2018	AEK	Work on exhibits for fee mediation; communications regarding same.	2.30	\$506.00
3/7/2018	AEK	Work on exhibits for mediation and fees.	2.50	\$550.00
3/13/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding remand attorneys fees.	1.50	\$810.00

Remand Fees

3/15/2018	AFM	Review and revise mediation statement regarding fees. Review and analyze Court of Appeals decision. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.	4.60	\$1,702.00
3/15/2018	AFM	Continue revisions of mediation statement for fees, incorporating edits and comments from T. Kane, F. Wheaton, and J. Bruntjen.	1.50	\$555.00
3/16/2018	AFM	Review and revise mediation statement, incorporating edits from T. Kane and F. Wheaton. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same. Identify documents to send to Judge Gilbert.	4.30	\$1,591.00
3/19/2018	TPK	Mediation.	7.50	\$4,237.50
3/20/2018	AEK	Communications and research regarding fees for mediation and spreadsheets of prior unapproved time.	1.60	\$352.00
3/21/2018	AEK	Communications regarding fees for mediation and spreadsheets; communications regarding invoices.	0.60	\$132.00
3/23/2018	AFM	Correspond with T. Kane regarding revised categories for fees. Compose list of new categories for fees.	1.30	\$481.00
3/23/2018	AEK	Work on categorizing time entries for mediation and fees; exchange emails regarding same.	2.20	\$484.00
3/27/2018	AFM	Review and revise fee spreadsheet. Correspond with A. Kulbeik regarding same.	0.80	\$296.00
3/27/2018	AEK	Work on categorizing time entries for fee submissions; communications with A. Mistry regarding same.	3.30	\$726.00

Remand Fees

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
3/28/2018	AEK	Docket hearing and brief deadlines on firm docket: review e-mail from T. Kane regarding same; continue working on categorizing time entries for fee submissions.	2.30	\$506.00
3/29/2018	AEK	Review of invoices and categories for mediation and fees.	2.20	\$484.00
4/4/2018	AEK	Review categories of time entries and non-categorized time.	1.40	\$308.00
4/9/2018	AEK	Review uncategorized time entries for fee submission.	0.80	\$176.00
4/10/2018	AEK	Update pleadings index; review and highlight uncategorized time entries; exchange e-mails with A. Mistry regarding same.	1.60	\$352.00
4/10/2018	TPK	Address fee issues.	0.20	\$113.00
4/12/2018	SHS	Meeting with Justice Gilbert and Client. Prepare for and attend the same.	4.50	\$2,430.00
4/12/2018	TPK	Prepare for hearing.	1.50	\$847.50
4/13/2018	AEK	Review uncategorized time entries for fee submissions.	0.80	\$176.00
4/13/2018	SHS	Travel to hearing. Telephone conference with client. Review issues regarding same.	3.10	\$1,674.00
4/13/2018	TPK	Conference with Justin Bruntjen regarding hearing.	0.90	\$508.50
4/17/2018	MJ	Discuss issues for hearing with T. Kane.	0.40	\$250.00
4/17/2018	TPK	Prepare for hearing regarding settlement.	0.40	\$226.00
4/18/2018	TPK	Calls to Gilbert.	0.20	\$113.00
4/19/2018	AEK	Review time entries for mediation; review spreadsheet.	1.60	\$352.00
4/20/2018	AEK	Work on time entries for fee submissions and categories.	2.10	\$462.00

Remand Fees

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
4/23/2018	AEK	Worn on fee petition spreadsheets of time entries and categories; communications with A. Mistry regarding same; conference with L. Dhanesri regarding Highq.	2.10	\$462.00
4/23/2018	AFM	Review and revise spreadsheet for 2017 time. Correspond with A. Kulbeik regarding same.	3.30	\$1,221.00
4/24/2018	AEK	Work on time entries for fees; review filed pleadings; exchange e-mails with A. Mistry regarding change of deadlines.	2.30	\$506.00
4/24/2018	TPK	Call Joseph Cassioppi regarding fee issues.	0.30	\$169.50
4/25/2018	AFM	Review and revise proposed language for stipulation. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.	0.70	\$259.00
4/25/2018	AEK	Meeting regarding fees; work on time entries and categorizing; exchange emails regarding order; exchange emails regarding same.	2.80	\$616.00
4/25/2018	TPK	Address remanded fee issue.	1.50	\$847.50
4/25/2018	TPK	Address continuance of fee issue.	0.50	\$282.50
4/25/2018	TPK	Address continuance of fee issue.	1.00	\$565.00
4/26/2018	AEK	Review e-mails on stipulation and order; work on time entries; conference with T. Kane regarding audio to view.	1.40	\$308.00
4/27/2018	AEK	Work on time entries for fee application.	1.00	\$220.00
4/27/2018	TPK	Prepare for fee hearing regarding remanded fees.	0.90	\$508.50
5/2/2018	AEK	Review and organize proformas for time entry for fee application.	1.40	\$308.00

Remand Fees

5/2/2018	SHS	Review rules on Special Master. Review issues regarding same.	3.10	\$1,674.00
5/2/2018	SHS	Review email from Joe Cassioppi. Review Issues regarding billing issues.	1.00	\$540.00
5/3/2018	AEK	Work on fee entries for fee application; review stipulation and order; exchange e-mails regarding same.	2.50	\$550.00
5/3/2018	TPK	Address fee issue.	0.40	\$226.00
5/4/2018	AEK	Work on time entries for fees; exchange e-mails regarding time entries.	2.20	\$484.00
5/4/2018	TPK	Conference Bruntjen regarding settlement of various outstanding claims.	0.40	\$226.00
5/8/2018	AEK	Work on time entry spreadsheets; communications regarding same.	2.60	\$572.00
5/9/2018	AEK	Work on time entries and spreadsheets; conference regarding appeal matters and indexes.	2.00	\$440.00
5/10/2018	AEK	Review and categorize time entries.	1.50	\$330.00
5/10/2018	SHS	PRN Mediation.	8.00	\$4,320.00
5/10/2018	SHS	Review motion for special master. Review law regarding the same.	2.30	\$1,242.00
5/10/2018	TPK	Mediation regarding fees.	0.50	\$282.50
5/11/2018	AEK	Review fees and time entry spreadsheets.	0.70	\$154.00
5/11/2018	TPK	Call Justin Bruntjen regarding motion to appoint special master for fees; draft motion.	1.90	\$1,073.50
5/14/2018	AEK	Communications and review of time entries for submissions.	0.60	\$132.00
5/15/2018	AEK	Work on fee entries and organization of fee submissions.	1.60	\$352.00
5/15/2018	TPK	Call J. Gilbert regarding mediation issues.	0.40	\$226.00

Remand Fees

Date	Case No.	Description	Hours	Amount
5/16/2018	AFM	Draft notice of motion, motion, and memorandum of law regarding appointing Justice Gilbert as special master. Review Rule 53 and draft proposed order appointing special master. Draft affidavit of T. Kane regarding meet and confer. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.	3.20	\$1,184.00
5/16/2018	AEK	Review e-mails and communications regarding fees.	0.70	\$154.00
5/16/2018	SHS	Review and Revise motion to appoint special master.	3.00	\$1,620.00
5/16/2018	TPK	Redraft brief and pleading regarding appointing Gilbert as special master.	0.90	\$508.50
5/17/2018	AEK	Revise fee spreadsheets for non approved time, 2017 time and 2018 time; communications regarding same: review, serve and electronically file motion to appoint special master and accompanying documents; update firm docket; update court docket ECF notifications; exchange numerous communications and emails regarding docketing and fees.	2.60	\$572.00
5/17/2018	AFM	Review and revise motion to appoint Justice Gilbert as special master. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.	0.30	\$111.00
5/17/2018	TPK	Redraft pleadings regarding appointing J. Gilbert as special administrator.	0.90	\$508.50
5/21/2018	TPK	Address special master issue.	0.50	\$282.50
5/23/2018	TPK	Address Special master issue.	0.90	\$508.50
5/23/2018	TPK	Address special master issue.	0.40	\$226.00
5/24/2018	TPK	Address special master claim.	0.40	\$226.00
5/30/2018	AEK	Work on fee issues; communications regarding same.	0.70	\$154.00

Remand Fees

5/30/2018	TPK	Draft billing material for petition for fees.	0.50	\$282.50
6/1/2018	AFM	Draft letter to Judge Eide regarding motion to appoint special master. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.	0.50	\$185.00
6/1/2018	TPK	Address fee application issues.	0.90	\$508.50
6/1/2018	TPK	Draft letter of Judge Eide regarding special master.	1.20	\$678.00
6/4/2018	TPK	Letter to Judge Eide regarding fee mediation and emails to Hutton regarding same.	1.20	\$678.00
6/4/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding motion for Special Master. Analyze issues. Review and revise letter regarding the same. Review email from the court.	1.30	\$702.00
6/5/2018	AEK	Telephone conference with T. Kane regarding proposed order in Word for Special Master; communications with the Court regarding same; prepare email to Y. Shirk with order in Word format.	0.40	\$88.00
TOTAL			206.80	\$82,270.50

Heirship

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
5/16/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding heirship determination. Analyze issues regarding same.	2.00	\$1,080.00
5/29/2018	SHS	Review heirship request.	1.00	\$540.00
TOTAL			3.00	\$1,620.00

Special Administrator

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
1/4/2018	SHS	Review status of discharge.	0.50	\$270.00
1/10/2018	AEK	Communications regarding discharge motion; research regarding same.	0.70	\$154.00
1/10/2018	AFM	Strategy call with T. Kane regarding fee application and response to motion for discharge.	0.10	\$37.00
1/11/2018	AEK	Review filed documents and communications regarding motion.	0.80	\$176.00
1/18/2018	SHS	Reviewed issues regarding discharge; reviewed issues regarding same; telephone conference with client.	3.30	\$1,782.00
1/19/2018	SHS	Reviewed discharge issues.	1.00	\$540.00
1/22/2018	SHS	Reviewed status of objections; reviewed issues; regarding February 13 hearing; reviewed potential grounds for objections; analyzed issues re: same.	4.40	\$2,376.00
1/29/2018	TPK	Address motion by Bremer for discharge.	0.20	\$113.00
1/30/2018	SHS	Reviewed motion; telephone conference with J. Cassioppi; office conference with T. Kane; analyzed issues regarding same.	4.30	\$2,322.00
1/30/2018	AFM	Review and analyze Bremer's motion to lift stay of discharge and approve attorneys' fees. Review and analyze affidavit in support of same, including fee invoices. Draft memorandum in opposition to Bremer's motion. correspond with T Kane regarding same.	4.30	\$1,591.00
1/31/2018	AFM	Review and revise memorandum in opposition to Bremer's motion to lift stay of discharge and approve attorneys' fees. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same. Review fee invoice and identify entries for reference in memorandum.	6.70	\$2,479.00
2/1/2018	AFM	Review and revise memo in opposition to Bremer's motion to lift stay of discharge and approve payment of attorneys' fees. Review prior court orders regarding Bremer's attorney's fees. Incorporate information regarding same in brief. Correspond with T. Kane regarding same.	2.40	\$888.00
2/1/2018	TPK	Draft brief.	1.40	\$791.00

Special Administrator

2/2/2018	AEK	Review file materials regarding order for fees; exchange emails regarding same.	0.70	\$154.00
2/2/2018	AFM	Draft affidavit of T. Kane in support of memorandum in opposition to Bremer's motion to lift stay of discharge and approve request for attorneys' fees. Correspond with T. Kane and A. Kulbeik regarding same. Review court's order regarding expanded authority of Second Special Administrator. Review and revise memorandum in opposition to Bremer's motion to lift stay of discharge and approve request for attorneys' fees, incorporating information from court order.	2.40	\$888.00
2/2/2018	TPK	Attend hearing.	0.40	\$226.00
2/2/2018	TPK	Call Cassioppi regarding status and redraft brief.	2.20	\$1,243.00
2/2/2018	SHS	Review brief. Emails to Lee Hutton. Review common intent.	2.80	\$1,512.00
2/5/2018	TPK	Address regarding discharge and fee issues.	0.90	\$508.50
2/6/2018	AEK	Docket hearing on motion to lift the stay of discharge of Bremer; prepare exhibit to T. Kane SA Affidavit; prepare e-mail regarding same.	0.70	\$154.00
4/18/2018	TPK	Address motion to lift Bremer discharge.	0.30	\$169.50
TOTAL			40.50	\$18,374.00

Personal Representative

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
4/12/2018	AEK	Review file materials regarding Comerica materials; exchange emails regarding same.	1.00	\$220.00
4/18/2018	MJ	Attend and participate in hearing on attorneys' fees, new entertainment contracts; meet with O. and V. Baker in advance of hearing; discuss issues, arguments with O. Baker; meet with T. Kane to debrief hearing; review comparison of entertainment deals; review notice of appearance, other filings. **Split time with Entertainment category**	3.00	\$1,875.00
6/18/2018	AP	Research Minnesota probate code and case law to determine [REDACTED]	2.10	\$409.50
6/18/2018	AP	Confer with J. Kolodny regarding results of research to determine whether a [REDACTED]	0.40	\$78.00
6/18/2018	AP	Draft email memorandum to J. Kolodny re: [REDACTED]	1.20	\$234.00
TOTAL			7.70	\$2,816.50

Second Special Administrator

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
1/4/2018	SHS	Reviewed issues regarding Second Special Administrator.	1.10	\$594.00
1/31/2018	AEK	Communications regarding JOBU lawsuit; review file materials regarding same.	1.00	\$220.00
2/5/2018	SHS	Review and revise Jobu Memo. Review documents. Analyze complaint. Analyze issues regarding the same. Review issues regarding the claims against Bremer. Review and analyze the time line.	6.50	\$3,510.00
2/6/2018	AFM	Draft memorandum to Gleekel regarding Jobu Presents.	2.70	\$999.00
2/6/2018	TPK	Call Bruntjen regarding status regarding claim against Jobu for report to Gleekel.	0.60	\$339.00
2/6/2018	SHS	Continue review and revision of Jobu memo.	4.10	\$2,214.00
2/7/2018	AEK	Review e-mail regarding hearing and docketing; work on compiling documents for Jobu summary; communications with A. Mistry regarding same.	2.00	\$440.00
2/7/2018	AFM	Draft memorandum to Gleekel regarding Jobu Presents. Correspond with S. Silton and A. Kulbeik regarding same.	3.40	\$1,258.00
2/7/2018	SHS	Continue revision of JOBU memo. Analyze issues regarding timeline. Review pleadings relating to the Jobu litigation. Review issues regarding disclosure. Analyze the law regarding the notice and disclosure.	6.90	\$3,726.00

Second Special Administrator

2/8/2018	AFM	Review and revise memorandum to Gleekel regarding Jobu Presents, incorporating edits received from S. Silton. Correspond with S. Silton regarding same. Compile attachments to memorandum.	3.40	\$1,258.00
2/9/2018	AEK	Docket hearing; exchange emails regarding same; docket discharge motion deadlines; compile attachments to Memo to Gleekel regarding Jobu Presents; review e-mails regarding same.	2.40	\$528.00
2/9/2018	AFM	Correspond with S. Silton regarding memorandum to Gleekel regarding Jobu Presents. Review and revise memorandum, incorporating edits from S. Silton.	2.80	\$1,036.00
2/9/2018	TPK	Draft memo regarding status of claim involving Jobu.	0.90	\$508.50
2/9/2018	SHS	Finalize Jobu memo. Analyze issues regarding the same. Review issues regarding the timeline. Review prior emails and documents. Perform a search for the same.	3.20	\$1,728.00
2/11/2018	AFM	Review and revise memorandum to Gleekel regarding Jobu Presents, incorporating edits from S. Silton.	4.10	\$1,517.00
2/12/2018	AEK	Finalize letter; exchange communications with Silton regarding same; update court service list; SSA exchange emails regarding same; work on Gleekel memo and documents; exchange emails regarding same.	1.30	\$286.00

Second Special Administrator

2/12/2018	AFM	Review and revise memorandum regarding Jobu Presents. Correspond with S. Silton regarding same.	0.60	\$222.00
2/12/2018	TPK	Review and redraft Jobu issue involving letter to Gleekel.	0.90	\$508.50
2/13/2018	AEK	Exchange e-mails regarding Bremer Complaint; forward on copy of same; work on Gleekel memo; compile attachments to Gleekel memo; communications regarding complaint; forward on same.	3.30	\$726.00
2/13/2018	AFM	Review and revise Jobu Presents memorandum. Correspond with S. Silton and A Kulbeik regarding same.	3.20	\$1,184.00
2/14/2018	AEK	Finalize attachments to Gleekel memo; forward all to parties.	1.60	\$352.00
2/14/2018	TPK	Address Jobu issues for Gleekel letter.	0.90	\$508.50
2/15/2018	AEK	Re-do documents for Gleekel Memo; prepare documents for parties via pdf format: communications with parties regarding same.	2.00	\$440.00
2/16/2018	AEK	Communications regarding Gleekel documents; docket review hearing on firm docket.	1.10	\$242.00
2/23/2018	AEK	Exchange emails regarding Gleekel filed memo.	0.40	\$88.00
2/27/2018	JK	Attn to email and telephone conference with T. Kane re: Gleekel.	0.50	\$362.50
2/27/2018	TPK	Call Gleekel regarding information involving Bremer and Stinson letter regarding second special administrator role and claims.	0.80	\$452.00
2/27/2018	TPK	Draft memo regarding call to Gleekel.	2.10	\$1,186.50

Second Special Administrator

2/27/2018	TPK	Call Joe Cassioppi regarding Bremer and Stinson letter regarding second special administrator claim.	0.80	\$452.00
2/28/2018	JK	Review letter from Gleekel to Eide. Email to T. Kane re: same.	0.20	\$145.00
3/26/2018	TPK	Emails regarding conference with Cassioppi regarding commencement of action by Gleekel.	0.40	\$226.00
4/17/2018	TPK	Call Gleekel regarding Dunn memo which support claims involving Bremer and Stinson.	0.60	\$339.00
4/18/2018	TPK	Address issues regarding Bremer claiming discharge and review Gleekel report regarding same.	0.50	\$282.50
4/23/2018	TPK	Address claims against Bremer and Stinson.	0.90	\$508.50
5/1/2018	SHS	Review status of Gleekel Report. Telephone Conference with Peter Gleekel.	2.00	\$1,080.00
5/14/2018	SHS	Review JOBU Presents report by Peter Gleekel. Analyze issues regarding claims. Potential liability of all parties.	2.00	\$1,080.00
5/14/2018	TPK	Address issues regarding report of second special administrator.	0.90	\$508.50
5/15/2018	JK	Review report of Second Special Administrator and tconf w/T. Kane re: same.	0.40	\$290.00
5/15/2018	TPK	Review second report from Special administrator.	0.90	\$508.50
6/8/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding Gleekel report Review claims. Analyzed issues regarding next steps.	3.50	\$1,890.00
TOTAL			76.90	\$33,743.50

Entertainment

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
1/5/2018	SHS	Telephone conference with client J. Herbsman; review issues regarding damage to estate from broken deal; review issues regarding same; analyze issues regarding next steps.	4.40	\$2,376.00
2/15/2018	SHS	Review Comerica's Filings. Telephone conference with Michael Lythcott. Review ongoing status of the entertainment deals.	2.80	\$1,512.00
2/16/2018	TPK	Hearing regarding entertainment deal.	0.90	\$508.50
2/16/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding ongoing entertainment deals. Review issues regarding [REDACTED]. Telephone conference with Omarr J. Baker. Review issues regarding the same.	4.90	\$2,646.00
2/17/2018	SHS	Meeting with Ted Johnson and Troy Carter. Review issues regarding [REDACTED]. Review other issues relating to estate administration.	3.30	\$1,782.00
2/19/2018	SHS	Ongoing entertainment deals.	2.80	\$1,512.00
3/6/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Review Impact on new deals. Review issues regarding next steps on entertainment deals.	3.10	\$1,674.00
3/8/2018	SHS	Review real Estate issues. Telephone conference with Michael Lythcott.	2.50	\$1,350.00
3/9/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding ongoing deals. Analyze issues regarding the same.	1.30	\$702.00
3/23/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding ongoing deals. Analyze issues regarding the same. Telephone conference with Justin Bruntjen	2.30	\$1,242.00
3/30/2018	SHS	Telephone conference with Michael Lythcott regarding the [REDACTED]. Telephone conference with Justin Bruntjen. Review [REDACTED]. Email to Comerica counsel.	4.90	\$2,646.00
4/3/2018	SHS	Review status of multiple filings. Review deal status. Analyze issues regarding the same.	2.40	\$1,296.00
4/5/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED] issues. Analyze creative control issues. Analyze issues regarding same. Breakfast t with Mark Greiner and Joe Cassioppi. Analyze " issues regarding ongoing deals.	3.10	\$1,674.00

Entertainment

4/11/2018	SHS	Review filings regarding [REDACTED]. Analyze issues regarding ongoing deals. Review issues regarding same.	3.50	\$1,890.00
4/17/2018	AEK	Review file materials regarding brief in opposition to [REDACTED]; exchange emails regarding same; review e court docket; review status of fees and categorized time entries.	2.30	\$506.00
4/17/2018	MJ	Discuss issues for hearing with T. Kane	0.30	\$187.50
4/18/2018	MJ	Attend and participate in hearing on attorneys' fees, new entertainment contracts; meet with O. and V. Baker in advance of hearing; discuss issues, arguments with O. Baker; meet with T. Kane to debrief hearing; review comparison of entertainment deals; review notice of appearance, other filings. **Split time with Personal Representative category**	3.00	\$1,875.00
4/18/2018	SHS	Telephone conference with client. Review issues regarding same. Review next steps and relating matters. Multiple emails regarding the [REDACTED]. Reviewability to properly review that deal. Analyze issues regarding the next steps.	3.10	\$1,674.00
4/18/2018	TPK	Address [REDACTED] approval issue with client	0.60	\$339.00
4/20/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED] deal. Analyze issues regarding creative control. Call with counsel for Heirs.	4.10	\$2,214.00
4/21/2018	SHS	Calls with Michael Lythcott regarding print rights. Email regarding the same. Review [REDACTED]. Telephone Conference regarding the same.	4.10	\$2,214.00
4/24/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Review issues regarding improvement. Review advisors access to documents. Analyze issues regarding the same.	3.20	\$1,728.00
4/25/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Review [REDACTED]. Review issues regarding sourcing of deals.	4.20	\$2,268.00
4/26/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Analyze issues regarding same.	1.40	\$756.00

Entertainment

4/27/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding [REDACTED]. Telephone Conference with [REDACTED]. Review issues regarding the same (2.1) Telephone conference with Mark Greiner regarding financial issues related to the matters. (2.0)	4.10	\$2,214.00
4/29/2018	SHS	Telephone conference with the client. Telephone conference with Michael Lythcott regarding the [REDACTED].	2.10	\$1,134.00
4/30/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Analyze Gilbert Memo. Review response issues. Analyze issues regarding the same.	3.50	\$1,890.00
4/30/2018	TPK	Analyze affidavit regrading [REDACTED].	0.90	\$508.50
5/1/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Review Issues with Creative E Control. Analyzed Impact of Transition on Creative Control. Review issues of multiple credit. Multiple telephone conference with client and advisor regarding the same.	3.40	\$1,836.00
5/2/2018	SHS	Telephone conference with court regarding [REDACTED]. Review [REDACTED].	1.10	\$594.00
5/3/2018	SHS	Review brief. Review email to [REDACTED]. Review joint agreements. Potential to work together.	2.50	\$1,350.00
5/4/2018	SHS	Review filing of Sam Johnson regarding [REDACTED]. Review potential improvements to deal. (2.0) Review provision of financial information. Review need for additional financial information. Multiple telephone conference with counsel for Comerica. (2.5)	4.50	\$2,430.00
5/7/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Review numerous issues in the deal. Review creative control. Analyze IMBD page of Troy Carter. Prepare for Mediation. Draft Mediation statement. Analyze issues regarding issues with Comerica.	5.00	\$3,186.00
5/7/2018	TPK	Review pleading regarding [REDACTED] objection by SNJ.	0.50	\$282.50
5/9/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Review issues regarding the same. Provide to Comerica.	1.00	\$540.00
5/10/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED].	1.50	\$810.00

Entertainment

5/11/2018	JK	Tconf w/S. Silton re: cash flow analysis and related matters. Attn to email to Greiner.	0.40	\$290.00
5/11/2018	SHS	Review recoupment statements. (0.8) Review status of [REDACTED]. Analyze issues regarding Creative Control. Review timing of the issues regarding objection. (1.3)	2.10	\$1,134.00
5/14/2018	SHS	Review email regarding [REDACTED]. Review issues regard [REDACTED]. Analyze issues regarding same.	2.50	\$1,350.00
5/15/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED]. Analyze creative controls. Review changes. Fix the same. Review financing and blocking rights. (3.1) Review status of [REDACTED]. (1.1)	4.20	\$2,268.00
5/17/2018	SHS	Review email from Joe Cassioppi. Review Urgency of [REDACTED]. Review Exclusivity issues.	2.10	\$1,134.00
5/22/2018	SHS	Telephone Conference with Michael Lythcott. Review issues regarding upcoming hearing. Review issues regarding [REDACTED].	2.50	\$1,350.00
5/29/2018	AEK	Review e-mails and file materials regarding [REDACTED]; exchange emails regarding same.	0.70	\$154.00
6/4/2018	TPK	Draft letters regarding [REDACTED].	0.90	\$508.50
6/4/2018	SHS	Review status of [REDACTED]. Analyze issues regarding the same.	1.20	\$648.00
6/5/2018	SHS	Review status of [REDACTED]. Review email.	1.20	\$648.00
6/6/2018	TPK	Call Lythcott regarding communication with Comerica and address expert testimony regarding financial requests.	0.90	\$508.50
6/7/2018	SHS	Review issues regarding the [REDACTED]. Potential Modifications, Analyzed issues regarding the same. (1.8) Review status of unipix deal. Analyze issues regarding same. (1.2)	3.00	\$1,620.00
6/11/2018	SHS	Review [REDACTED] issues. Analyze issues regarding same. (2.0). Review [REDACTED] support. Review issues regarding same. (0.8)	2.80	\$1,512.00
TOTAL			123.10	\$66,472.00

McMillan-Koppleman

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Time	Fees
2/28/2018	TPK	Address and prepare information regarding McMillan and his role in the estate.	0.40	\$226.00
3/27/2018	TPK	Address and review Hearing regarding NDA issue regarding McMillan.	0.40	\$226.00
3/29/2018	SHS	Review tweets from LLM. Analyze impact regarding the same. Email to the Estate.	1.90	\$1,026.00
TOTAL			2.70	\$1,478.00

Costs

Date	Description	Amount
1/3/2018	Service Fees Vendor: Bachman Printing Companies - 17 copies of the Appellants Brief and Addendum and 17 copies of the Joint Appellants Confidential Addendum, in the matter of the estate of prince rogers nelson. Prepare cover, copy, collate, bind, serve and file. Inv# 58760 Date: 01/11/2018	\$1,421.12
2/7/2018	Travel Related Expenses Airfare 02/07/18, Steven Silton Travel to Los Angeles, Msp - Lax, Economy, Round Trip, 0062312389600, 02/16/2018 to 02/17/2018, Delta Air Lines Atlanta Us	\$974.60
3/1/2018	Westlaw Research Westlaw Research	\$80.00
TOTAL		\$2,475.72

Time Keeper	Hourly Rate
Jeffrey Kolodny (JK)	\$725.00
Mark Jacobson (MJ)	\$625.00
Thomas P. Kane (TPK)	\$565.00
Steven H. Sifton (SHS)	\$540.00
Armeen F. Mistry (AFM)	\$370.00
Amy Kulbeik (AEK)	\$220.00
Andrew Punzo (AP)	\$195.00