

STATE OF MINNESOTA
COUNTY OF CARVER

DISTRICT COURT
PROBATE DIVISION
FIRST JUDICIAL DISTRICT

In Re:

Court File No. 10-PR-16-46
Judge: Kevin W. Eide

Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson,
Decedent.

REDACTED (Filed Publicly)

EXHIBIT 2

**AFFIDAVIT OF BARRY A. O'NEIL
IN SUPPORT OF LOMMEN ABDO'S
APPLICATION FOR DETERMINATION
AND ESTABLISHMENT OF ATTORNEY'S LIEN
AND ENTRY OF JUDGMENT
(DECEMBER 21, 2018)**

LOMMEN ABDO

Invoice

Sharon L. Nelson
[REDACTED]

Responsible Atty: KJA
Matter Number: 43516
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson

Invoice Date: December 5, 2016
Invoice Number: 187523

Previous Statement Balance	\$	0.00
Payments and Credits Since Last Statement	\$	0.00

Current Billing Activity:

Legal Services Rendered	\$	141,077.50
Disbursements and Other Costs Incurred	\$	5,553.11
Total Current Billing	\$	146,630.61

Balance Due	\$	146,630.61
--------------------	-----------	-------------------

Payment due upon receipt. Please return this entire page with your payment.



Credit Card Authorization

Remit to: Lommen Abdo, P.A.
1000 International Centre
920 Second Avenue South
Minneapolis, MN 55402
(612) 339-8131
Tax ID: [REDACTED]

Credit Card No. _____

Expiration Date: ____/____/____

Sec. Code _____ Amount \$ _____

Card Holder Name: _____

Amount Enclosed: \$ _____

Card Holder Address: _____

Card Holder Signature: _____

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
 Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

Legal Services Rendered:

Date	Professional	Description	Hours	Amount
4/27/2016	KJA	DISCUSSIONS WITH NORRINE AND SHARON NELSON ON GOVERNING LAW AND FACTS REGARDING PRINCE ESTATE	1.30	520.00
4/27/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS (SHARON NELSON AND NORRINE NELSON) RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO STRATEGY IN PROBATE PROCEEDINGS, DETERMINATION OF HEIRS, CURRENT AND FUTURE PLANS TO PROTECT AND EXPAND PRINCE MUSIC ESTATE	1.30	390.00
4/29/2016	KJA	FOLLOW UP CALL WITH SHARON ON STATUS THAT THE VAULT WAS NOT DRILLED	2.20	880.00
4/29/2016	APG	DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF REPRESENTATION; COORDINATE FILING OF SAME WITH CARVER COUNTY COURT TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR MAY 2 HEARING	0.60	180.00
4/30/2016	KJA	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS AND ADAM GISLASON RE: VARIOUS MATTERS, INCLUDING MAY 2ND HEARING, APPROVAL OF SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND STRATEGY	3.00	1,200.00
5/1/2016	KJA	EMAILS FROM MATT SHEA REGARDING ALFRED JACKSON'S REPRESENTATIVES AND ISSUES WITH [REDACTED]; REVISE ENGAGEMENT AGREEMENT AND DUAL REPRESENTATION AGREEMENT; CONFER WITH LOMMEN ATTORNEY, KAREN SCHLOTTHAUER RE: PROTOCOLS AND PREPARATION FOR PROBATE HEARING	1.50	600.00
5/1/2016	APG	PREPARE FOR MAY 2 HEARING AND CONFERENCES WITH CLIENTS AND COUNSEL; EMAILS WITH COUNSEL AND SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: MAY 2 HEARING AND MEETING WITH COUNSEL	2.50	750.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

FOLLOWING THE HEARING				
5/2/2016	KJA	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CARVER COUNTY COURT HEARING RE: APPOINTMENT OF THE SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR; ATTEND POST-HEARING MEETINGS AND TAKE PHONE CALLS RE: SAME	9.00	3,600.00
5/2/2016	KAS	TELEPHONE CALL WITH ADAM GISLASON REGARDING HEARING	0.20	60.00
5/3/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS RE: OMARR BAKER ISSUES	0.30	90.00
5/5/2016	KJA	CALL WITH BRIAN DILLON RE: PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS; CALL WITH CLIENTS RE: PRESS RELEASE, TRIBUTE SHOWS AND OTHER ESTATE ISSUES	2.40	960.00
5/5/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS AND K. ABDO RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING RE: POWER OF ATTORNEY AND ENGAGEMENT OF JOHN NELSON, MUSIC MANAGEMENT ISSUES, ISSUES RELATING TO THE VAULT, AND PUBLICITY ISSUES.	0.60	180.00
5/5/2016	APG	RESEARCH AND ANALYZE PRINCE MUSIC ASSETS	1.80	540.00
5/5/2016	APG	CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR FRIDAY WEEKLY TELECONFERENCE WITH JUDGE EIDE AND MEETING WITH STINSON LAWYERS RE: MUSIC ASSETS AND STRATEGY	0.50	150.00
5/5/2016	APG	CREATE TIMELINE OF RELEVANT MILESTONES AND EVENTS RELATING TO PRINCE MUSIC; DRAFT AND REVISE RESEARCH MEMORANDUM SUMMARIZING MUSIC ASSETS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH STINSON LEONARD LAWYERS TO DISCUSS STRATEGY AND PLAN FOR SHORT TERM AND LONG TERM EXPLOITATION OF MUSIC ASSETS	1.50	450.00
5/6/2016	KJA	WEEKLY CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND LAWYERS; FOLLOW UP MEETING WITH LAWYERS; FOLLOW UP EMAILS TO HEIRS' LAWYERS ON COMMON ISSUES	1.20	480.00
5/6/2016	APG	PARTICIPATE IN WEEKLY TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT AND COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ESTATE ISSUES;	1.10	330.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

TELECONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL RE: SAME				
5/7/2016	KJA	RECEIVE REQUEST FROM SALLY FRIEDMAN FOR OMARR BAKER TO SPEAK WITH SISTERS; CALL TO SHARON NELSON RE: SAME; INFORM SALLY FRIEDMAN OF IMMINENT CALL TO OMARR FROM SISTERS; RECEIVE OVERTURE FROM PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS AND DIANA FRAPPIER TO DISCUSS PENDING MATTERS WITH HEIRS	2.00	800.00
5/7/2016	APG	EMAILS WITH PETITIONER COUNSEL AND K. ABDO TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR TELECONFERENCE WITH PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS AND DIANA FRAPPIER RE: VARIOUS ESTATE MATTERS	0.30	90.00
5/9/2016	KJA	REVIEW RECENT FILINGS OF CLAIMS BY CLAIMED HEIRS AND THEIR ATTORNEYS; CALL FROM KIRK JOHNSON; CALL WITH NORRINE RE: OMARR BAKER JOINING THEIR GROUP; DISCUSS ENTERTAINMENT ESTATE MANAGER CANDIDATES WITH BRIAN DILLON	1.00	400.00
5/9/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH S. NELSON RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO ESTATE MATTERS AND DETERMINATION OF HEIRS	0.50	150.00
5/10/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS AND DIANA FRAPPIER RE: WORKING ASSETS IN ESTATE; CALLS AND EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES CONCERNING THE SPECIAL ADMINISTRATION	2.50	1,000.00
5/10/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE NOTES AND EMAILS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR CALL WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS AND DIANA FRAPPIER RE: VARIOUS ESTATE MATTERS AND URGENT MUSIC MATTER ISSUES; DRAFT MEMORANDUM TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR TELECONFERENCE WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND PHAEDRA AND DIANA; CONFERENCE WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH K. ABDO, HEIR COUNSEL, PHAEDRA AND DIANA	1.90	570.00
5/10/2016	KAS	CONFERENCE WITH KEN ABDO REGARDING	0.20	60.00

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE STRATEGY				
5/11/2016	APG	PREPARE FOR CALL WITH K. JOHNSON AND K. ABDO RE: PROTECTION OF PAISLEY PARK AND PRINCE ASSETS; PARTICIPATE IN CALL RE: SAME	1.00	300.00
5/12/2016	KJA	CALL WITH SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON RE UPDATES ON ESTATE MATTERS INCLUDING SELECTION OF MANAGER AND ATTORNEY; ANSWER VARIOUS ESTATE RELATED QUESTIONS	0.50	200.00
5/13/2016	APG	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR WEEKLY TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE, SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND HEIR COUNSEL; PARTICIPATE IN WEEKLY TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND HEIR COUNSEL FOLLOWING TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT	2.50	750.00
5/15/2016	KJA	REVIEW RESPONSES FROM HEIRS' COUNSEL IN RESPONSE TO REQUEST FOR CONTRACTS FROM PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS	0.50	200.00
5/16/2016	KJA	HEIRS' COUNSEL CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING ENTRY OF THE VAULT; CALL WITH RAND LEVY RE: PRODUCTION OF FAMILY MEMORIAL; CALL WITH MATT LARSON RE: DISCUSSION WITH SLS ON TECHNICAL AND FACILITY HISTORY CONSULTING RE: THE VAULT AND PAISLEY PARK	1.00	400.00
5/16/2016	APG	EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO, J. JAMPOLE, STINSON LEONARD RE: PRINCE MUSIC ESTATE ISSUES, INCLUDING ACCESSING THE VAULT; PARTICIPATE ON TELECONFERENCE WITH STINSON LEONARD, ARCHIVIST/PRESERVATIONS, AND OTHERS RE: ACCESS TO THE VAULT	1.00	300.00
5/16/2016	APG	OBTAIN AND ANALYZE STATUTORY LAW AND CASE LAW RE: MN PARENTAGE ACT	0.90	270.00
5/17/2016	KJA	CORRESPONDENCES WITH PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS REGARDING FOLLOW UP TO PRIOR CONFERENCES ABOUT WHAT WAS DISCUSSED AT HEIRS' COUNSEL MEETING	0.20	80.00
5/17/2016	KJA	REVIEW PERTINENT ORDERS AND LAW ON THE	0.30	120.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

PARENTAGE ACT TO ESTABLISH PRESUMPTION OF CLIENT NELSON HEIR'S HERITAGE				
5/17/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CHANGES TO PROPOSED ORDER RE: CLAIMS PURSUANT TO PARENTAGE ACT; DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM TO K. ABDO RE: STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH PETITIONER COUNSEL RE: SAME	0.50	150.00
5/18/2016	KJA	REVIEW STOLTMANN'S OVERTURES TO PRESS; DISCUSS WITH OTHER HEIR LAWYERS AND THE CONTINUED UNDERSTANDING NOT TO COMMENT TO PRESS AND THE ISSUE OF [REDACTED] CHALLENGE FRANK WHEATON ON [REDACTED] REQUEST ALFRED JACKSON'S BIRTH CERTIFICATE	0.70	280.00
5/18/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS PLEADINGS FILED BY COUNSEL FOR CARLIN WILLIAMS AND BRIANNA NELSON	0.50	150.00
5/19/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH PRESUMPTIVE HEIR COUNSEL AND DISCUSS [REDACTED] AND PRESS DISCLOSURES; CHALLENGE FRANK WHEATON TO [REDACTED]; FOLLOW UP CALL FROM FRANK TO [REDACTED]	0.50	200.00
5/19/2016	APG	VARIOUS TELECONFERENCES WITH PETITIONER COUNSEL, COUNSEL FOR O. BAKER AND ALL COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO ESTATE MATTERS, INCLUDING THE CELEBRATION EVENT PROPOSAL	2.00	600.00
5/20/2016	KJA	WEEKLY CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND ATTORNEYS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH HEIRS' LAWYERS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH TYKA NELSON'S LAWYERS RE: FAMILY MEMORIAL	1.80	720.00
5/20/2016	KJA	REVIEW COURT FILINGS; STRATEGIZE WITH ADAM GISLASON RE: BLOOD TESTING AND HEIR DETERMINATION; DISCUSS VARIOUS PARENTAGE AND HEIR QUALIFICATIONS WITH ADAM GISLASON AND TYKA NELSON'S LAWYERS	2.00	800.00

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

5/20/2016	APG	RESEARCH AND STRATEGY TO OBTAIN BIRTH CERTIFICATES OF HEIRS AND EMAILS RE: SAME	1.00	300.00
5/20/2016	APG	EMAILS AND SUBSEQUENTLY CONFERENCES WITH COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES	0.90	270.00
5/24/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSALS FOR CELEBRATION EVENT AND TIMING FOR PRIVATE SERVICE; EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME	1.70	510.00
5/24/2016	APG	VARIOUS CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL, K. ABDO, AND CLIENTS RE: PROVING HEIRSHIP; EMAILS WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME	1.50	450.00
5/25/2016	KJA	REVIEW FILINGS AND EVIDENCE ON ESTABLISHING LINEAGE	0.50	200.00
5/25/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH K. ABDO RE: CASE STRATEGY UNDER THE PARENTAGE ACT, PROVING HEIRSHIP, AND DEALINGS WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR	1.00	300.00
5/25/2016	TEA	FURTHER INVESTIGATION INTO DETERMINING HEIRS	0.60	90.00
5/26/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PRESS AND MEDIA REQUESTS FOR CAMERAS IN THE COURTROOM FOR THE JUNE 27 HEARING; REVIEW COURT ORDER RE: SAME; REVIEW COURT RULE 4.03 TO PLAN AND PREPARE OBJECTION; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL TO PLAN JOINT OBJECTION	0.30	90.00
5/26/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS RE: VARIOUS DEVELOPMENTS INVOLVING HEIRS, CELEBRATION, AND SERVICE; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COURT FILINGS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT CALL AND CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL	2.10	630.00
5/26/2016	TEA	PREPARE LETTER TO HENNEPIN COUNTY VITAL STATISTICS; EMAIL RESPONSES TO PRESS	0.80	120.00
5/27/2016	KJA	WEEKLY CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT AND POST-COURT CALL WITH HEIRS' ATTORNEYS; DISCUSS ONGOING COURT UPDATES AND	1.50	600.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson

**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Code	Description	Hours	Amount
		STRATEGY TO ESTABLISHING HEIRS; RECEIVE AND RELAY REGISTER OF COPYRIGHTS INQUIRY ON SUBMITTING AS MONETIZATION EXPERT		
5/27/2016	APG	PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT CALL AND ALL COUNSEL TELECONFERENCE; PARTICIPATE IN SAME; EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS AND K. ABDO RE: UPDATE, STRATEGY AND AFFIDAVITS OF HEIRSHIP	3.30	990.00
5/28/2016	APG	EMAILS AND CONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS RE: EVENT AND PRIVATE SERVICE PLANNING AND OTHER DEVELOPMENTS RE: SAME	0.20	60.00
6/1/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR, COURT PROCEEDINGS, AND MEETING WITH OTHER PRESUMPTIVE HEIRS	1.50	450.00
6/2/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH HEIRS AND ATTORNEYS WITH MEDICAL EXAMINER RE: CAUSE OF DEATH; FOLLOW UP CALL WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SELECTION OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS; FOLLOW UP CALL WITH SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON	1.00	400.00
6/2/2016	APG	REVIEW MEDICAL EXAMINER'S REPORT; TELECONFERENCE WITH CLIENTS RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND MEDICAL EXAMINER AND CLIENTS (SHARON NELSON) RE: SAME; FOLLOW UP TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH K. ABDO AND CLIENTS RE: SAME	2.10	630.00
6/2/2016	APG	REVIEW MEMORANDUM RE: APPOINTMENT OF MUSIC EXPERTS; EMAILS AND COMMUNICATIONS WITH K. ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR, K. ABDO, COUNSEL RE: MUSIC EXPERTS	1.20	360.00
6/3/2016	KJA	BRIEFING AFTER COURT CALLS WITH ADAM GISLASON; CONFERENCE CALL WITH TYKA NELSON LAWYERS TO PREPARE FOR HEIRS ATTORNEY CONFERENCE CALL RE: MONETIZATION OF ASSETS	1.50	600.00

INVOICE DETAIL



LOMMEN ABDO

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Code	Description	Hours	Amount
6/3/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE MATERIALS AND COMMUNICATIONS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR FRIDAY COURT CALL AND COUNSEL CALL; PARTICIPATE IN COURT AND CONFERENCE CALLS; EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCE WITH HEIR COUNSEL FOLLOWING UP MUSIC EXPERTS. REVIEW AND ANALYZE OBJECTION TO MONETIZATION EXPERTS FILED BY C. WILLIAMS, AND PLAN AND PREPARE OPPOSITION/RESPONSE RE: SAME; REVIEW STINSON LETTER TO JUDGE EIDE RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS; REVIEW AFFIDAVIT AND PUBLIC NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT OF SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR; VARIOUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH CLIENTS AND K. ABDO RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS	2.80	840.00
6/3/2016	APG	PER COURT ORDER, TELECONFERENCE WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND ALL COUNSEL RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS; TELECONFERENCES WITH TYKA NELSON COUNSEL RE: STRATEGY RELATING TO RETENTION OF AND OBJECTION TO MONETIZATION EXPERTS	1.20	360.00
6/5/2016	APG	EMAILS WITH K. ABDO RE: STRATEGY FOR RESPONSE OR OPPOSITION TO C. WILLIAMS OBJECTION TO MONETIZATION EXPERTS	0.20	60.00
6/6/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ORDER APPROVING PROTOCOL AND ORDER FOR HEARING RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS TO PLAN AND PREPARE STRATEGY FOR RESPONDING OR OPPOSING MONETIZATION EXPERTS; EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME; MEETING WITH V. JONES RE: CURRENT STATUS OF PROBATE PROCEEDINGS AND RETENTION OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT AND COUNSEL RE: OBJECTION TO RETENTION OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS; DRAFT AND REVISE PROPOSED ORDER RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS; DRAFT EMAIL TO ALL COUNSEL RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCES WITH M. SHEA AND B. DILLON RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS; VARIOUS EMAILS WITH K. ABDO RE: REVISIONS TO PROPOSED ORDER; DRAFT EMAIL TO ALL COUNSEL RE: DRAFT PROPOSED ORDER AND ISSUES FOR	4.10	1,230.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
		HEARING ON RETENTION OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS		
6/6/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT AND COUNSEL RE: MONETIZATION EXPERTS	0.60	180.00
6/7/2016	KJA	PREPARATION AND APPEARANCE AT COURT HEARING FOR APPOINTMENT OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS	2.00	800.00
6/7/2016	APG	VARIOUS EMAILS TO S. NELSON PROVIDING DOCUMENTS AND INFORMATION RELEVANT TO ESTATE MATTERS; EMAILS WITH COURT AND COUNSEL RE: HEARING ON Q. WILLIAMS OBJECTION TO RETENTION OF MUSIC EXPERTS; EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO AND V. JONES RE: STRATEGY RELATING TO MUSIC EXPERTS AND HEARING ON SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S MOTION; DRAFT AND REVISE EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO ALL COUNSEL RE: PROPOSED REVISIONS TO PROPOSED ORDER; TELECONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO, M SHEA, AND V. JONES RE: SAME; FINALIZE CORRESPONDENCE TO ALL COUNSEL AND REVISED PROPOSED ORDER; TELECONFERENCE WITH SHARON AND NORRINE RE: ALL OF FOREGOING.	4.80	1,440.00
6/7/2016	APG	PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTION RE: RETENTION OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS; PARTICIPATE IN HEARING ON EXPERTS MOTION; TELECONFERENCE WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME	2.20	660.00
6/7/2016	JKH	OFFICE CONFERENCE REGARDING STATUS AND RESEARCH	2.60	390.00
6/8/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED ORDERS FILED BY SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR C. WILLIAMS RE: MUSIC EXPERTS; REVIEW REDLINE VERSION OF NELSONS PROPOSED ORDER RE: MUSIC EXPERTS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE COURT'S FINDINGS OF FACT AND ORDER RE: MUSIC EXPERTS; TELECONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH K, ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: MUSIC EXPERTS FINDINGS OF FACT AND ORDER	1.30	390.00
6/9/2016	KJA	MEET WITH SHARON NELSON, NORRINE NELSON	1.00	400.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
		AND CHARLES KOPPELMAN; REVIEW VARIOUS DEVELOPMENTS; REVIEW COURT AND OTHER DEVELOPMENTS WITH ADAM GISLASON IN PREPARATION FOR FILING OF AFFIDAVITS AND FRIDAY COURT CALL		
6/10/2016	APG	ATTEND FRIDAY TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT AND COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING SELECTION/RETENTION OF MONETIZATION EXPERTS	1.30	390.00
6/10/2016	APG	PARTICIPATE IN FRIDAY TELECONFERENCES WITH COURT AND COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING MUSIC EXPERTS, AFFIDAVITS OF HEIRSHIP, AND JUNE 27 HEARING	1.10	330.00
6/13/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE CELEBRATION EVENT PROPOSALS AND OTHER DOCUMENTS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR TELECONFERENCE WITH T. NELSON COUNSEL RE: EVENT AND PRIVATE SERVICE AND [REDACTED] EVENT; TELECONFERENCE WITH S. NELSON RE: VARIOUS ISSUES, INCLUDING MEETING OF FAMILY RE: PRIVATE SERVICE AND CELEBRATION EVENT PLANNING; TELECONFERENCE WITH V. JONES RE: MUSIC EXPERTS AND OTHER ISSUES RELATING TO PROBATE PROCEEDINGS	2.50	750.00
6/15/2016	KJA	REVIEW COURT ORDER REGARDING APPOINTMENT OF SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR; CONFERENCE CALL WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: PROTOCOLS ON ESTABLISHING HEIRS AND THE PARENTAGE ACT	1.00	400.00
6/16/2016	KJA	STRATEGY MEETING WITH ADAM GISLASON ON PREPARING FOR ADJUDICATION OF NELSONS AS HEIRS. CALL WITH SHARON NELSON RE: [REDACTED] FOLLOW UP CALL WITH SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON; EMAIL TO LAURA HALFERTY RE: REVEALING MAJOR DEALS	1.50	600.00
6/16/2016	APG	CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO AND CLIENTS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO HEIRSHIP AND MUSIC EXPERTS; DRAFT EMAIL COMMUNICATION	1.00	300.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
		TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: MUSIC EXPERTS AND TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR JUNE 17 COURT CALL		
6/17/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH COURT; CONFERENCE CALL WITH COUNSEL; CALL WITH VAN JONES TO REVIEW FAMILY COLLABORATION ISSUES; REVIEW POST HEIR STRATEGY; CALL WITH SHARON WITH UPDATE ON CALLS; DISCUSS [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CALL TO LAURA HALFERTY WITH REQUEST TO ALLOW PROPERTY INSPECTION AT PAISLEY [REDACTED]; REVIEW OF AFFIDAVITS AND SUPPORTING MATERIAL SENT BY STINSON RE: HEIRS AND DAVID CROSBY'S LETTERS OF DETERMINATION APPLICATIONS AND STINSON DETERMINATIONS	3.00	1,200.00
6/17/2016	APG	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS AND PLEADINGS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR FRIDAY COURT AND COUNSEL CALL; REVIEW SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S OBJECTION TO PHOTOGRAPHY, VIDEO RECORDING, AND AUDIO RECORDING OF PROCEEDING AND LEGAL CONSIDERATIONS REGARDING MINN. STAT. 257.7; REVIEW REQUEST TO CLOSE PROCEEDINGS & OBJECTION TO PHOTOGRAPHY OR VIDEO RECORDING OF PROCEEDINGS; REVIEW KARE 11 NEWS AMENDED NOTICE OF AUDIO VISUAL COVERAGE; REVIEW JOHNSTON - OBJECTION TO PHOTOGRAPHY, VIDEO, OR AUDIO RECORDINGS OF PROCEEDINGS.	3.10	930.00
6/17/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH S. NELSON AND K. ABDO RE: [REDACTED] AND VISIT TO PAISLEY PARK; EMAILS WITH L. HALFERTY RE: SAME; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH COURT AND ALL COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING OBJECTIONS TO PROTOCOL, THE PROCEDURE FOR THE JUNE 27 HEARING, UPDATE ON SEARCH FOR WILL AND MUSIC EXPERT RETENTION AND ENGAGEMENT	0.70	210.00
6/20/2016	KJA	REVIEW [REDACTED] PITCH WITH PRESUMPTIVE HEIRS LAWYERS; REVIEW AFFIDAVITS OF HEIRS WITH	2.00	800.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Code	Description	Hours	Amount
		ADAM GISLASON; CALL WITH SHARON NELSON WITH UPDATES ON HEIR PROCEEDINGS; REVIEW ARTICLE ON WILLIAMS TEST RESULTS WITH SHARON NELSON AND ADAM GISLASON		
6/20/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MATERIALS FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAIL TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME	0.30	90.00
6/21/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE LETTER FROM L. WALKER TO COURT RE: MOTION BY MEDIA COALITION TO UNSEAL RECORDS AND PERMIT CAMERAS IN COURTROOM; TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH S. NELSON RE: [REDACTED] FOR PRINCE; EMAILS WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME. TELECONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH COUNSEL FOR OMARR BAKER TO PLAN AND PREPARE COORDINATION OF FAMILY AND HEIR COUNSEL FOR UNIFIED HEIR GROUP	1.00	300.00
6/22/2016	KJA	REVIEW OF GENETIC TESTING FOR CARLIN; CALL TO SHARON NELSON; CALLS WITH PRESUMPTIVE HEIRS COUNSEL RE: REMINDING SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR OF LIMITED AUTHORITY OF CONSULTANTS AND POSSIBLE PREJUDICE TO THE ESTATE VALUE AND LONG TERM DEALS	1.50	600.00
6/23/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH F. WHEATON AND J. BRUNTJEN RE: MUSIC EXPERTS	0.80	240.00
6/24/2016	KJA	WEEKLY COURT CONFERENCE CALL AND FOLLOW UP CALL TO HEIRS	1.00	400.00
6/24/2016	APG	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS AND PLEADINGS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR FRIDAY COURT AND COUNSEL CALLS; ATTEND COURT AND COUNSEL CALLS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] LICENSE DEALS; REVIEW MEMORANDUM IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO INTERVENE FOR THE LIMITED PURPOSE OF ENSURING ACCESS TO COURT PROCEEDINGS AND RECORDS	2.60	780.00
6/29/2016	APG	CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO AND S. NELSON RE: MEETING WITH LONDELL MCMILLAN; REVIEW RECENT FILINGS; PREPARE FOR POST-HEARING	1.50	450.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

SUBMISSIONS

6/30/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE COURT ORDERS RE: UNSEALING CERTAIN RECORDS AND HEARING ON MEDIA MOTION TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR ADDITIONAL SUBMISSIONS	1.40	420.00
7/1/2016	KJA	CALL SHARON NELSON TO REVIEW ASSET INVENTORY REQUEST OF SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR	0.50	200.00
7/5/2016	APG	VARIOUS EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH HEIR COUNSEL, SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR, K. ABDO, AND MUSIC EXPERTS	1.10	330.00
7/9/2016	KJA	PREPARE FOR CONFERENCE CALL WITH ADAM GISLASON; CALL WITH SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON TO REVIEW UNSEALING COURT FILES	0.50	200.00
7/11/2016	KJA	DISCUSSION WITH ADAM GISLASON RE: CLIENT'S POSITION ON UNSEALING FILES; CALL TO HEIRS COUNSEL ON THE POSITION OF THE GROUP; REVIEW WEEKEND DISCUSSION WITH SHARON AND NORRINE	0.50	200.00
7/12/2016	KJA	REVIEW SUBMISSION TO PROTOCOL COURT HEARING SUPPORTING SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR	0.30	120.00
7/15/2016	KJA	WEEKLY COURT CALL; PREPARATION WITH ADAM GISLASON; COUNSEL CALL FOLLOWING COURT CALL; REVIEW OF JOINT PETITION IN SUPPORT OF SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RECOMMENDED PROTOCOLS	1.00	400.00
7/18/2016	APG	CONFERENCES WITH S. NELSON AND N. NELSON RE: PROBATE UPDATE AND STRATEGY MOVING FORWARD; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	1.80	540.00
7/20/2016	KJA	REVIEW MEDIA COALITION'S MOTION TO INTERVENE AND PROPOSED MODIFICATION OF PROTOCOL TO SEAL CERTAIN BUSINESS PROPOSALS; EMAILS TO HEIRS COUNSEL RECOMMENDING LAWYERS MEETING TO SET AGENDA OF PRIORITIES	1.00	400.00
7/21/2016	KJA	CALL FROM [REDACTED] WITH REQUESTS FOR [REDACTED]	1.00	400.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Initials	Description	Hours	Amount
		██████████ EVENT FROM FAMILY; DRAFT AGENDA FOR HEIRS COUNSEL MEETING.; CALL AND EMAIL WITH DOUG PETERSON ON PROTOCOL FOR BUSINESS TRANSACTIONS		
7/21/2016	APG	EMAILS WITH K. ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: HEIR COUNSEL MEETING AGENDA AND STRATEGY; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PROPOSED MODIFIED PROTOCOL FOR CONFIDENTIAL BUSINESS AGREEMENTS PREPARED BY SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR; REVISE PROPOSED MODIFIED ORDER; EMAILS WITH K. ABDO AND D. PETERSON RE: SAME	2.50	750.00
7/22/2016	KJA	COURT CALL WITH JUDGE EIDE AND FOLLOWED BY HEIR COUNSEL CALL	1.00	400.00
7/22/2016	APG	REVIEW FILE MATERIALS AND CALL WITH K. ABDO TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR FRIDAY COURT CALL AND COUNSEL CALL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; PARTICIPATE ON COURT AND COUNSEL CALLS; DRAFT AGENDA FOR HEIR COUNSEL MEETING; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	2.00	600.00
7/24/2016	KJA	DRAFT REVISED MEETING AGENDA	0.50	200.00
7/24/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE VARIOUS PLEADINGS AND VARIOUS DOCUMENTS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR JULY 25 HEIR COUNSEL MEETING	2.10	630.00
7/25/2016	KJA	PETITION HEIRS COUNSEL MEETING; EDIT PROTOCOL FOR BUSINESS DEALS PROPOSAL TO BE SUBMITTED TO THE COURT	2.00	800.00
7/25/2016	APG	PREPARE FOR HEIR COUNSEL MEETING TO DISCUSS VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO THE ESTATE MATTERS INCLUDING MODIFIED PROTOCOL, JOIN PETITION FOR DETERMINATION OF HEIRS, ENTERTAINMENT DEALS AND JOIN PRESS RELEASE	1.30	390.00
7/25/2016	APG	MEETING WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING MODIFIED PROTOCOL, PETITION TO DETERMINE HEIRS, FAMILY TRIBUTE AND MEMORIAL AND PLANS FOR PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE; FOLLOW UP EMAILS AND	2.60	780.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

CONFERENCES WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME; REVISE MODIFIED PROTOCOL				
7/27/2016	KJA	REVIEW AND REVISE HEIRS JOINT PETITION FOR BUSINESS PROTOCOL AMENDMENTS	1.00	400.00
7/27/2016	APG	DRAFT AND REVISE TALKING POINTS TO PREPARE FOR HEARING; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLEADINGS TO PREPARE FOR HEARING RE: PRESS/PUBLIC RIGHT TO INFORMATION AND MODIFIED PROTOCOL FOR CONFIDENTIAL BUSINESS DEALS	3.80	1,140.00
7/28/2016	KJA	PREPARATION AND APPEARANCE AT CARVER COUNTY COURT TO ARGUE MOTION ON PRESS FILE INSPECTION RIGHTS AND BUSINESS PROTOCOL MODIFICATION	3.00	1,200.00
7/28/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLEADINGS AND DRAFT TALKING POINTS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MEDIA COALITIONS MOTION TO INTERVENE; CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH K. ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME; ATTEND HEARING ON MEDIA COALITION'S MOTION TO INTERVENE; TELECONFERENCE WITH S. NELSON RE: HEARING AND STRATEGY GOING FORWARD; CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH K. ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL FOLLOWING HEARING	4.40	1,320.00
7/29/2016	KJA	REVIEW AND DISCUSS COURT ORDER WITH PETITION HEIRS AND CLIENTS	1.00	400.00
7/29/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH K. ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: ORDER ON PROTOCOL OBJECTIONS; REVIEW AND ANALYZE ORDER	1.00	300.00
7/30/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE JULY 29 ORDER RE: OBJECTIONS TO PROTOCOL TO PLAN AND PREPARE LITIGATION STRATEGY AND MEETING WITH HEIR COUNSEL; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND K. ABDO RE: SAME	1.10	330.00
7/31/2016	APG	EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCE WITH K. ABDO TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEIR COUNSEL MEETING; DRAFT AGENDA FOR HEIR COUNSEL MEETING; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	1.30	390.00

INVOICE DETAIL



LOMMEN ABDO

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

8/1/2016	KJA	PREPARE AGENDA AND CONFERENCE CALL WITH HEIRS' COUNSEL. REVIEW CONTRACTS AND OTHER INFORMATION REQUIRED OF STINSON	0.60	240.00
8/1/2016	APG	DRAFT MEETING MINUTES FROM 7/26 MEETING WITH STINSON LEONARD; EMAILS WITH HEIRS' COUNSEL RE: MEETING; ATTENDING MEETING WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES; FOLLOW UP EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH HEIRS' COUNSEL AND K. ABDO; REVIEW EMAILS FROM L. HALFERTY RE: PAISLEY PARK INVITATION/MEETING AND FUTURE COMMUNICATIONS WITH OUTLIERS; TELECONFERENCE WITH SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO JULY 29 ORDER, HEIR COUNSEL MEETING AND STRATEGY	4.30	1,290.00
8/1/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE MATERIALS AND FINALIZE DRAFT OF NOTES FROM JULY 27 MEETING WITH SLS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR MEETING WITH HEIR COUNSEL; EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH TYKA NELSON'S COUNSEL TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEIR COUNSEL MEETING; ATTEND MEETING WITH HEIR COUNSEL TO ADDRESS A VARIETY OF ISSUES INCLUDING BRIANNA NELSON AND ██████████ NELSON; SLS FEE PETITION, TRIBUTE EVENT, HEIR PETITION AND REAL ESTATE DEALS/VISITS; VARIOUS EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCES WITH HEIR COUNSEL FOLLOWING UP ON HEIR COUNSEL MEETING	4.50	1,350.00
8/2/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH LAURA HALFERTY AT SLS AND ADAM GISLASON FOLLOWING UP ON ISSUES THAT CLIENTS AND HEIR'S COUNSEL WANTED UPDATES ON FROM THE SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR	0.50	200.00
8/2/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE NOTES FROM JULY 27 SLS MEETING AND 8/1 MEETING WITH HEIR COUNSEL TO PREPARE FOR TELECONFERENCE WITH L. HALFERTY RE: OUTSTANDING ISSUES INCLUDING SLS/SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR FEES AND HEIRS	3.80	1,140.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

		DETERMINATION; PARTICIPATE IN TELECONFERENCE WITH L. HALFERTY AND K. ABDO RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE PLEADINGS TO PLAN AND PREPARE MEMORANDUM AND TRANSMISSION TO CLIENTS; TELECONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH CLIENTS AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: PRIVATE MEMORIAL PLANNING		
8/3/2016	KJA	EMAIL HEIR'S COUNSEL AND SLS COUNSEL ON NEED TO REVIEW DEALS	1.50	600.00
8/3/2016	APG	REVIEW LETTER FROM SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND DENIAL OF ANTHONY STEMAN CLAIM	0.10	30.00
8/4/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE REDACTED AFFIDAVITS OF C. ORDEAL AND L. HALFERTY RE: FEE PETITION TO PLAN AND PREPARE INQUIRY AND POTENTIAL OPPOSITION	0.40	120.00
8/5/2016	KJA	COURT CALL AND COUNSEL CALL AFTERWARD; CALLS WITH SHARON WITH UPDATES AND DISCUSS FAMILY SERVICE	1.00	400.00
8/5/2016	APG	PREPARE FOR PRINCE COURT CALL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO PROBATE PROCEEDINGS AND BUSINESS AGREEMENTS	1.80	540.00
8/5/2016	APG	REVIEW SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S MOTION TO DISMISS RODNEY DIXON CLAIM AND SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS	0.50	150.00
8/8/2016	APG	REVIEW [PROPOSED] INTERIM ORDER REGARDING ESTATE ADMINISTRATION FOLLOWING THE COURT'S JULY 28, 2016 ORDER; AFFIDAVIT OF OMARR BAKER RE: SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S MOTION RE: AUTHORIZATION TO LIST AND SELL REAL ESTATE; OMARR BAKER'S OBJECTION TO THE SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S MOTION RE: AUTHORIZATION TO LIST AND SELL REAL ESTATE; AND REQUEST TO EXTEND DEADLINE FOR OBJECTIONS ON SALE OF REAL ESTATE	1.00	300.00
8/12/2016	APG	PARTICIPATE ON COURT CALL AND COUNSEL CALL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING REAL	1.40	420.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

ESTATE ORDER, GENETIC TESTING STATUS, PAISLEY PARK AGREEMENT AND JOINT PETITION OF HEIRSHIP				
8/13/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE INTERIM ORDER RE: ESTATE ADMINISTRATION FOLLOWING THE COURT'S JULY 28, 2016 ORDER; PROPOSED ORDER REGARDING LISTING AND SALE OF REAL PROPERTY; CORRESPONDENCE FROM SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE REVISED ORDER RE LISTING AND SALE OF REAL PROPERTY	1.00	300.00
8/18/2016	KJA	CALLS AMONG HEIRS COUNSEL AND DRAFT AGENDA SUMMARIZING DISCUSSION ITEMS FOLLOWING MEETING WITH BREMER AT SLS OFFICE. DISTRIBUTE AGENDA FOR HEIRS COUNSEL CONFERENCE CALL	3.00	1,200.00
8/18/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE MATERIALS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEIR COUNSEL CALL TO DISCUSS VARIOUS SUBJECTS INCLUDING ADVISOR AGREEMENT AND LONG-TERM DEALS; CONFERENCE WITH ALL HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME; DRAFT AND REVISE FOLLOW UP EMAIL TO HEIR COUNSEL GROUP RE: OPEN ITEMS; EMAILS TO AND FROM ALL HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	2.10	630.00
8/19/2016	KJA	PREPARATION AND APPEARANCE ON HEIR'S COUNSEL MEETING; FOLLOW UP WITH DRAFT JOINT-LETTER TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND STINSON WITH REQUESTS; REVIEW AND REVISE PROPOSED CONSULTING AGREEMENT; REVIEW PRESS RELEASE; EDIT VERSION; SEND TO HEIRS COUNSEL WITH RECOMMENDATION FOR JOINT STATEMENT; SEND TO SHARON FOR REVIEW WITH COPY OF HEIRS COUNSEL MEETING AGENDA OF THAT DAY AND REPORT	3.50	1,400.00
8/19/2016	APG	PARTICIPATE IN HEIR COUNSEL TELECONFERENCE TO DISCUSS NUMEROUS OUTSTANDING ISSUES INCLUDING ACCESS TO DATA ROOM, FEES, LONG-TERM AGREEMENTS AND ENTERTAINMENT DEAL POINTS, AND LONDELL MCMILLAN/CHARLES KOPPELMAN ADVISOR	2.30	690.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		AGREEMENT, BRIANNA NELSON CLAIM, AND PAISLEY PARK APPOINTMENT OF PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE; DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: REQUEST FOR INFORMATION		
8/24/2016	KJA	COMPLETE EMAIL TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND SLS WITH MEETING REQUESTS AND FOLLOW UPS; CONFERENCE CALL WITH CLIENTS; REPLY TO SLS AND OTHER HEIR COUNSEL RESPONSES TO DEMAND LETTER TO SLS.	3.00	1,200.00
8/24/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH SHARON AND NORRINE RE: VARIOUS ISSUES INCLUDING PAISLEY PARK, [REDACTED], AND BRIANNA AND [REDACTED] NELSON ISSUES; FOLLOW UP EMAILS WITH CLIENTS AND SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR RE: SAME	1.60	480.00
8/25/2016	KJA	REVIEW EXPERT'S ENGAGEMENT AGREEMENT AND COMMENT; PREPARE FOR HEIRS COUNSEL MEETING ON EVALUATION OF BREMER AND STINSON	2.50	1,000.00
8/25/2016	PJB	REVIEW ADVISOR AGREEMENT BETWEEN SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR AND MCMILLAN/KOPPELMAN; PREPARE COMMENT MEMORANDUM TO K. ABDO	4.00	1,400.00
8/25/2016	APG	NUMEROUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: SEVERAL ISSUES, INCLUDING THE [REDACTED]	2.00	600.00
8/26/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE MATERIALS (PLEADINGS, EMAILS, CONTRACTS) TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT/CONFERENCE CALL; PARTICIPATE IN COURT/COUNSEL CONFERENCE CALL	2.50	750.00
8/29/2016	KJA	CALL WITH LAURA HALFERTY ON ISSUES AFFECTING ESTATE AND ENTERTAINMENT EXPERTS; DISCUSS WITH SHARON NELSON AND THEN HEIRS' COUNSEL ON STATUS OF OBJECTION TO [REDACTED]	1.50	600.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
 Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

8/30/2016	KJA	REVIEW TOM KANE DRAFT AND SLS RESPONSE ON REVIEW OF SLS LEGAL FEES	1.00	400.00
8/31/2016	KJA	CALL WITH SHARON NELSON RE: APPROVAL TO NOT EXTEND EXPERTS TERM AND ALLOW EXPERTS TO PARTICIPATE IN TRIBUTE	0.70	280.00
9/1/2016	APG	ADVISORS ISSUES: VARIOUS CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH HEIRS COUNSEL RE: NON-EXTENSION OF ADVISORS	1.30	390.00
9/2/2016	KJA	FOLLOW UP WITH SHARON NELSON, STINSON LAW FIRM AND BREMER BANK RE: [REDACTED] SHARON, NORRINE AND JOHN; [REDACTED] BY SHARON; PARTICIPATE IN WEEKLY COURT CALL	2.00	800.00
9/2/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE MATERIALS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT CALL; PARTICIPATE IN COURT CALL RE: PAISLEY PARK ORDER, BRIANNA NELSON DISCOVERY, AND SPECIAL ADMINISTRATORS PROBLEMS WITH HEIRS AND HEIRS COUNSEL; TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH HEIRS COUNSEL RE: SAME	2.60	780.00
9/3/2016	KJA	REVIEW AND SIGN STIPULATION AND PROTECTIVE ORDER RE: SLS FEES	0.20	80.00
9/5/2016	KJA	FOLLOW UP ON ARRANGING [REDACTED] FOR NORRINE, SHARON AND JOHN; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL ON [REDACTED]	1.00	400.00
9/6/2016	KJA	CALL WITH LIZ KRAMER AND REVIEW RULES AND GOALS FOR COURT MEDIATION ON FRIDAY; WORK WITH JILL RADLOFF TO SECURE [REDACTED] DISCUSS SIGNING WITH SHARON ALONG WITH OTHER ISSUES INCLUDING [REDACTED] [REDACTED] THE PRIMARY DEALS	1.70	680.00
9/6/2016	APG	REVISE [REDACTED] FOR SHARON NELSON AND NORRINE NELSON; ACCOMPANY CLIENTS TO BREMER BANK	0.50	150.00
9/7/2016	KJA	CALLS WITH PRESUMPTIVE HEIRS COUNSEL RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO ESTATE ASSETS AND	2.00	800.00

INVOICE DETAIL



LOMMEN ABDO

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

		OBJECTION TO [REDACTED]		
9/7/2016	APG	DRAFT AND REVISE [REDACTED] OBJECTIONS AND OUTSTANDING ISSUES; VARIOUS CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND K. ABDO RE: SAME; REVIEW AND ANALYZE BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF HEIRS' OBJECTIONS TO ADVISOR AGREEMENT	5.80	1,740.00
9/7/2016	APG	DRAFT AND REVISE MEDIATION LETTER TO JUDGE EIDE ON BEHALF OF ALL NON-EXCLUDED HEIRS	1.40	420.00
9/8/2016	KJA	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT OF LETTER TO THE COURT SETTING FORTH ISSUES TO BE MEDIATED FOR POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT; MULTIPLE PHONE CALLS, EMAILS AND ALL-COUNSEL FOR HEIRS CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING STRATEGY FOR THE MEDIATION AND FINAL LANGUAGE FOR THE LETTER-BRIEFING FOR JUDGE EIDE; CALL WITH SHARON TO REPORT PROGRESS; CALLS WITH STINSON LAWYERS TO INFORM OF LETTER TO JUDGE AND TO REVIEW AND REVISE AGENDA; REVIEW ALL RECOMMENDED MAJOR DEALS, LETTER TO COURT AND RELATED DOCUMENTS IN PREPARATION FOR PRESENTATION TO THE COURT	5.00	2,000.00
9/8/2016	APG	DRAFT AND REVISE LETTER TO JUDGE EIDE TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR FRIDAY COURT CONFERENCE RE: ISSUES RELATING TO ADVISOR AGREEMENT, NON-EXTENSION OF THE EXPERTS, AND LONG-TERM DEALS; VARIOUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH L. KRAMER AND D. CROSBY RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH THE COURT RE: SAME; DRAFT OUTLINE TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT CONFERENCE	10.50	3,150.00
9/9/2016	KJA	APPEARANCE AT COURT MEDIATION IN CHASKA, MN	8.00	3,200.00
9/9/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE FILE MATERIALS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT CALL CONFERENCE; PARTICIPATE IN COURT MEDIATION RE: [REDACTED]	7.50	2,250.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		[REDACTED] VARIOUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH CLIENTS AND HEIRS COUNSEL RE: SAME		
9/10/2016	APG	CONTINUE EVALUATION OF LONG-TERMS DEALS TO PLAN AND PREPARE [REDACTED] FOR HEIRS GROUP; TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	2.50	750.00
9/11/2016	KJA	DRAFT HEIRS COUNSEL [REDACTED]	2.30	920.00
9/11/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE ENTERTAINMENT DEALS TO PLAN AND PREPARE [REDACTED] FOR HEIR COUNSEL REVIEW AND APPROVAL; DRAFT AND REVISE [REDACTED] CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME; EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH C. KOPPELMAN RE: SAME	5.30	1,590.00
9/12/2016	APG	VARIOUS CONFERENCES AND EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND K. ABDO RE: [REDACTED]; DRAFT [REDACTED]	6.80	2,040.00
9/13/2016	KJA	SUBMIT [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAIL TO HEIRS' COUNSEL FOLLOWING FRIDAY ALL-DAY MEDIATION WITH COURT; EXPLAIN [REDACTED] [REDACTED] FOLLOW UP WITH HEIRS' COUNSEL TO [REDACTED]	0.50	200.00
9/13/2016	KJA	CALL WITH PHAEDRA ELLIS-LAMKINS TO OBTAIN HISTORY BEHIND THE PRE-EXISTING DEALS	0.70	280.00
9/13/2016	APG	EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES RE: [REDACTED] AND OBJECTIONS TO ADVISOR AGREEMENT	3.50	1,050.00
9/16/2016	KJA	PREPARATION AND PARTICIPATION IN WEEKLY COUNSEL CONFERENCE CALL WITH THE COURT	2.50	1,000.00

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

9/16/2016	APG	EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH HEIRS AND COUNSEL RE: [REDACTED]	2.00	600.00
9/20/2016	KJA	HEIRS COUNSEL CALL ON BREMER/STINSON FEES AND MOTION; REVISE AND SEND [REDACTED] TO HEIR COUNSEL	2.50	1,000.00
9/20/2016	APG	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT BRIEF IN SUPPORT OF OPPOSITION TO BREMER/STINSON FEE MOTION AS [REDACTED] VARIOUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND CLIENTS (SHARON AND NORRINE AT UBS OFFICES) RE: SAME.	3.40	1,020.00
9/20/2016	KAS	REVIEW STATUTES; EMAILS TO AND FROM A. GISLASON RE: ESTATE TAXES AND STRATEGY	0.20	60.00
9/21/2016	KJA	REVIEW NOTICE OF MOTION AND MOTION TO APPROVE RECOMMENDED DEALS	1.00	400.00
9/21/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR COUNSEL (D. CROSBY) AND K. ABDO RE: [REDACTED]; EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH HEIRS COUNSEL RE: SAME	0.80	240.00
9/22/2016	KJA	CALL WITH [REDACTED]	0.50	200.00
9/23/2016	APG	COURT CALL; VARIOUS CALLS WITH HEIRS COUNSEL AND CLIENTS RE: COUNTER PROPOSALS AND OTHER ISSUES	8.50	2,550.00
9/25/2016	APG	VARIOUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO RE: [REDACTED] AND LITIGATION STRATEGY RELATING TO [REDACTED] AND [REDACTED] RESEARCH AND ANALYZE ISSUES RELATING TO DISCLOSURE OF [REDACTED] IN PROBATE COURT AND APPELLATE RIGHTS TO PLAN AND PREPARE STRATEGY EMAILS WITH TYKA NELSON COUNSEL RE: SAME	4.20	1,260.00
9/26/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TYKA NELSON'S NEW LEGAL TEAM TO REVIEW THE PENDING ISSUES AND STATUS OF [REDACTED] DISCUSSIONS;	6.00	2,400.00

INVOICE DETAIL



LOMMEN ABDO

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

		CONFERENCE CALL WITH NORRINE AND SHARON NELSON TO SECURE AUTHORITY TO [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CALL WITH ALL COUNSEL FOR HEIRS AND STINSON LAWYERS TO SECURE SUPPORT FOR THE [REDACTED]; FOLLOW UP CALL TO TYKA NELSON'S LAWYERS TO SECURE APPROVAL OF [REDACTED] FOLLOW UP CALL FROM KEN DAVID; FOLLOW UP EMAILS FROM TYKA NELSON'S LAWYERS AND SUMMARIZE [REDACTED]		
9/26/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH TYKA NELSON'S NEW LAWYERS RE: [REDACTED] CONTINUE [REDACTED] WITH HEIRS' COUNSEL AND CLIENTS RE: [REDACTED] TELECONFERENCES WITH F. WHEATON, D. CROSBY, K. DAVID, AND S. SILTON RE: SAME	5.30	1,590.00
9/26/2016	KAS	EMAILS TO AND FROM A. GISLASON REGARDING UPCOMING HEARING	0.10	30.00
9/27/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH HOLLAND & KNIGHT AND ALL COUNSEL LAWYERS RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED] CALLS TO EXPERTS WITH REQUESTS FOR SUPPORTING AFFIDAVITS; CALL WITH DAVID CROSBY AND LAURA HALFERTY RE: [REDACTED] CALL TO SHARON AND NORRINE TO REPORT DEVELOPMENTS; REVIEW BRIEF IN OPPOSITION TO THE ADVISOR AGREEMENT REVISED BY HOLLAND & KNIGHT; CALL WITH SHARON NELSON TO REVIEW BRIEF; CALL TO [REDACTED] WITH STATUS OF [REDACTED] REVISE SINGLE BRIEF FOR ALL HEIRS WITH ROBBIE BARTON; CALLS TO EXPERTS TO SUPPORT BRIEF WITH AFFIDAVITS	6.00	2,400.00
9/27/2016	APG	DRAFT MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF OBJECTION TO ADVISORS AGREEMENT; REVIEW AND ANALYZE CASE LAW RE: SAME	8.50	2,550.00
9/27/2016	TEA	RECEIVE AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS FILED WITH THE COURT AND DISCUSS SAME WITH KEN ABDO	1.00	150.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

AND ADAM GISLASON				
9/28/2016	KJA	PREPARE OPPOSITION BRIEF TO ADVISOR AGREEMENT INCLUDING SOURCING AFFIDAVIT FROM DAVID GIVEN; DRAFT KEN ABDO AFFIDAVIT; PREPARE BRIEF OF ARGUMENTS WITH ADAM GISLASON; CALL TO CLIENTS TO REPORT PROGRESS; MEET WITH HEIR COUNSEL TO PREPARE FOR ARGUMENTS; CALLS WITH [REDACTED]	8.00	3,200.00
9/28/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN SUPPORT OF MOTION TO APPROVE MAJOR DEALS; DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM OF LAW IN OPPOSITION TO SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR'S MOTION; COORDINATE DRAFTS OF AFFIDAVITS OF A. GISLASON, D. GIVENS, AND K. ABDO IN OPPOSITION TO MOTION; VARIOUS EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH HEIRS COUNSEL RE: SAME	12.50	3,750.00
9/28/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE MOTION PAPERS AND PLEADINGS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTIONS; MEETING WITH HOLLAND KNIGHT LAWYERS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON MOTIONS	3.70	1,110.00
9/28/2016	TCM	WORK ON MOTION DOCUMENTS	3.50	1,137.50
9/29/2016	KJA	PREPARATION AND APPEARANCE IN CARVER COUNTY COURT ON CROSS MOTIONS REGARDING ADVISOR AGREEMENTS AND DEALS	6.00	2,400.00
9/29/2016	APG	REVIEW PLEADINGS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING ON PARTIES' MOTIONS RE: COURT APPROVED DEALS AND ADVISOR AGREEMENT; PLAN AND PREPARE OUTLINE RE: SAME	2.00	600.00
9/29/2016	APG	MEETING WITH K. ABDO AND CLIENTS TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR HEARING; ATTEND HEARING ON MOTIONS RE: COURT-APPROVED DEALS AND ADVISOR AGREEMENT	4.80	1,440.00
9/30/2016	APG	PARTICIPATE IN COURT CALL AND HEIR COUNSEL	1.50	450.00

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

CALLS RE: VARIOUS ISSUES				
9/30/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE AND EMAILS WITH TYKA NELSON COUNSEL RE: RESPONSE TO COURT ORDER AND [REDACTED]	0.50	150.00
10/1/2016	APG	[REDACTED] RE: LONG TERM ENTERTAINMENT DEALS, ADVISOR AGREEMENT AND TRIBUTE	3.50	1,050.00
10/2/2016	KJA	HEIRS COUNSEL CONFERENCE CALL; REVIEW AGENDA INCLUDING; POST-COURT ORDERS ON PROCEEDING TO DO DEALS; APPOINTMENT OF REPRESENTATIVES TO THE NEGOTIATIONS; POST-ORDER LITIGATION OPTIONS AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] DRAFT; REVIEW WEEK'S ACTIVITIES WITH REGARD TO APPROVING [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	3.70	1,480.00
10/2/2016	APG	DRAFT EMAIL MEMORANDUM TO K. ABDO RE: [REDACTED] AND AGENDA FOR HEIRS COUNSEL CALL; PARTICIPATE IN HEIRS COUNSEL CALL; DRAFT AND REVISE MEMORANDUM RE: [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; VARIOUS EMAILS TO HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	4.50	1,350.00
10/3/2016	KJA	CALL WITH HOLLAND & KNIGHT LAWYERS RE: [REDACTED]	1.50	600.00
10/3/2016	APG	VARIOUS EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH HEIRS COUNSEL AND [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	4.30	1,290.00
10/6/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE AMENDED ORDER RE: COURT APPROVED DEALS AND DENIAL OF HEIRS' MOTION TO RESCIND ADVISOR AGREEMENT; VARIOUS CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO AND CLIENTS RE: SAME	0.80	240.00
10/11/2016	KJA	EXPLORE [REDACTED]	1.00	400.00

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

		SHARON, NORRINE AND JOHN NELSON		
10/12/2016	APG	VARIOUS EMAILS AND TELECONFERENCE WITH HEIRS COUNSEL RE:	0.70	210.00
10/14/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH	0.50	150.00
10/15/2016	KJA	CALL WITH SHARON RE: CONTROL ISSUES OF THE ENTITY TO OWN/OPERATE THE ESTATE; DISCUSS	0.50	200.00
10/18/2016	KJA	FOR SHARON AND NORRINE NELSON	0.80	320.00
10/18/2016	APG	TELECONFERENCE WITH	0.40	120.00
10/18/2016	APG	EMAILS WITH L. HALFERTY AND K. ABDO RE:	0.30	90.00
10/18/2016	APG	DRAFT AND REVISE EMAILS WITH RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH SHARON AND NORRINE RE: SAME; TELECONFERENCE WITH AND K. ABDO RE: SAME	0.90	270.00
10/19/2016	KJA	REVIEW OMARR BAKER'S OBJECTION TO AND EMAILS WITH HEIR COUNSEL RE: SAME	0.50	200.00
10/19/2016	KJA	MEETING AT STINSON OFFICE FOR REVIEW OF ESTATE ASSETS AND CLAIMS WITH LAURA HALFERTY, TRACI BRANSFORD, HOLLAND & KNIGHT LAWYERS ET AL	1.00	400.00
10/20/2016	KJA	MEETINGS WITH BESSEMER, FIDUCIARY AND EVERCORE TRUST COMPANIES WITH RELATED HEIR COUNSEL MEETINGS	4.00	1,600.00
10/21/2016	APG	CONFERENCE WITH JUDGE EIDE, SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR, AND HEIR COUNSEL RE: EXTENSION OF SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR, LIMITED	0.70	210.00

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
 Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

		EXTENSION OF ADVISORS, AND SELECTION AND APPOINTMENT OF PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE	
10/24/2016	APG	REVIEW AND ANALYZE [REDACTED] [REDACTED] EMAILS AND CONFERENCE WITH S. SILTON AND K. ABDO RE: SAME	0.80 240.00
11/1/2016	KJA	EMAIL FROM [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; DISTRIBUTE [REDACTED] TO HEIRS' COUNSEL FOR DISCUSSION	0.50 200.00
11/1/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH HEIRS COUNSEL TO REVIEW [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	1.30 520.00
11/1/2016	APG	REVIEW PROPOSED ORDER TO EXTEND ADVISORS PREPARED BY SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR; VARIOUS EMAILS WITH L. HALFERTY AND T. BRANSFORD RE: SAME; CONFERENCES WITH K. ABDO RE: SAME	0.80 240.00
11/3/2016	KJA	CONFERENCE CALL WITH HEIR COUNSEL AND [REDACTED]	0.40 160.00
11/4/2016	KJA	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. SILTON TO PLAN AND PREPARE FOR COURT CALL; WEEKLY COURT CALL WITH JUDGE EIDE AND COUNSEL	0.80 320.00
11/4/2016	APG	PARTICIPATE IN COURT CONFERENCE CALL WITH SPECIAL ADMINISTRATOR, ALL COUNSEL, AND O. BAKER RE: VARIOUS ISSUES RELATING TO STATUS OF COURT-APPROVED DEALS, CONSULTING AGREEMENTS, AND SELECTION OF PERSONAL REPRESENTATIVE	0.40 120.00

INVOICE DETAIL**LOMMEN ABDO**

LAW FIRM

Sharon L. Nelson

Matter Number: 43516 Invoice Number: 187523
Matter Description: Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson Invoice Date: December 5, 2016

11/7/2016	KJA	CALL TO SHARON NELSON WITH UPDATES DEALS AND CONFIRM CLIENTS' [REDACTED]	0.30	120.00
11/8/2016	APG	REVIEW STATEMENTS OF CLAIMS BY LILY ALPHONSIS AND X. POWELL AND SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS FILED WITH THE COURT	0.50	150.00

Total Current Legal Services Rendered: \$ 141,077.50

Summary of Providers' Time:

	Professional		Hours		Amount
KJA	Kenneth J. Abdo	- Shareholder	155.40	Hours @ 400.00/hr	\$ 62,160.00
PJB	Paul J. Bezilla	- Shareholder	4.00	Hours @ 350.00/hr	\$ 1,400.00
APG	Adam P. Gislason	- Associate	251.40	Hours @ 300.00/hr	\$ 75,420.00
JKH	Janice K. Hanson	- Paralegal	2.60	Hours @ 150.00/hr	\$ 390.00
TCM	Timothy C. Matson	- Shareholder	3.50	Hours @ 325.00/hr	\$ 1,137.50
KAS	Karen A. Schlotthauer	- Shareholder	0.70	Hours @ 300.00/hr	\$ 210.00
TEA	Theresa Abdo Whelan	- Paralegal	2.40	Hours @ 150.00/hr	\$ 360.00

Disbursements & Other Costs Incurred:

Date	Description	Amount
5/2/2016	GROUND TRANSPORTATION TO/FROM CARVER COUNTY COURTHOUSE, CARVER, MN, AND PAISLEY PARK, MINNETONKA, MN, W/CLIENTS, SHARON & NORRINE NELSON (ADAM GISLASON)	864.00
5/2/2016	GROUND TRANSPORTATION RETURN FROM PAISLEY PARK,	33.75

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

	MINNETONKA, MN, W/CLIENTS, SHARON & NORRINE NELSON (ADAM GISLASON)	
5/2/2016	ELECTRONIC FILING FEE- DISTRICT COURT (VISA)	332.00
5/17/2016	CERTIFIED COPIES OF BIRTH CERTIFICATES- HENNEPIN CTY. TREASURER [E101]	78.00
5/18/2016	FEDERAL EXPRESS INV. #5-427-90416 [E107]	30.01
5/27/2016	COURT COPY OF BIRTH CERTIFICATE FROM HENNEPIN COUNTY DISTRICT COURT (THESESA ABDO WHELAN) [E112]	26.64
5/27/2016	COURT COPIES OF PROBATE DOCUMENTS FROM HENNEPIN COUNTY DISTRICT COURT (THESESA ABDO WHELAN) [E112]	50.00
6/8/2016	CERTIFIED COPIES- DISTRICT COURT ADMIN. HENNEPIN CTY.- JANICE HANSON [E101]	16.00
6/9/2016	COURT DOCUMENT COPIES- DISTRICT COURT ADMIN. HENNEPIN CTY.- JANICE HANSON [E112]	152.00
6/9/2016	CERTIFIED COPIES- DISTRICT COURT ADMIN. HENNEPIN CTY.- JANICE HANSON [E101]	52.00
6/9/2016	COURT DOCUMENT COPIES- FAMILY JUSTICE CENTER- JANICE HANSON [E112]	32.00
6/10/2016	COURIER SERVICE FEE- METRO LEGAL SERVICES INV#2930671 [E118]	111.80
6/23/2016	ELECTRONIC FILING FEE- DISTRICT COURT (VISA)	107.00
6/26/2016	GROUND TRANSPORTATION TO FROM CARVER COUNTY COURTHOUSE, CARVER, MN W/CLIENTS, SHARON & NORRINE NELSON (ADAM GISLASON)	288.00
7/27/2016	ACCESS FEE-COURT ELECTRONIC RECORDS-PACER SERVICE CENTER [E106]	8.00
9/13/2016	BUILDING LITIGATION SUPPORT DATABASE - ELECTRONIC LITIGATOR INV#186048	30.39
9/13/2016	COURIER SERVICE FEE- METRO LEGAL SERVICES INV#2952169 [E118]	85.00
9/20/2016	COURIER SERVICE FEE- METRO LEGAL SERVICES INV#2954079 [E118]	31.50
9/28/2016	EXPERT FEES- PHILLIPS, ERLEWINE, GIVEN & CARLIN, LLP [E122]	2,750.00
9/29/2016	ELECTRONIC FILING FEE- DISTRICT COURT (VISA)	107.00
10/7/2016	BUILDING LITIGATION SUPPORT DATABASE - ELECTRONIC LITIGATOR INV#186584	152.78
10/7/2016	COURIER SERVICE FEE- METRO LEGAL SERVICES INV#2958705	40.45

INVOICE DETAIL

Sharon L. Nelson



Matter Number:	43516	Invoice Number:	187523
Matter Description:	Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson	Invoice Date:	December 5, 2016

10/26/2016	[E118] DELIVERY SERVICE TO JOHN NELSON, KANSAS CITY, MO (FEDERAL EXPRESS) [E107]	44.78
10/26/2016	COURIER FEES (METRO LEGAL SERVICES, INC.) INV. 2963519 [E107]	80.90
10/28/2016	COURIER FEES (METRO LEGAL SERVICES, INC.) INV. 2963936	45.45
10/31/2016	BUILDING LITIGATION SUPPORT DATABASE - ELECTRONIC LITIGATOR INV# 187137	3.66
	Total Current Disbursements & Other Services:	\$ 5,553.11

Total Current Billing:	\$ 146,630.61
-------------------------------	----------------------
