STATE OF MINNESOTA SPECIAL REDISTRICTING PANEL A11-152

APPELLATE COURTS
MAY 11 2012

FLED

Sara Hippert, Dave Greer, Linda Markowitz, Dee Dee Larson, Ben Maas, Gregg Peppin, Randy Penrod and Charles Roulet, individually and on behalf of all citizens and voting residents of Minnesota similarly situated,

Plaintiffs,

and

Kenneth Martin, Lynn Wilson, Timothy O'Brien, Irene Peralez, Josie Johnson, Jane Krentz, Mark Altenburg and Debra Hasskamp, individually and on behalf of all citizens of Minnesota similarly situated,

Intervenors,

and

Audrey Britton, David Bly, Cary Coop, and John McIntosh, individually and on behalf of all citizens of Minnesota similarly situated,

Intervenors,

VS.

Mark Ritchie, Secretary of State of Minnesota; and Robert Hiivala, Wright County Auditor, individually and on behalf of all Minnesota county chief election officers,

Defendants.

AFFIDAVIT OF DAVID L.
LILLEHAUG IN SUPPORT OF
MARTIN INTERVENORS'
MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS'
FEES, COSTS, AND
DISBURSEMENTS

David L. Lillehaug, being duly sworn upon oath, deposes and says:

- 1. I am an attorney practicing at the firm of Fredrikson & Byron, P.A. and am one of the attorneys representing the Martin Intervenors in this matter. I hereby submit this affidavit in support of the Martin Intervenors' Motion For Attorneys' Fees, Costs, and Disbursements.
- 2. The Martin Intervenors were represented in this matter by attorneys from the firms of Perkins Coie, LLP and Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.
- 3. A true and correct copy of the invoices prepared by Fredrikson & Byron, P.A. in this matter are attached as Exhibit A. These invoices contain "A description of each item of work performed, the date upon which it was performed, the amount of time spent on each item of work, the identity of the lawyer or legal assistant performing the work, and the hourly rate sought for the work performed" as required by Minn. Gen. R. Prac. 119.02(1).
- 4. The normal hourly rates sought for each person who performed work reflected in Exhibit A are set forth as follows:

Attorney	Rate Charged
D: 1 T :!!-!	\$495 (2011)
David Lillehaug	\$515 (2012)
Christopher Stafford	\$275 (2011)
Christopher Starioru	\$295 (2012)

The amount sought and the normal hourly billing rate are the same, with the proviso that Fredrikson & Byron, P.A. then applied a further 10% discount to all of the legal services provided in this case.

- 5. Each statement contained within Exhibit A also sets forth "a detailed itemization of all amounts sought for disbursements or expenses, including the rate for which any disbursements are charged" as required by Minn. Gen. R. Prac. 119.02(3). I verify that the amounts sought represent the actual costs for the disbursements sought.
- 6. I have reviewed the original time records for this case. I affirm that the work was actually performed for the benefit of the client and was necessary for the proper representation of the client and that charges for any unnecessary or duplicative work have been eliminated.
- 7. A summary calculation of the amounts reflected in Exhibit A is set forth below:

Attorney/Timekeeper	Rate Charged	Hours Expended	Fees Requested
D '1T'11 1	\$495 (2011)	173.0 (2011)	\$105,102,00
David Lillehaug	\$515 (2012)	37.8 (2012)	\$105,102.00
Christophon Staffond	\$275 (2011)	109.1 (2011)	\$35,430.50
Christopher Stafford	\$295 (2012)	18.4 (2012)	\$33,430.30
(10% Downward			-\$14,053.25
Adjustment)			-\$14,055.25
Subtotal			\$126,479.25
Costs and			\$7.016.94
Disbursements			\$7,916.84
Total – Fredrikson		A Property of the second secon	\$134,396.09
& Byron, P.A.			\$154,590.09

Further affiant says naught.

David L. Lillehaug

Subscribed and sworn before me this 24 day of May, 2012

Notary Public

DEBORAH L. SYNOWCZYNSKI

5099594_1.DOC

EXHIBIT A TO AFFIDAVIT OF DAVID L. LILLEHAUG



REMITTANCE PAGE

Minnesota DFL Party c/o Chair Ken Martin 255 East Plato Boulevard St. Paul, MN 55107

Please remit this page with your payment. Thank you. We appreciate your business.

Client Account:

063013.0001

Regarding:

Redistricting Litigation

For Professional Services Rendered Through February 29, 2012

Total Fees:

\$ 126,479.25

Total for Costs and Other Charges:

7,916.84

Total This Invoice

\$ 134,396.09

Payment is due within 30 days from receipt of invoice

If you have any questions please email accounting@fredlaw.com or contact a client representative at 612.492.7574.



Minnesota DFL Party c/o Chair Ken Martin 255 East Plato Boulevard St. Paul, MN 55107

For Professional Services Rendered Through February 29, 2012:

Client Account:

063013.0001

Regarding:

Redistricting Litigation

Invoice Date:

April 30, 2012

03/10/11	C. Stafford	Office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning initial review of census data.	0.20	55.00
03/11/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend working group meeting at Party headquarters in St. Paul.	2.00	990.00
03/25/11	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conference with K. Martin regarding strategy; attend second meeting of working group at Party headquarters.	2.20	1,089.00
03/28/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare and send memorandum to M. Elias regarding March 25 working group meeting; provide Minnesota census information to M. Elias; telephone conference with M. Elias regarding next steps.	1.50	742.50
04/06/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare PowerPoint presentation for Redistricting Working Group.	2.50	1,237.50
04/07/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend Redistricting Work Group meeting at Party headquarters and present at same.	1.70	841.50
04/11/11	C. Stafford	Office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning intervention.	0.20	55.00
04/13/11	D. Lillehaug	Conference call with M. Elias and K. Martin regarding strategy.	0.30	148.50
04/18/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with M. Elias regarding necessary intervention papers; review email from M. Elias regarding potential plaintiffs; office conference regarding same.	0.40	198.00
04/19/11	C. Stafford	Draft state complaint in intervention and notice of intervention; draft federal complaint in intervention and motion to lift stay and intervene;	9.10	2,502.50



		draft pro hac vice papers.		
04/20/11	D. Lillehaug	Review draft intervention papers; office conference regarding same.	1.50	742.50
04/20/11	C. Stafford	Draft federal intervention papers; draft memorandum in support of motion to intervene.	4.20	1,155.00
04/22/11	D. Lillehaug	Review email from K. Martin regarding Rep. S. Anderson letter; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same; exchange emails with K. Martin regarding Republican representation; review numerous emails regarding Governor's response to Rep. S. Anderson letter; review further revisions to intervention papers; office conference regarding same.	1.20	594.00
04/22/11	C. Stafford	Office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning revisions to intervention papers.	0.30	82.50
04/23/11	C. Stafford	Review intervention papers.	1.40	385.00
04/25/11	D. Lillehaug	Review Governor's letter to Rep. Anderson; prepare email to M. Elias and L. Manheim regarding same.	0.20	99.00
04/26/11	D. Lillehaug	Review email and amended bill from J. Tincher regarding House committee hearing; telephone conference with J. Tincher regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same.	0.70	346.50
04/26/11	C. Stafford	Further revise intervention papers.	2.50	687.50
04/27/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with J. Tincher; telephone conference with J. Tincher, V. Thorstenson, and House members regarding legislative strategy; telephone conference with M. Elias regarding same; attend redistricting working group meeting at DFL headquarters; review Republican draft of redistricting principles and DFL legislative brief; prepare email to J. Tincher and N. Conley regarding same.	3.60	1,782.00
04/27/11	C. Stafford	Email correspondence with L. M. Manheim concerning representative districts.	0.10	27.50
04/28/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias and L. Manheim regarding population analysis; participate in conference call with legislators; telephone conference with M. Elias regarding same; view House Redistricting Committee proceedings;	3.10	1,534.50



		prepare email to J. Tincher regarding same; further revise intervention papers.		
05/03/11	D. Lillehaug	Review House proposed redistricting maps; review media regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same.	0.80	396.00
05/04/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to J. Tincher regarding list of intervenors; lengthy telephone conference with J. Tincher regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; telephone conference and exchange emails regarding possible lawyer intervenors; exchange emails with potential intervenor; review list of DFL lawyers for potential intervenors; exchange emails regarding May 5 work group meeting.	1.90	940.50
05/05/11	D. Lillehaug	Lengthy telephone conference with P. Thissen and legislators; attend redistricting working group meeting at DFL headquarters; review and revise draft of intervention papers.	2.50	1,237.50
05/06/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare memorandum to J. Tincher regarding procedure for choosing and vetting intervenors; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding developments.	0.80	396.00
05/09/11	D. Lillehaug	Review Republican congressional maps; exchange emails with K. Martin, M. Elias, and others regarding same; further review and revise intervention papers; review email from J. Tincher regarding strategy; telephone conference with J. Tincher regarding same; prepare email to J. Tincher regarding same; perform research on previous Minnesota redistricting cases.	3.30	1,633.50
05/09/11 05/11/11	C. Stafford D. Lillehaug	Revise intervention papers. Exchange emails regarding veto message; exchange emails with J. Tincher regarding potential alternative map; review spreadsheet data on potential intervenors; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding CD 7 intervenors.	0.80 0.80	220.00 396.00
05/12/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with M. Elias regarding St. Cloud congressional redistricting; prepare email to J. Tincher regarding vetting of intervenors; review email from V. Thorstenson regarding	2.70	1,336.50



05/13/11	D. Lillehaug	Senate floor debate; analyze Republican plan for Edina; revise and send V. Thorstenson outline; review documents from K. Martin. Exchange emails with K. Martin and J. Tincher regarding intervenor vetting; prepare email to G. Loewen regarding same; review updated spreadsheet from J. Tincher; prepare line-up of intervenors for state and federal lawsuits; exchange emails with V. Thorstenson regarding Senate schedule; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same; review draft letter for legislators; telephone conference with V. Thorstenson and J. Tincher regarding same; revise and email same; prepare email to V. Thorstenson regarding strategy; office conferences.	2.30	1,138.50
05/16/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with V. Thorstenson regarding legislator letter; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding minority intervenors; briefly review vetting reports from G. Loewen and convey to C. Stafford for review; exchange emails with L. Manheim regarding intervention papers and intervenors; telephone conference with L. Manheim regarding same; telephone conference with K. Martin regarding same; prepare email to K. Martin with talking points for intervenor recruitment; attention to potential intervenors in CD7.	2.70	1,336.50
05/16/11	C. Stafford	Prepare memorandum of proposed talking points; revise intervention papers; telephone conference with D. Lillehaug and L. Manheim concerning intervention pleadings.	3.60	990.00
05/17/11	C. Stafford	Revise intervention papers; review qualifications of intervenors.	0.50	137.50
05/18/11	D. Lillehaug	Review draft veto messages and prepare email regarding same; exchange emails with V. Thorstenson regarding same; review A. Weinblatt motion to lift stay in federal lawsuit; exchange multiple emails with M. Elias; review T. Trimble motion to lift stay in state lawsuit.	1.80	891.00



05/18/11	C. Stafford	Review court rules for hearings; telephone conference with H. Kraus Kaplan concerning intervenors.	0.40	110.00
05/19/11	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conference with A. Weinblatt regarding federal lawsuit; prepare lengthy email to M. Elias and K. Martin regarding motions to lift stays; telephone conference with K. Martin regarding Governor's veto; attention to intervenor recruitment, including multiple telephone conferences with potential intervenors, multiple email exchanges with H. Kaplan, and preparation of draft engagement letter; exchange emails regarding pending request for appointment of state panel; prepare draft press release and email to K. Martin regarding same; prepare email to H. Kaplan and others regarding status of intervenor recruitment; prepare email to M. Elias regarding June 6 hearing; review and revise press release from K. Sosanie; telephone conference with G. Loewen regarding vetting of new recruits; telephone conferences with L. Manheim and K. Hamilton regarding Perkins Coie conflict checks and engagement letter.	6.30	3,118.50
05/19/11	C. Stafford	Revise intervention papers; review qualifications of intervenors; prepare for filing.	1.80	495.00
05/20/11	D. Lillehaug	Office conference regarding finalization of intervention papers and filing; further attention to intervenors from CD7; prepare email to K. Hamilton regarding names for conflict check; prepare email to K. Hamilton regarding Minnesota procedure for intervention; prepare email to K. Sosanie regarding draft press release; continue telephone conferences with intervenors and exchange emails with H. Kaplan regarding same; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding filing status; telephone conference with G. Loewen regarding final vetting; review A. Weinblatt letter to Chief Justice L. Gildea; prepare email to K. Martin and others regarding	6.30	3,118.50



Page:

6

		same; exchange emails with K. Martin regarding June 6 hearing; review Perkins Coie draft engagement letter; telephone conferences with K. Hamilton and L. Manheim regarding same; finalize Fredrikson engagement letter and email to 16 intervenors; prepare email to Redistricting Working Group members regarding filing schedule and recent developments; follow up with H. Kaplan on intervenor emails.		
05/20/11	C. Stafford	Prepare summary of intervenor characteristics; revise intervention papers; review qualifications of intervenors; office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning filing; review pro hac vice motion fees.	0.80	220.00
05/22/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with L. Manheim regarding class action allegations; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding draft press release; multiple email exchanges regarding Governor.	1.80	891.00
05/22/11	C. Stafford	Review emails concerning revision of intervention papers.	0.30	82.50
05/23/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias and K. Hamilton regarding signing papers; exchange emails with H. Kaplan and L. Buboltz regarding L. Buboltz retainer; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding press release; prepare email to K. Martin and K. Sosanie regarding sign-offs on press release; exchange emails with K. Hamilton regarding unsigned retainers; exchange emails with V. Thorstenson regarding filing; review draft P. Thissen letter and exchange emails with J. Tincher regarding same; exchange multiple emails with H. Kaplan and K. Sosanie regarding filing and press release; prepare emails to Redistricting Working Group regarding key federal and state pleadings; telephone conference with D. Rogan regarding state case; prepare letter to Supreme Court Administrator regarding appearance in state case; attention to engagement letter responses from 16 intervenors.	4.40	2,178.00



Page: /

05/23/11	C. Stafford	Finalize and file pleadings for motion to intervene in federal and state cases.	3.30	907.50
05/24/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias regarding special judicial panel appointment; telephone conference with Supreme Court Administrator regarding same; exchange emails with H. Kaplan regarding intervenor G. Greene; prepare email to 16 intervenors regarding lawsuit filings and status; exchange emails with G. Greene; finalize and file letter to Supreme Court Administrator; prepare email to Solicitor General A. Gilbert; prepare multiple emails to H. Kaplan regarding three intervenors; telephone conference with intervenor J. Johnson; prepare email to J. Johnson regarding same; exchange emails with potential expert.	2.40	1,188.00
05/25/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with H. Kaplan regarding intervenor M. Little.	0.20	99.00
05/26/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to K. Martin regarding first phase of representation; exchange emails with H. Kaplan regarding intervenor M. Little; telephone conference with K. Martin regarding congressional delegation; attend meeting of Redistricting Working Group.	1.90	940.50
05/27/11	D. Lillehaug	Review Trimble opposition to Weinblatt motion to lift stay; review Trimble opposition to motion to intervene; perform brief legal research regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias and client representatives regarding same; exchange emails with M. Elias and K. Hamilton regarding strategy on motion to intervene; telephone conference with K. Martin regarding congressional delegation and June 6 hearing; telephone conference with Rep. K. Ellison; prepare email to K. Martin regarding same; review Attorney General opposition to Weinblatt motion to lift stay; prepare email to client representatives regarding same; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding June 6 hearing; review Chief Justice L. Gildea order of February	3.10	1,534.50



		14; prepare email to M. Elias and K. Hamilton		
05/07///	0.01.11	regarding same.	0.00	220.00
05/27/11	C. Stafford	Review responses to intervention motion and motion to lift stay	0.80	220.00
05/30/11	D. Lillehaug	Conference with Rep. K. Ellison; prepare email to K. Ellison regarding key pleadings; prepare draft affidavit for federal case; exchange emails with M. Elias and K. Hamilton regarding same; review letter from Reps. B. McCollum and C. Peterson.	1.30	643.50
05/30/11	C. Stafford	Review correspondence concerning motion to intervene.	0.20	55.00
05/31/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to K. Martin regarding draft affidavit; prepare draft letter to Reps. McCollum and Peterson; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; revise affidavit and prepare for filing and service; prepare email to H. Kaplan regarding same; revise and send letter to Reps. McCollum and Peterson; telephone conference with C. Nauen regarding June 6 hearing.	1.30	643.50
05/31/11	C. Stafford	Review and file clarifying affidavit; review correspondence concerning motion to intervene.	1.00	275.00
06/01/11	D. Lillehaug	Review order from Chief Justice L. Gildea regarding five-judge panel; prepare emails to client representatives regarding same.	0.30	148.50
06/01/11	C. Stafford	Review draft redistricting map; review order naming panel.	0.30	82.50
06/02/11	D. Lillehaug	Review biographical information on five-judge panel; prepare lengthy email to M. Elias regarding same; prepare email regarding M. Elias visit.	0.70	346.50
06/06/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare for and attend hearing before Magistrate Judge A. Boylan; conference with M. Elias, J. Tincher, V. Thorstenson, P. Wattson, and others regarding legislative maps.	5.60	2,772.00
06/06/11	C. Stafford	Office conference with D. Lillehaug, P. Wattson, J. Tincher, and DFL party representatives concerning redistricting issues.	3.30	907.50
07/13/11 07/18/11	C. Stafford D. Lillehaug	Telephone conference with J. Tincher. Review Scheduling Order No. 1; exchange	0.20 0.50	55.00 247.50



		multiple emails regarding same.		
07/19/11	C. Stafford	Telephone conference with Wright County clerk	0.10	27.50
07/20/11	D. Lillehaug	of court concerning intervention status Exchange emails with M. Elias and clients	0.50	247.50
07/21/11	D. Lillehaug	regarding Scheduling Order No. 1. Review order from Magistrate Judge; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same.	0.30	148.50
07/28/11	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conferences with A. Weinblatt regarding Britton intervention; attend meeting of redistricting working group; office conference regarding Scheduling Order No. 1; telephone conferences with Staff Attorney K. Swenson regarding intervention; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; telephone conference with AAG K. Anderson regarding Britton intervention; review and revise J. Tincher memorandum regarding intervention; prepare letter to intervenor clients regarding status; forward same to E. McGann for distribution; prepare motion to Special Redistricting Panel to confirm intervention; email same to M. Elias for	3.30	1,633.50
07/28/11	C. Stafford	comment. Telephone conferences with Clerk of Appellate Courts and Supreme Court Comm. R. Slowes concerning intervention status; office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning intervention status and strategy; draft motion to confirm intervention.	1.60	440.00
07/29/11	C. Stafford	Finalize and file motion to confirm intervention; review Weinblatt motion to intervene and additional court submissions.	1.70	467.50
08/01/11	D. Lillehaug	Review Weinblatt motion for intervention in state case; exchange emails with V. Thorstenson	0.20	99.00
08/03/11	D. Lillehaug	regarding same. Review letter from E. Magnuson requesting maps; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same; exchange emails with E. McGann regarding K. Martin request for talking points.	0.30	148.50
08/08/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with M. Elias regarding status; exchange emails with T. Trimble regarding	0.30	148.50



		request for maps.		
08/10/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with M. Elias regarding amicus filing.	0.10	49.50
08/12/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in conference call with M. Elias and others regarding Minnesota Citizens Redistricting Commission.	0.80	396.00
08/15/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in conference call with E. Magnuson and T. Trimble regarding maps.	0.30	148.50
08/16/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend Minnesota Redistricting Commission meeting.	2.00	990.00
08/17/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with E. McGann regarding meeting agenda.	0.10	49.50
08/18/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend redistricting working group meeting at DFL headquarters; review panel decision granting intervention.	1.50	742.50
08/25/11	D. Lillehaug	Conference with J. Donnelly of Rep. Ellison's office regarding congressional redistricting.	1.00	495.00
08/30/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in conference call with client representatives.	0.70	346.50
09/06/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in working group conference call; conference with M. Elias on case status.	0.80	396.00
09/06/11	C. Stafford	Legal research concerning separate service of complaint following intervention.	0.80	220.00
09/07/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend working group meeting at DFL headquarters; prepare email to M. Elias and K. Hamilton summarizing meeting.	1.90	940.50
09/07/11	C. Stafford	Review answer to complaint in intervention; draft summary email.	0.50	137.50
09/09/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in working group conference call.	1.40	693.00
09/13/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare for and participate in conference call with all counsel regarding potential stipulations; participate in working group conference call; review panel order amending hearing schedule; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; review accumulated correspondence and emails.	2.30	1,138.50
09/14/11	D. Lillehaug	Review and consider email from P. Wattson regarding criteria; forward same to M. Elias.	0.20	99.00
09/20/11	D. Lillehaug	Review recent correspondence from J. Tincher and V. Thorstenson; participate in conference	0.70	346.50



		call regarding upcoming public hearings.		
09/21/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with K. Hamilton regarding public hearings.	0.30	148.50
09/23/11	C. Stafford	Coordinate and attend presentation of redistricting map options.	3.00	825.00
09/27/11	C. Stafford	Telephone conferences with K. Swenson and L. Finne concerning record at hearings; draft summary email.	0.50	137.50
09/28/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with K. Hamilton regarding stipulation and joint statement; prepare email to E. Brama regarding same; revise statement of unresolved issues; telephone conference with M. Hines regarding case status; email documents to M. Hines.	1.40	693.00
09/28/11	C. Stafford	Finalize and file statement of unresolved issues.	2.20	605.00
09/29/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend working group meeting at DFL headquarters.	1.30	643.50
10/03/11	D. Lillehaug	Brief M. Hines on redistricting law, working group progress, and case status.	1.50	742.50
10/04/11	D. Lillehaug	Review draft motion for redistricting criteria; prepare email to M. Elias regarding comments on same; forward C. Stafford comments to W. Stafford; participate in working group conference call regarding same; office conference regarding Bloomington hearing; prepare criteria motion redline and email to W. Stafford; exchange emails with C. Stafford regarding Bloomington hearing.	2.50	1,237.50
10/04/11	C. Stafford	Review redistricting criteria brief; attend Bloomington public hearing and prepare report of same.	2.80	770.00
10/05/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias and others regarding Bloomington hearing; telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding same and motion for criteria.	0.40	198.00
10/05/11	C. Stafford	File and serve redistricting criteria brief.	0.80	220.00
10/06/11	D. Lillehaug	Review Scheduling Order No. 2; forward same to E. McGann.	0.20	99.00
10/07/11	D. Lillehaug	Review criteria motions from Hippert Intervenors, Britton Intervenors, and Secretary	1.20	594.00



		of State; review letter from A. Weinblatt to Panel; review email from Panel regarding transcripts; prepare email to M. Elias and others regarding same.		
10/11/11 10/11/11	D. Lillehaug C. Stafford	Participate in working group conference call. Coordinate transcript requests from public hearings.	0.60 0.30	297.00 82.50
10/17/11 10/18/11	C. Stafford D. Lillehaug	Follow-up on transcript requests. Participate in conference call with working group; telephone conferences with V. Thorstenson, T. Smith, and P. Wattson; prepare emails to T. Smith and working group regarding same; prepare email to client representatives regarding hearing transcripts.	0.20 1.40	55.00 693.00
10/19/11	D. Lillehaug	Perform final review of criteria reply brief; review reply briefs from E. Magnuson and A. Weinblatt; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same.	0.80	396.00
10/19/11	C. Stafford	Review criteria reply brief and edit for form; file and serve same.	0.70	192.50
10/21/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with V. Thorstenson regarding draft brief; review draft brief; telephone conferences with T. Smith, D. Anderson, and K. Martin regarding same; prepare email to P. Wattson regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias and K. Martin regarding same; telephone conference with P. Wattson; prepare email to P. Wattson confirming same.	0.80	396.00
10/24/11	D. Lillehaug	Review scheduling order; review file; prepare list of potential panel questions for M. Elias; prepare email to T. Smith.	1.30	643.50
10/25/11	D. Lillehaug	Respond to email from C. Nauen regarding redistricting argument; conference with M. Elias in preparation for oral argument.	0.70	346.50
10/26/11	D. Lillehaug	Attend oral argument; participate in conference at headquarters regarding same; conference with M. Elias regarding next steps; perform research on metropolitan area issue; exchange emails with W. Stafford and M. Elias regarding same; review letters from E. Magnuson and A. Weinblatt to panel regarding same; review draft	6.50	3,217.50



		letter to panel; exchange emails with W. Stafford, V. Thorstenson, and M. Elias regarding same.		
10/27/11	D. Lillehaug	Further revise letter to panel regarding metropolitan area; arrange for service; prepare draft letter to individual clients; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; review follow-up correspondence from A. Weinblatt and K. Anderson.	1.50	742.50
11/01/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in regular conference call with working group.	1.20	594.00
11/04/11	D. Lillehaug	Review Panel order on criteria; exchange emails with working group regarding same.	0.50	247.50
11/07/11	D. Lillehaug	Further review Panel order on criteria; review email exchanges regarding same.	0.50	247.50
11/08/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in conference call with working group regarding criteria order and November 18 motion; exchange emails with J. Tincher regarding potential amicus.	1.10	544.50
11/09/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with M. Hines regarding redistricting update; review Common Cause amicus motion and Hippert Intervenors response; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; perform brief legal research on opportunity to respond to amicus motion and deadline for same; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same.	1.10	544.50
11/10/11	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conference with M. Hines regarding criteria order and recent developments; prepare email to M. Hines with key documents; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; review and forward to M. Elias PIM article on expected Republican map submission; attend meeting at client headquarters regarding maps and	2.20	1,089.00
11/11/11	D. Lillehaug	communications plan. Exchange emails with J. Donnelly, V. Thorstenson, and J. Tincher regarding approval of congressional map.	0.20	99.00
11/14/11	D. Lillehaug	Review draft congressional motion; exchange emails with W. Stafford regarding same; lengthy	3.70	1,831.50

Fredrikson 8 BYRON, P.A.

INVOICE DETAIL

11/15/11	D. Lillehaug	conference with V. Thorstenson and J. Tincher regarding draft legislative map. Review email exchanges regarding 5th CD map; attention to 5th CD alternatives presented on September 30; office conference regarding same; telephone conferences with K. Moe regarding same; compete review of draft congressional motion; lengthy telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding comments on congressional motion; review draft legislative motion; exchange emails with K. Hamilton and others regarding Weinblatt email; participate in conference call regarding status; lengthy telephone conferences with W. Stafford regarding comments on legislative motion; perform brief factual research regarding same; participate in lengthy working group conference	5.80	2,871.00
		call on congressional map.		
11/15/11	C. Stafford	Review filing requirements; telephone conference with D. Lillehaug concerning service.	0.40	110.00
11/16/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias regarding filing procedures; analyze congressional map; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same; prepare email to V. Thorstenson and J. Tincher regarding same; multiple telephone conferences with C. Day, M. Elias, and K. Moe regarding congressional map; review next draft of legislative motion; telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding same; telephone conference with M. Elias and K. Hamilton in preparation for working group call; participate in lengthy conference call with K. Martin, C. Day, and working group regarding congressional map; telephone conference with M. Elias and K.	4.30	2,128.50
11/16/11	C. Stafford	Hamilton regarding same. Arrange for service and filing of redistricting plans; telephone conference with K. Martin, M. Elias, K. Hamilton, D. Lillehaug, and others concerning strategy.	4.90	1,347.50
11/17/11	D. Lillehaug	Review multiple emails regarding congressional	5.10	2,524.50



Page:

15

map; multiple telephone conferences with C. Day regarding same; exchange multiple emails with M. Elias regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias regarding Common Cause motion; telephone conference with M. Hines regarding status; prepare memorandum regarding same; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same; attention to necessity of new congressional motion; exchange emails with E. Brama regarding filing and service of motions; prepare emails to M. Hines regarding legislative map, delegation congressional map, draft brief, and memorandum; begin review of revised legislative brief; begin review of revised congressional brief. Prepare redistricting plan, brief and documents

C. Stafford Prepare re

5.10 1,402.50

8.20

4.059.00

11/18/11 D. Lillehaug

11/17/11

for submission in conformance with requirements set by Redistricting Panel Order. Review revised congressional brief; prepare email to W. Stafford with comments on same; exchange emails with L. Jacobs declining

exchange emails with L. Jacobs declining invitation; prepare email to M. Elias regarding filing electronic maps; participate in conference call with client representatives regarding congressional map; telephone conference with T. Smith regarding status; prepare email to T.

Smith and D. Anderson regarding same; prepare email to K. Martin regarding congressional map decision; review latest reports on congressional map and arrange for filing; exchange emails with W. Stafford regarding congressional map;

prepare email to M. Hines regarding congressional map; telephone conferences with J. Buoen and A. Peterson regarding

congressional map; telephone conference with K. Martin regarding timetable for map

submissions; brief conferences with A. Klobuchar and J. Buoen regarding congressional map; prepare email to M. Elias regarding status; telephone conference with K.

main 612.492.7000 fax 612.492.7077 www.fredlaw.com Tax ID No. 41-0971937



11/18/11 11/19/11

11/20/11

11/21/11

11/21/11

11/22/11

11/28/11

11/29/11

	Martin and Walz representatives regarding options; telephone conference with K. Martin regarding congressional map; exchange multiple emails with M. Elias regarding same; prepare draft letter to Panel regarding congressional map; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same; perform final review of legislative and congressional briefs; prepare email to M. Elias regarding Briggs and Weinblatt services; arrange for circulation of Briggs and Weinblatt briefs and maps; review Weinblatt map; prepare email to K. Martin and M. Elias regarding same; prepare email to client representatives confirming filing and service; multiple telephone conference with J. Syrjamaki regarding same; monitor press reports regarding same; exchange multiple emails with M. Elias regarding same.		
C. Stafford D. Lillehaug	Finalize documents for service; serve and file. Monitor press reports regarding CD4; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same; lengthy telephone conference with J.P. Barone regarding same per K. Martin request.	6.40 0.60	1,760.00 297.00
D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with V. Thorstenson regarding Eagan district; prepare email to K. Martin and C. Day regarding status.	0.40	198.00
D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias regarding media reactions to filings; prepare PowerPoint presentation for Executive Committee briefing; attend same.	3.30	1,633.50
C. Stafford	Analyze three redistricting plans; create comparison charts.	4.00	1,100.00
D. Lillehaug	Prepare emails to K. Martin, C. Day, and W. Stafford with spreadsheet comparing plans; review email from Rep. Peterson aide; telephone conference with aide regarding same.	0.40	198.00
D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with E. McGann; review Hippert and Britton legislative and congressional briefs.	1.20	594.00
C. Stafford	Telephone conference with E. McGann, M.	0.60	165.00



		Hoffa, M. Elias, K. Hamilton, B. Stafford and V. Thorstenson concerning redistricting litigation strategy; draft summary email concerning same.		
11/30/11	D. Lillehaug	Perform internet research on Panel; exchange emails with K. Hamilton regarding same.	0.20	99.00
12/06/11	D. Lillehaug	Participate in working group conference call; review draft congressional brief; lengthy telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding same.	2.80	1,386.00
12/07/11	D. Lillehaug	Prepare email to M. Elias regarding CD4; review draft legislative brief; lengthy telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding same.	2.30	1,138.50
12/07/11	C. Stafford	Office conference concerning revisions to legislative response brief; prepare for service and filing of response briefs; draft revision to legislative response brief.	0.40	110.00
12/08/11	D. Lillehaug	Review next draft of congressional brief; lengthy telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding same; review next draft of legislative brief; lengthy telephone conference with W. Stafford regarding same.	3.80	1,881.00
12/09/11	D. Lillehaug	Exchange emails with W. Stafford regarding final revisions to response briefs; perform final review of response briefs; office conference regarding filing and service of same; review Hippert Intervenors response briefs; review Britton Intervenors response briefs; prepare email to M. Elias and K. Hamilton regarding Judge Rodenburg.	2.80	1,386.00
12/09/11	C. Stafford	Prepare Affidavit of C. Stafford; finalize response briefs and file.	2.70	742.50
12/14/11	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conference with M. Elias regarding January 4 oral argument.	0.40	198.00
12/14/11 12/18/11	C. Stafford C. Stafford	Prepare and file letter concerning oral argument. Analyze briefs, plans and reports for legislative argument.	0.20 2.20	55.00 605.00
12/19/11	D. Lillehaug	Office conference regarding tasks for January 4 oral argument; telephone conference with K. Martin; assemble and email documents regarding same; telephone conference with C.	1.50	742.50



		Nauen and S. Duniway.		
12/19/11	C. Stafford	Office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning	0.80	220.00
12/20/11	D. Lillehaug	legislative argument; analyze plan reports. Participate in conference call with M. Elias, K. Hamilton, and W. Stafford regarding strategy and PowerPoint for January 4 oral argument; begin preparation for same.	1.70	841.50
12/20/11	C. Stafford	Telephone conference with M. Elias, K. Hamilton and B. Stafford concerning oral argument.	0.80	220.00
12/22/11	C. Stafford	Review congressional presentation; analyze plan reports and maps; draft presentation for legislative proposal argument.	0.80	220.00
12/26/11	C. Stafford	Draft presentation for legislative proposal argument.	4.10	1,127.50
12/27/11	C. Stafford	Draft presentation for legislative proposal argument.	8.40	2,310.00
12/28/11	C. Stafford	Draft presentation for legislative proposal argument.	13.10	3,602.50
12/29/11	C. Stafford	Draft presentation for legislative proposal argument.	0.70	192.50
12/30/11	C. Stafford	Revise presentation with updated maps; refine graphics for presentation.	3.00	825.00
01/02/12	D. Lillehaug	Prepare for oral argument; office conference regarding draft PowerPoint presentation.	6.80	3,502.00
01/02/12	C. Stafford	Office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning oral argument; revise presentation for oral	1.50	442.50
01/03/12	D. Lillehaug	argument. Revise PowerPoint; office conference regarding same; prepare email to M. Elias regarding Emison case; prepare email to M. Elias regarding minority influence numbers; prepare letter to Panel regarding same; lengthy conference with M. Elias and W. Stafford regarding congressional and legislative	10.30	5,304.50
01/03/12	C. Stafford	PowerPoints; prepare for oral argument. Office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning oral argument; office conference with D. Lillehaug, M. Elias, and W. Stafford concerning review and refinement of oral argument; revise presentation for oral argument; prepare	9.60	2,832.00



01/04/12	D. Lillehaug	technology and printed materials for argument. Prepare for and attend oral argument at Minnesota Judicial Center; debrief regarding	7.50	3,862.50
01/04/12 01/05/12	C. Stafford D. Lillehaug	same. Prepare for and attend oral argument. Prepare outline for client meeting; prepare email to M. Elias regarding media; attend working group meeting at client headquarters; obtain and analyze filing per request of K. Martin; prepare	2.80 3.10	826.00 1,596.50
01/12/12 01/19/12	D. Lillehaug D. Lillehaug	email to K. Martin regarding same. Complete final tasks on redistricting file. Exchange emails with C. Nauen regarding U.S. Supreme Court redistricting order; review same; exchange emails with C. Nauen regarding same.	0.50 0.40	257.50 206.00
01/30/12	C. Stafford	Telephone conference with Clerk of Appellate Courts concerning plan submission by Mansky; review public submissions for Mansky plan.	0.60	177.00
01/31/12	C. Stafford	Coordinate with clerk of appellate courts office to obtain copies of Mansky plan.	0.40	118.00
02/01/12	D. Lillehaug	Exchange two emails with K. Martin regarding developments.	0.20	103.00
02/15/12	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conferences with R. Stassen-Berger and K. Martin; prepare email to M. Elias regarding same.	0.40	206.00
02/20/12	D. Lillehaug	Multiple telephone conferences with DFL staff regarding timing of Court orders; telephone conference with M. Hines regarding same; exchange emails with M. Elias regarding same.	1.40	721.00
02/21/12	D. Lillehaug	Review congressional and legislative redistricting orders, appendices, and maps; telephone conference with M. Elias regarding same; participate in working group conference call regarding same; telephone conferences with DFL staff and media regarding same.	3.70	1,905.50
02/21/12	C. Stafford	Review and analyze redistricting maps and reports; office conference with D. Lillehaug concerning analysis; telephone conference with client representatives concerning redistricting maps; analyze CD1.	3.50	1,032.50
02/22/12	D. Lillehaug	Telephone conference with C. Day; prepare for	2.20	1,133.00



Page: 20

02/23/12	D. Lillehaug	and brief client representatives. Prepare email to M. Elias and team regarding February 22 meeting; further media contacts; multiple telephone conferences with party	0.90	463.50
02/28/12	D. Lillehaug	leaders. Prepare emails to M. Elias and others regarding legislative map.	0.40	206.00

Total Hours

Total For Fees \$126,479.25

338.30

Costs and Other Charges

05/12/11 05/20/11 05/20/11 05/20/11 05/20/11	Metro Legal Services, Inc Obtain copies in Wright County District Court Administrator - Initial filing fee Clerk of U.S. District Court - 2 Admissions -Pro Hac Vice Wright County - 2 Admissions -Pro Hac Vice and motion fee Reversal from Void Check Number: 288307 Bank ID: 1 Voucher ID: 304809 Vendor: Wright County	82.00 320.00 200.00 300.00 (300.00)
05/23/11	Wright County - District Court Clerk - Fax fee and Pro Hac Vice fees	225.00
06/20/11	Excel Legal Courier - Delivery to Magistrate Boylan on 5/31/11	11.00
08/02/11	Pacer -Research charges April 2,2011 through June 30,2011	58.80
09/15/11	Metro Legal Services, Inc Filing Motion to Confirm Intervention OR, In the Alternative, To Intervene, And For Admission Pro Hac Vice	34.00
10/13/11	Excel Legal Courier - Filing of Martin Intervenors' Statement of Unresolved Issues with Clerk of Appellate Courts	44.00
10/18/11	Barbara Post - Transcript of Public Hearing on October 4th and Minneapolis Hearing on October 6th	118.00
10/20/11	Excel Legal Courier - Filing of Motion to Adopt Redistricting Criteria for Martin Intervenors	44.00,
10/26/11	Court Reporter - Janice M. Kosel - Copy of transcript of the Special Redistricting Hearing held in Bemidji on 10/11/11	11.50
10/27/11	Court Reporter - Advantage Court Reporting - Transcript of Special Redistricting Panel Hearing in St. Cloud taken on	94.40



10/27/11	10/13/11 Court Reporter - Doug Ketcham & Associates, Inc Transcript of Special Redistricting Hearing held in Moorhead on 10/12/11	61.40
10/31/11	Court Reporter - Jill Garrison - Transcript of Redistricting Hearinf held in St. Paul on 10/5/11	25.00
11/02/11	PACER Service Center US Courts -Research charges July 1,2011-September 30,2011	2.40
11/04/11	Excel Legal Courier - Roundtrip Courier Service - Pick up check for Payment of Bloomington and Minneapolis Hearing Transcripts; Deliver Check; Pick up transcripts and Deliver to F&B	30.00
11/04/11	Excel Legal Courier - Filing of Martin Intervenors' Response to Motions to Adopt Proposed Redistricting Criteria with Minnesota Clerk of Appellate Courts	31.00
11/04/11	Court Reporter - Calvin J. Everson - Transcript of Special Redistricting Panel Hearing in Cloquet, taken on 10/10/11	15.00
11/15/11	Court Reporter - Michelle Barsness - Mankato Transcript of Redistricting Hearing on October 14,2011	42.00
11/15/11	Edina Couriers, Inc.	13.05
11/16/11	Court Reporter - Faith A. West - Transcript of October 26,2011 Oral Arguments	16.50
11/21/11	Cisco WebEx LLC - Conference call 09-23 MN DFL Presentation	128.50
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	31.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	40.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	70.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	40.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	24.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	40.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	36.00
12/07/11	Excel Legal Courier - Personal Service and Filing of Martin Intervenor's Congressional Brief on 11/18/11	31.00



Page: 22

01/11/12	Excel Legal Courier - Filing of Martin Intervenors' Response to Other Parties' Proposed Legislative Plans, Response to Other Parties' Propose Congressional Plans and Second Affidavit of Christopher Stafford	24.00
01/16/12	·	29.00
01/19/12	Offsite Work - NightOwl - 2,200 color copies and 25 binding - velo booklets	1,845.65
01/31/12	Offsite Work - Pitney Bowes Management Services, Inc 11-17 copies	2,565.05
	Research via Westlaw	498.39
	Photocopy Charges	1,005.20
	Binding Charge	30.00
	Total For Costs and Other Charges	\$ 7,916.84

Total This Invoice

\$ 134,396.09