

**EXHIBIT B**

**TO**

**DECLARATION OF**

**MARK W. GREINER**

**(REDACTED)**

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

### Summary by Matter

<u>Matter #</u>	<u>Matter Name</u>	<u>Current Fees</u>	<u>Current Disb</u>	<u>Matter Total</u>
077376.0001	Estate Administration	8,563.50	3,499.15	12,062.65
077376.0003	Second Special Administrator Matters	372.00	0.00	372.00
077376.0006	Heirs, Heirs' Counsel, Heirs' Advisors and Mediator Matters	2,117.50	522.50	2,640.00
077376.0008		7,358.00	0.00	7,358.00
077376.0100	Employment	672.00	0.00	672.00
077376.0200	Real Estate	477.00	67.52	544.52
077376.0205	Galpin Blvd. Real Estate	9,897.50	500.00	10,397.50
077376.0300	Corporate	1,446.50	190.00	1,636.50
077376.0303	Paisley Park Enterprises, Inc.	257.50	0.00	257.50
077376.0402	Bergonzi Litigation	192.00	0.00	192.00
077376.0403	Brandon Litigation	17,049.00	304.30	17,353.30
077376.0409	George Ian Boxill Litigation	114,686.50	15,171.76	129,858.26
077376.0411	Paisley Park Museum Exhibiting Operating Agreement	986.50	0.00	986.50
077376.0414	Kian Andrew Habib	26,319.50	1,929.98	28,249.48
077376.0415	International Bootlegging	7,063.50	393.67	7,457.17
077376.0417	Domain Capital Inc.	1,472.00	1.50	1,473.50
077376.0420	Sharon Nelson Claim	14,920.50	565.35	15,485.85

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

<u>Matter #</u>	<u>Matter Name</u>	<u>Current Fees</u>	<u>Current Disb</u>	<u>Matter Total</u>
077376.0421	Lythcott and Walker NDA Breach	67,993.50	1,103.00	69,096.50
077376.0422	Walker Contempt Motion	7,099.00	0.00	7,099.00
077376.0500	Intellectual Property	8,384.00	132.00	8,516.00
077376.0605	PRN Licensing	1,054.00	0.00	1,054.00
077376.0608		160.50	0.00	160.50
077376.1000	Trademarks	3,463.00	4,998.50	8,461.50
077376.1001	Copyright Matters	8,685.50	14.91	8,700.41
077376.1002	Domain Names	108.00	0.00	108.00
077376.1003	Enforcement	7,870.00	2,599.94	10,469.94
077376.1016	TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (1794869) (CA)	0.00	265.56	265.56
077376.1017	TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (IC 14) (CN)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1029	TM: PAISLEY PARK (1794862) (CA)	36.00	0.00	36.00
077376.1039	TM: PRINCE (1794871) (CA)	214.00	874.33	1,088.33
077376.1041	TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (CN)	36.00	6.00	42.00
077376.1044	TM: PRINCE (Class 25) (2016083439) (JP)	90.00	(863.71)	(773.71)
077376.1051	TM: VANITY 6 (86661729) (US)	201.50	0.00	201.50
077376.1057	TM: THE REVOLUTION (87390311) (US)	128.00	250.00	378.00
077376.1059	TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (87472940) (US)	97.00	125.00	222.00
077376.1060	TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (87472956) (US)	97.00	125.00	222.00
077376.1061	TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (87472977) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1064	TM: NPG (87457731) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1065	TM: NPG (87457733) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1068	TM: PAISLEY PARK (Class 15) (87457736) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1071	TM: PRINCE (Class 14) (87472987) (US)	97.00	125.00	222.00
077376.1072	TM: PRINCE (Class 16) (87472998) (US)	97.00	125.00	222.00
077376.1073	TM: PRINCE (Class 21) (87473003) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A. Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

<u>Matter #</u>	<u>Matter Name</u>	<u>Current Fees</u>	<u>Current Disb</u>	<u>Matter Total</u>
077376.1074	TM: PRINCE (Class 35) (87473022) (US)	97.00	125.00	222.00
077376.1075	TM: PRINCE (Class 41) (87473029) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1082	TM: PRINCE (87472980) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1083	TM: PRINCE (87472992) (US)	97.00	125.00	222.00
077376.1084	TM: PRINCE (87473006) (US)	112.50	125.00	237.50
077376.1129	TM: NPG (IC 9) (JP)	212.00	3,999.00	4,211.00
077376.1141	TM: THE REVOLUTION (Cl. 9, 41) (1860283) (CA)	0.00	673.96	673.96
077376.1147	TM: NPG (IC 9, 14, 15, 21, 25) (AU)	71.00	0.00	71.00
077376.1152	TM: PRINCE (IC 9, 14, 15, 21, 25, 41) (AU)	18.00	830.00	848.00
077376.1155	TM: Prince (IC 9) (Refiled) (CN)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1161	TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (BR)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1162	TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (BR)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1163	TM: PURPLE RAIN (IC 9) (BR)	54.00	594.32	648.32
077376.1164	TM: NPG (IC 9) (CA)	490.00	0.00	490.00
077376.1165	TM: PURPLE RAIN (IC 9) (CA)	168.00	0.00	168.00
077376.1169	TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (MX)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1170	TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (MX)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1171	TM: PURPLE RAIN (IC 9) (MX)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1179	TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (TH)	144.00	0.00	144.00
077376.1206	TM: NPG (IC 9) (ZA)	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.1216	THE PRINCE ESTATE (87700341) (Cl. 25) (US)	174.50	375.00	549.50
077376.1245	TM: THE PURPLE ONE (17922017) (IC 9, 41) (EM)	0.00	551.31	551.31
077376.1260	TM: NEW POWER GENERATION (3341510) (Class 3341510) (GB)	18.00	449.28	467.28
077376.1261	TM: NPG (Class 9) (CN)	72.00	0.00	72.00
077376.1262	TM: PURPLE COLOR MARK (Classes 9, 41) (US)	283.50	0.00	283.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

<u>Matter #</u>	<u>Matter Name</u>	<u>Current Fees</u>	<u>Current Disb</u>	<u>Matter Total</u>
077376.1263	TM: CLOUD (App. No. 88141856) (Class 15) (US)	1,317.00	0.00	1,317.00
077376.1264	TM: CLOUD GUITAR CONFIGURATION (Class 15) (US)	839.50	0.00	839.50
077376.1265	TM: APOLLONIA 6 (Class 9) (App. No. 88145070) (US)	525.00	0.00	525.00
077376.1267	TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (JP)	36.00	2,588.00	2,624.00
077376.1268	TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (Refiled 2018) (CN)	0.00	1,630.00	1,630.00
077376.1269	TM: LOVE SYMBOL GUITAR (Class 15) (US)	101.00	0.00	101.00
077376.1271	TM: JAMIE STARR (Class 41) (US)	520.50	0.00	520.50
077376.1272	TM: PAISLEY PARK (App. No. 88220053) (Class 43) (US)	31.00	0.00	31.00
077376.1274	TM: VANITY 6 (86984309) (Class 9) (US)	1,562.00	0.00	1,562.00
077376.2013	Dispute with [REDACTED]	18.00	0.00	18.00
077376.2014	Dispute with [REDACTED]	228.00	0.00	228.00
077376.2032	Dispute with [REDACTED]	991.00	400.00	1,391.00
077376.2034	Dispute with [REDACTED]	216.00	0.00	216.00
077376.2035	Dispute with [REDACTED]	1,155.00	0.00	1,155.00
077376.2037	Dispute with [REDACTED]	210.00	0.00	210.00
077376.2038	Dispute with [REDACTED]	260.00	0.00	260.00
077376.2045	Dispute with [REDACTED]	5,489.50	450.00	5,939.50
077376.2046	Dispute with [REDACTED]	108.00	0.00	108.00
077376.2048	Opposition of THE PURPLE VISION (3307979) (GB)	0.00	440.18	440.18
077376.2056	[REDACTED]	617.00	0.00	617.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

**INVOICE DETAIL**

**Grand Total** **384,186.81**

*Payment is due within 30 days from receipt of invoice*

If you have any questions please email [accounting@fredlaw.com](mailto:accounting@fredlaw.com)  
or contact a client representative at 612.492.7574

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
[www.fredlaw.com](http://www.fredlaw.com)  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 6

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0001  
**Regarding:** Estate Administration

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/01/19	J. Cassioppi	Meet with archiver at Paisley Park regarding [REDACTED]	0.70	325.50
03/04/19	E. Unger	Draft letter to court responding to attorney fee submission.	0.40	166.00
03/04/19	J. Taylor	Upload document to data site.	0.10	25.00
03/04/19	M. Greiner	Review PRN email correspondence; conference with attorneys regarding litigation matters and administration of estate; correspondence with A. Aycok.	0.90	607.50
03/05/19	M. Greiner	Conferences with attorneys regarding estate administration and status update on litigation, [REDACTED] project and ongoing matters.	0.60	405.00
03/06/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Conference regarding accounting; emails and conference regarding setting up assets; attention to accounting.	0.30	154.50
03/06/19	M. Greiner	Correspondence with client regarding estate administration matters.	0.70	472.50
03/07/19	J. Cassioppi	Provide litigation update for Comerica.	0.30	139.50
03/08/19	J. Taylor	Upload document to data site.	0.10	25.00
03/08/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] correspondence with client regarding same.	0.30	202.50
03/11/19	E. Unger	Review multiple court orders including order to show cause and order for refund of commissions.	0.20	83.00
03/11/19	J. Cassioppi	Review court orders and email correspondence regarding the same.	0.20	93.00
03/11/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review PRN email correspondence; review various orders filed by the court; email correspondence with Comerica	0.60	309.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 7  
Matter No: 077376.0001

		regarding same.		
03/11/19	M. Greiner	Conference with paralegal regarding UCC searches; telephone conference with A. Aycock and A. Bruce; telephone conference with [REDACTED] (actual time was 3.3)	1.80	1,215.00
03/12/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Conference with A. Aycock, A. Bruce and M. Greiner regarding estate administration.	0.50	257.50
03/12/19	M. Greiner	Conference with A. Aycock and A. Bruce regarding estate administration matters; conference regarding heirs meeting.	0.90	607.50
03/13/19	E. Unger	Rescheduling hearings for April; coordinate service of all Heirs' attorneys with court's order.	0.90	373.50
03/14/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorneys regarding status updates; correspondence to A. Aycock and A. Bruce.	0.70	472.50
03/15/19	A. Gyurisin	Prepare Interim Accounting through January 31, 2019.	1.00	235.00
03/18/19	J. Taylor	Upload document to data site.	0.10	25.00
03/19/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney regarding estate administration.	0.30	202.50
03/21/19	L. Brunner	Office conference regarding annual accounts.	0.20	64.00
03/21/19	M. Greiner	Attention to administration of estate; correspondence with client; conference with attorney.	0.70	472.50
03/25/19	J. Taylor	Upload document to data site.	0.10	25.00
03/27/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review and revise amendment to entertainment advisor agreement.	0.70	360.50
03/27/19	M. Greiner	Review court filing; telephone conference with A. Aycock.	0.80	540.00
03/29/19	A. Gyurisin	Prepare the interim accounting from 2/1/2018 through 1/31/19.	3.00	705.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 8  
Matter No: 077376.0001

Total for Fees: 8,563.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/05/19	Federal Express	35.94
03/13/19	Federal Express	18.21
03/19/19	Prof Serv Metro Legal Services, Inc. - 3164206 - Obtain certified copies from courthouse and deliver to closing.	104.00
	eDiscovery Hosting Fee	2,175.00
	MN E-File - Electronic Filing / Service Fee	564.00
	Research via Westlaw	602.00

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 3,499.15

Total This Matter: 12,062.65

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 9

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0003  
**Regarding:** Second Special Administrator Matters

03/11/19	J. Cassioppi	Telephone conference regarding discovery in connection with UMG matter; review court UMG order and email correspondence regarding the same.	0.40	186.00
03/18/19	J. Cassioppi	Telephone conference with P. Gleekel regarding discovery in Jobu and Estate matters. Status and email correspondence regarding the same.	0.40	186.00

**Total for Fees:** 372.00

**Total This Matter:** 372.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 10

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0006  
**Regarding:** Heirs, Heirs' Counsel, Heirs' Advisors and Mediator Matters

03/04/19	J. Cassioppi	Review list received [REDACTED] and email correspondence regarding the same; edit letter re: J. Bruntjen filing.	0.30	139.50
03/05/19	M. Greiner	Review correspondence to counsel for G. Walker; conference with attorney; correspondence with client.	0.30	202.50
03/08/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney regarding agenda items for heirs meeting.	0.20	135.00
03/11/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney.	0.30	202.50
03/12/19	J. Taylor	Fact gathering regarding lien searches; obtain lien searches.	0.50	125.00
03/12/19	M. Greiner	Telephone conference with [REDACTED] conference with K. Steinert.	0.40	270.00
03/14/19	J. Taylor	Review and analysis of lien search results.	2.00	500.00
03/15/19	J. Taylor	Review and analysis of lien search results.	1.80	450.00
03/21/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence with J. Herbsman regarding access to HighQ; attention to restoring J. Herbsman's access to HighQ.	0.20	93.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 11  
Matter No: 077376.0006

Total for Fees: 2,117.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/14/19	Unisearch, Inc. - 140319/112 - Lien searches in Minnesota, Missouri, New York and Texas for Tyka E. Nelson, Norrine P. Nelson, Sharon L. Nelson, John R. Nelson, Omarr J. Baker and Alfred Jackson	522.50
----------	--	--------

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 522.50

Total This Matter: 2,640.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 12

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0008  
**Regarding:** [REDACTED]

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/14/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review letter [REDACTED] conference with L. Linne regarding response [REDACTED]	1.00	515.00
03/14/19	L. Lindenfelser	Locate information requested by K. Steinert [REDACTED]	0.30	90.00
03/15/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review information [REDACTED] email to Comerica regarding same; conferences with L. Linne regarding same.	1.20	618.00
03/15/19	L. Linne	Prepare [REDACTED]	1.70	663.00
03/18/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Attention to response [REDACTED]	0.80	412.00
03/18/19	L. Linne	Prepare response [REDACTED]	2.20	858.00
03/19/19	A. Gyurisin	Format and change the passwords on two flash drives for real estate documents. (No Charge)	0.30	70.50
03/19/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Conference regarding [REDACTED]	0.70	360.50
03/19/19	L. Linne	Prepare response [REDACTED]	4.90	1,911.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered  
as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn:  
Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 13  
Matter No: 077376.0008

03/20/19	L. Linne	Revise letters	1.10	429.00
03/21/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review and revise letters	1.00	515.00
03/21/19	L. Linne	and response to same. Review and revise letters	1.60	624.00
03/21/19	S. Nelson	Confer with L. Linné regarding	0.50	362.50

Total for Fees: 7,358.00

Total This Matter: 7,358.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 14

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0100  
**Regarding:** Employment

03/05/19	I. Culp	Draft Amendment [REDACTED] [REDACTED] exchange emails with A. Aycock regarding same.	1.00	560.00
03/06/19	I. Culp	Review revisions to agreement; exchange emails with A. Aycock regarding same.	0.20	112.00

**Total for Fees:** 672.00

**Total This Matter:** 672.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 15

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0200  
**Regarding:** Real Estate

03/05/19	M. Greiner	Review correspondence [REDACTED]; correspondence regarding land held by L4OA.	0.20	135.00
03/06/19	J. Cassioppi	Telephone conference with Comerica regarding status of Galpin.	0.30	139.50
03/15/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney.	0.30	202.50

**Total for Fees:** 477.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/30/19	Courier Service Platinum Courier - 31374 - Courier Delivery 3/19/19 to North American Title	46.90
03/31/19	Courier Service Pro Courier, Inc. - 80369 - Delivery to North American Title Co.	20.62

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 67.52

**Total This Matter:** 544.52

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 16

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0205  
**Regarding:** Galpin Blvd. Real Estate

03/04/19	L. Lindenfelser	Office conference regarding closing matters; begin working on closing preparations.	0.40	120.00
03/04/19	M. Ranum	Telephone conference G. Snover regarding closing documents.	0.20	129.00
03/05/19	L. Lindenfelser	Continue work on closing preparations; review email from title company; further email regarding closing matter.	0.80	240.00
03/07/19	L. Lindenfelser	Attention to closing preparations; respond to email from title.	0.30	90.00
03/08/19	L. Lindenfelser	Finalize seller closing documents; email to parties regarding the same; obtain current information regarding well; email regarding the same; email regarding additional information needed; respond to email from closer.	0.90	270.00
03/08/19	M. Ranum	Telephone conference G. Snover regarding city approval [REDACTED] [REDACTED] office conference regarding closing documents.	0.50	322.50
03/11/19	B. O'Malley	Review correspondence received from examiner of titles regarding option.	0.10	33.50
03/11/19	L. Lindenfelser	Review emails from [REDACTED] and closer regarding closing documents; review updated commitment; revise deed to incorporate new legal description and address for tax statements; email to parties regarding same; email to [REDACTED] regarding well status; review closing documents prepared by title company; office conference regarding matters; draft	1.80	540.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 17  
Matter No: 077376.0205

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/11/19	M. Ranum	email to client regarding execution of deed; further email correspondence with title company regarding closing matters. Email to [REDACTED] email deed to clients; office conference regarding examiner's request.	0.50	322.50
03/12/19	B. O'Malley	Correspondence examiner of titles regarding option.	0.10	33.50
03/12/19	L. Lindenfelser	Email exchange with [REDACTED] regarding closing matters; letter to [REDACTED] forwarding original signed deed for approvals.	0.30	90.00
03/12/19	M. Ranum	Telephone conference [REDACTED] telephone conferences G. Snover; meet with A. Bruce to execute deed; office conference regarding same.	1.10	709.50
03/13/19	L. Lindenfelser	Attention to closing matters.	0.20	60.00
03/14/19	L. Brunner	Office conference regarding court document for real estate closing; prepare correspondence to probate court ordering certified copy of Letters of General Administration.	0.30	96.00
03/14/19	L. Lindenfelser	Contact closer to discuss status; review [REDACTED] telephone conference with G. Snover to discuss same and other closing matters; email to G. Snover forward documents for review; email correspondence regarding same; conduct additional research [REDACTED] finalize closing documents; email to A. Bruce regarding same.	2.20	660.00
03/14/19	M. Ranum	Telephone conference G. Snover regarding closing issues.	0.30	193.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 18  
Matter No: 077376.0205

03/15/19	L. Brunner	Arrange for delivery of copy request to Carver County Probate Court.	0.20	64.00
03/15/19	L. Lindenfelser	Telephone conference with [REDACTED] regarding closing matters and delay in obtaining City approval of lot split; review emails from [REDACTED]; review email from client regarding closing documents.	0.60	180.00
03/15/19	M. Ranum	Telephone conference [REDACTED] regarding closing; telephone conferences G. Snover; telephone conference [REDACTED]; revise second amendment.	1.10	709.50
03/17/19	L. Lindenfelser	Attention to closing preparations.	0.30	90.00
03/18/19	L. Brunner	Arrange for messenger to pick up certified Letters from probate court and deliver to North American Title Company; office conference regarding same and closing on sale of real estate.	0.60	192.00
03/18/19	L. Lindenfelser	Draft seller's escrow closing instructions; multiple telephone conferences and email exchanges with [REDACTED] regarding closing matters; review revised settlement statement; email to G. Snover regarding the same; office conference regarding closing matters; provide legal description for overall parcel; email to A. Bruce regarding additional documents to be signed; telephone conference with L. Brunner regarding certified letters; telephone conferences with Department of Health Hydrologist, Minnesota Geological Survey department and well drilling company in effort to obtain additional regarding status and location of wells; review material received from different resources; revise option amendment; email regarding the same; revise closing	4.80	1,440.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 19  
Matter No: 077376.0205

		instructions; review further revised settlement statement; email to G. Snover regarding the same.		
03/18/19	M. Ranum	Revise second amendment to option agreement; email regarding well issue; email second amendment; telephone conferences G. Snover; revise same; email to [REDACTED] office conferences regarding closing; revise second amendment; email to [REDACTED]	2.80	1,806.00
03/19/19	L. Lindenfelser	Multiple telephone conferences and email exchanges with closer regarding closing matters; add well information to each certificate; assemble and closing package to title company; review revisions to settlement statement; email and telephone conference with G. Snover regarding same; email to examiner forward fully executed second amendment to option agreement; email exchanges regarding examiner approval; attend other closing details.	2.20	660.00
03/19/19	M. Ranum	Office conference and email [REDACTED]; telephone conference with G. Snover; email to [REDACTED]	0.40	258.00
03/20/19	L. Lindenfelser	Email exchanges and telephone conference with [REDACTED] regarding revised directive and recording matters; organize documents for proofbooks.	0.60	180.00
03/21/19	L. Lindenfelser	Review email from G. Snover regarding parcel questions and respond to same.	0.30	90.00
03/22/19	L. Lindenfelser	Review email from G. Snover.	0.10	30.00
03/25/19	L. Lindenfelser	Review email from G. Snover regarding property matters.	0.10	30.00
03/27/19	M. Ranum	Telephone conference G. Snover regarding issues related to Chanhassen.	0.40	258.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 20  
Matter No: 077376.0205

Total for Fees: 9,897.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/20/19	Prof Serv North American Title Company - 077376.0205 - Directive Payment Reimbursement	500.00
----------	---	--------

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 500.00

Total This Matter: 10,397.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484



# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 22  
Matter No: 077376.0300

03/18/19	J. Bernu	Draft Notice of Change of Registered Office for Paisley Park Retail, Inc.	0.20	37.00
03/20/19	J. Bernu	Attention to filing Notice of Change of Registered Office with the Minnesota Secretary of State for Paisley Park Retail, Inc.	0.10	18.50
03/21/19	J. Bernu	Receive and organize filed Notice of Change of Registered Office for Paisley Park Retail, Inc.	0.10	18.50

**Total for Fees: 1,446.50**

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	Karen Sandler Steinert - Filing Fees - Filing fee for entity reinstatement for PRN Estate	45.00
03/20/19	Prof Serv Unisearch, Inc. - 200319/120 - State and vendor fees for CT statutory representation in MN and filing change of registered agent for Paisley Park Retail, Inc.	145.00

**Total For Costs and Other Charges: 190.00**

**Total This Matter: 1,636.50**

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 23

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0303  
**Regarding:** Paisley Park Enterprises, Inc.

03/15/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review equipment contract; telephone conference with A. Aycock regarding same.	0.50	257.50
----------	------------------------	--	------	--------

**Total for Fees:** 257.50

**Total This Matter:** 257.50

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 24

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0402  
**Regarding:** Bergonzi Litigation

02/07/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding status of efforts to connect with decision-makers at Warner Chappell.	0.10	64.00
03/04/19	L. Friedemann	Email to T. Carter and J. Boyarski regarding Warner Chappell.	0.10	64.00
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with J. Boyarski and T. Carter regarding Warner Chappell.	0.10	64.00

**Total for Fees:** 192.00

**Total This Matter:** 192.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 25

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0403  
**Regarding:** Brandon Litigation

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/01/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review filings from Florida action and new New York filings; confer regarding [REDACTED] discuss [REDACTED]	2.80	966.00
03/01/19	L. Friedemann	Review new lawsuit filed by James Brandon; emails regarding same; consider strategy; confer regarding letter to Brandon's counsel demanding withdrawal of the lawsuit and needed research in connection with same; telephone conference with M. Nelles regarding new lawsuit.	1.80	1,152.00
03/02/19	L. Friedemann	Review draft letter to Brandon's counsel demanding withdrawal of lawsuit; emails with A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding same.	0.40	256.00
03/03/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with J. Boyarski regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	128.00
03/04/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review communications about lawsuit; review letter to opposing counsel from attorney M. Nelles.	0.40	138.00
03/04/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with M. Nelles and J. Boyarski regarding newly filed lawsuit and letter responding to same.	0.20	128.00
03/06/19	L. Friedemann	Send email update to A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding lawsuit filed in New York; consider case strategy and recommended approach.	0.50	320.00
03/07/19	A. Rondoni	Confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	69.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 26  
Matter No: 077376.0403

03/07/19	Tavernier L. Friedemann	[REDACTED] Consider case strategy; confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.60	384.00
03/08/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Confer [REDACTED]	0.20	69.00
03/08/19	L. Friedemann	Telephone conference with M. Nelles regarding case strategy; emails regarding engagement of local counsel; confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.70	448.00
03/12/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Research [REDACTED] research [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer regarding strategy of [REDACTED] research [REDACTED]	4.60	1,587.00
03/12/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	320.00
03/13/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Begin [REDACTED] attend strategy call with local counsel.	4.40	1,518.00
03/13/19	L. Friedemann	Telephone conference with local counsel in Manhattan, provide background information and confer regarding strategy; send email to A. Bruce and A. Aycock recommending next steps.	1.00	640.00
03/14/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	[REDACTED]; communicate with opposing counsel to set up time to meet and discuss lawsuit; review	4.70	1,621.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 27  
Matter No: 077376.0403

		communications with local counsel.		
03/14/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review and revise engagement letter for local counsel.	0.40	206.00
03/14/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with M. Tricarico regarding engagement as local counsel.	0.20	128.00
03/15/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Continue drafting [REDACTED].	0.60	207.00
03/15/19	L. Friedemann	Accept service of Summons and Complaint on behalf of Comerica; review Notice of Initial Pretrial Conference and confirm docketing of deadlines; confer regarding registration on ECF; emails with local counsel regarding engagement.	0.40	256.00
03/16/19	L. Friedemann	Review response from Brandon's counsel [REDACTED]	0.30	192.00
03/18/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review and analyze letter from opposing counsel responding to arguments regarding the merits of the suit, [REDACTED] [REDACTED] read cases cited in opposing counsel's letter; research [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer regarding strategy for call with opposing counsel addressing merits for the suit; prepare for and attend call with opposing counsel [REDACTED] [REDACTED] attend call with Florida counsel M. Nelles discussing case strategy.	5.30	1,828.50
03/18/19	L. Friedemann	Analyze arguments advanced by Mr. Brandon's New York counsel; telephone conference with Mr. Brandon's counsel	3.10	1,984.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 28  
Matter No: 077376.0403

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		regarding deadline for response to lawsuit and legal flaws in lawsuit; send email update to A. Bruce and A. Aycock; email to local counsel in Florida case about [REDACTED]		
		[REDACTED] telephone conference with M. Nelles regarding strategy.		
03/19/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Create Rule 7.1 disclosure and send for filing; review filings including letter regarding extension of time to respond to the complaint; strategize regarding letter to opposing counsel outlining deficiency of action.	0.80	276.00
03/19/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with M. Tricarico regarding letter brief concerning deadline to respond to Complaint; review same; review and edit Rule 7.1 disclosure statement.	0.30	192.00
03/20/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review communications regarding case status and strategy; begin outlining issues for letter to opposing counsel.	0.60	207.00
03/20/19	L. Friedemann	Consider proposed strategy regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	192.00
03/21/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Compose letter to D. Ludwig regarding motion to dismiss.	1.40	483.00
03/22/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Draft and finalize letter to D. Ludwig regarding motion to dismiss lawsuit and [REDACTED]	1.70	586.50
03/22/19	L. Friedemann	Edit and circulate draft letter to Brandon's NY counsel encouraging withdrawal of the action and providing authorities.	0.20	128.00
03/26/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review affidavits to be filed with pro hac vice motions.	0.30	103.50
03/26/19	L. Friedemann	Email with M. Tricarico regarding pro hac vice applications.	0.10	64.00
03/28/19	L. Friedemann	Finalize letter to Plaintiff's counsel regarding defects in newly-filed NY	0.10	64.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 29  
Matter No: 077376.0403

03/29/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	lawsuit. Review local rules regarding pro hac vice motions; review correspondence regarding letter to counsel for plaintiff; assist with finalizing affidavits for pro hac vice motions.	0.60	207.00
----------	-------------------------	---	------	--------

**Total for Fees: 17,049.00**

### Costs and Other Charges

03/19/19	Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Filing Fees - Certificate of Good Standing for Pro Hac Vice in SDNY	53.15
03/19/19	Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Filing Fees - Certificate of Good Standing Fee for Pro Hav Vice SDNY	53.15
	Research via Westlaw	198.00

**Total For Costs and Other Charges: 304.30**

**Total This Matter: 17,353.30**

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 30

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0409  
**Regarding:** George Ian Boxill Litigation

03/01/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Confer regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; call [REDACTED] confer regarding [REDACTED]	1.50	517.50
03/01/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding correspondence from RMA and Deliverance regarding depositions.	0.20	107.00
03/01/19	L. Friedemann	Consider response to RMA proposal regarding deposition location and expense; emails regarding suggested response.	0.80	512.00
03/04/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Confer regarding deposition scheduling and review communications regarding depositions of RMA, Bransford, and Deliverance.	0.50	172.50
03/04/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to correspondence regarding depositions and subpoenas; confer regarding discovery status.	0.40	214.00
03/04/19	J. Cassioppi	Strategize regarding status and next steps; develop case plan for I. Boxill matter; review filings in preparation for status meeting.	0.60	279.00
03/04/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Conference regarding status.	0.30	154.50
03/04/19	L. Friedemann	Meeting to discuss strategy [REDACTED] [REDACTED] emails [REDACTED]	1.20	768.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 31  
Matter No: 077376.0409

03/04/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney.	0.50	337.50
03/04/19	S. Lee	Update deposition scheduling chart and discovery log.	0.50	115.00
03/05/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Read and analyze orders on sanctions and motion to compel Sidebar; communicate with third parties regarding outstanding document subpoenas; designate documents for use in summary judgment and depositions.	4.00	1,380.00
03/05/19	G. Fairbairn	Analyze orders on motion for sanctions and motion to compel Sidebar; attention to deposition preparation chart.	1.00	535.00
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Analyze orders granting motion for sanctions due to spoliation of evidence and to compel discovery from Sidebar Legal; emails to A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding same; arrange for service as required under Sidebar order.	1.30	832.00
03/05/19	S. Lee	Update case calendar with new or revised deadlines. Update categories of database documents for team review.	0.50	115.00
03/05/19	T. O'Shea	Review the Court's Order granting motion for sanctions against RMA, Staley, and Wilson due to the destruction of text messages. (No Charge)	0.30	145.50
03/06/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review communications regarding scheduling depositions; prepare documentation for Rogers & Cowan deposition; communicate with third parties regarding outstanding document subpoenas; confer regarding final discovery strategy and set up for summary judgment; compose email to Nandy McClean regarding upcoming depositions.	3.10	1,069.50
03/06/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to correspondence from Defendants regarding depositions and	0.50	267.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 32  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/06/19	L. Friedemann	confer regarding scheduling for both sides; confer regarding additional witnesses for depositions. Review California Corporations Code requirements for service on Sidebar Legal, P.C. pursuant to Magistrate Judge Leung's Order; edit service letters and oversee service on Sidebar Legal pursuant to Magistrate Judge Leung's order; emails with D. Perlman and deposition witnesses regarding deposition scheduling.	1.00	640.00
03/07/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Confer regarding strategy for depositions and summary judgment; finalize claim chart; [REDACTED]; review requests for admission and analyze against privilege log for any improperly withheld documents; begin preparing for McClean depositions by reviewing pertinent documents.	5.80	2,001.00
03/07/19	G. Fairbairn	Prepare for and attend meeting to discuss deposition planning and assignments; attention to correspondence with Defendants regarding privilege logs; analyze discovery responses from Defendants for potential follow-on discovery requests; research Sidebar and M. Wilson for current status; confer regarding service of subpoena and order on M. Wilson and the California Secretary of State.	1.30	695.50
03/07/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding discovery strategy and assignments for remainder of fact discovery period; email and telephone conference with counsel for Rogers & Cowan regarding deposition of Lori Lousararian; provide exhibits identified	2.00	1,280.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 33  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/07/19	S. Lee	thus far for Rule 30(b)(6) deposition of RMA and Deliverance, LLC; [REDACTED] confer regarding improperly withheld document. Update deposition scheduling and preparation status chart. Attend team meeting. Update document production and collections log. Execute searches in databases and update Case Issues chart. Recap meeting notes and circulate to team.	2.90	667.00
03/08/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review communications regarding deposition scheduling; [REDACTED] [REDACTED] begin collecting documents for Deliverance and RMA depositions.	1.50	517.50
03/08/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to correspondence regarding new deposition dates; update case deadlines and assignments to reflect changes to the schedule; analyze proof chart in preparation for depositions; attention to correspondence regarding deposition witnesses and preparation.	1.20	642.00
03/08/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with witnesses and opposing counsel regarding deposition scheduling; confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.80	512.00
03/08/19	S. Lee	Create review folders for possible deposition materials. Communication with team regarding same.	0.20	46.00
03/10/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to correspondence and subpoenas for depositions.	0.20	107.00
03/11/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Arrange for production of files from BRDDG, LLC; prepare for depositions of M. and N. McClean; begin preparing	3.40	1,173.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 34  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		affidavit of attorneys' fees in connection with order granting sanctions.		
03/11/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding deposition preparation and dates.	0.30	160.50
03/11/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding production of documents from BRDDG.	0.10	64.00
03/11/19	S. Lee	Prepare production of text messages from Defendants. Collect materials for possible use at deposition and witness preparation meetings regarding same. Search for confidentiality agreements.	1.00	230.00
03/11/19	T. Klukow	Locate confidentiality agreement information related to McClean sisters.	0.20	47.00
03/12/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Pull documents for RMA/Deliverance depositions; communicate with third parties regarding outstanding document subpoenas; confer regarding scheduling Los Angeles depositions; conduct initial review of documents produced by BRDDG, LLC and segregate significant documents for future use; confer regarding locations for LA depositions and contact Arnold Porter for arranging logistics.	4.50	1,552.50
03/12/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to deposition subpoenas; analyze new text messages and deficiency letter to RMA.	0.60	321.00
03/12/19	L. Friedemann	Review key document produced by BRDDG; confer regarding letter to RMA counsel regarding text messages; review and approve same; emails with Rogers & Cowan counsel regarding deposition of L. Lousarian.	0.70	448.00
03/12/19	S. Lee	Search for and collect documents for possible use at deposition or witness deposition preparation meetings. Update document collection and production log.	1.00	230.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 35  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/13/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Update and serve deposition notices and subpoenas for Deliverance, RMA, and L. Lousararian; conduct initial review of documents produced by Ditto Music; read and analyze Ditto Music's objections to document requests; assist with preparation of deposition binders; confer regarding creation of fee request affidavit in connection with spoliation sanctions; review and analyze communications regarding unproduced text messages from RMA employees and "contractors".	3.50	1,207.50
03/13/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to correspondence regarding RMA's response regarding text messages from its staff; analyze objections to subpoena from Ditto Music and discussion regarding document production; attention to deposition correspondence.	0.90	481.50
03/13/19	L. Friedemann	Create chart of work performed for motion to compel and for sanctions for fee submission and confer regarding completion of same; emails with D. Perlman regarding non-production of text messages from RMA independent contractors.	1.90	1,216.00
03/13/19	S. Lee	Collect files for upcoming depositions. Communication with team regarding same. Download third party production files. Communication with Litigation Support and Team regarding same.	1.80	414.00
03/13/19	T. O'Shea	Review email string regarding RMA's efforts to collect text messages from its purported independent contractors; Confer with L. Friedemann regarding the same.	0.20	97.00
03/14/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Organize documents for depositions for RMA, Deliverance, and L. Lousararian	2.60	897.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 36  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/14/19	G. Fairbairn	depositions; work on logistics for conducting same; confer regarding strategy for L. Lousararian deposition. Confer regarding discovery deadline, RMA text messages, Sidebar's responses and timing of depositions, preparation for depositions and assignments; confer regarding preparation for Rogers & Cowen and McClean depositions; gather materials for deposition preparation.	1.50	802.50
03/14/19	L. Friedemann	Consider strategy with respect to upcoming fact discovery deadline and discovery issues that may not yet be resolved; make plan for covering depositions and preparation; confer regarding issues to address in preparation sessions.	1.00	640.00
03/15/19	Litigation Support Consulting	Evaluate production format for completeness for subpoena response from BRDDG.	3.00	585.00
03/15/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Organize internal and third party productions for final production of documents to defendants; draft fee affidavit arising out of sanctions award, including calculation of hours, hourly rates, and total cost for motion to compel and motion for sanctions due to spoliation; confer regarding document use in RMA/Deliverance deposition.	5.40	1,863.00
03/15/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Respond to communications from opposing counsel regarding unproduced text messages; confer regarding defendants' assertion of lack of control over independent contractors' text messages.	0.40	138.00
03/15/19	G. Fairbairn	Analyze correspondence from RMA	0.30	160.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 37  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/15/19	L. Friedemann	regarding contractors and text messages; develop strategy for response.	0.30	192.00
03/15/19	L. Friedemann	Consider potential exhibits for RMA and Deliverance deposition and designations under protective order.	2.10	1,344.00
03/15/19	S. Lee	Analyze counsel's response regarding failure to preserve and produce text messages from RMA's Drew Small and confer regarding response to same; edit declaration supporting award of attorney's fees incurred in connection with Defendants' spoliation of evidence; edit draft email to K. Hartley regarding additional spoliation concerns and send same.	3.10	713.00
03/17/19	G. Fairbairn	Update production and collection log. Communication with team regarding document collections. Attention to document review and upcoming production. Collect and prepare materials for upcoming depositions. Review productions received from third parties. Update collection of files for possible upcoming production. Communication with Litigation Support regarding file type issues in third party productions.	0.40	214.00
03/18/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Continue gathering information for upcoming deposition preparation sessions; review deadlines and assignments for end of fact discovery period.	2.80	966.00
		Oversee and organize logistics for final document production; prepare for depositions in California by organizing documents and arranging logistics; communicate with opposing counsel regarding unproduced text messages;		

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 38  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/18/19	G. Fairbairn	strategize on [REDACTED] Analyze new documents from BRDDG production; confer regarding potential deposition; confer regarding text message discovery; arrange deposition preparation sessions for A. Wessberg and K. Johnson; attention to correspondence with T. Guy; continue gathering potential exhibits for deposition prep sessions.	2.50	1,337.50
03/18/19	J. Cassioppi	Strategize regarding discovery motion.	0.20	93.00
03/18/19	L. Friedemann	Review RMA's response regarding collection of text messages from former independent contractors and consider strategy; edit and finalize response.	1.30	832.00
03/18/19	L. Friedemann	Review hot documents from BRDDG production and consider [REDACTED]	0.50	320.00
03/18/19	S. Lee	Organize client data for upcoming production. Review Third Party files in response to document subpoenas and prepare for production. Communication with Litigation Support regarding same. Collect materials for possible use at upcoming depositions. Communication with team regarding issues with data file formats and follow up needed.	3.20	736.00
03/19/19	Litigation Support Consulting	Process and load non-client productions into case database.	1.00	195.00
03/19/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review documents produced by Ditto, Inc. and BRDDG; communicate with counsel for BRDDG regarding document production issue; oversee and finalize production of third party documents; prepare for deposition of L. Lousararian by	6.50	2,242.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 39  
Matter No: 077376.0409

03/19/19	G. Fairbairn	finalizing document set. Attention to communications with BRDDG regarding scrambled text message and Defendants' counsel regarding our latest document production; continue gathering materials for depositions.	0.50	267.50
03/19/19	L. Friedemann	Email to K. Hartley regarding witnesses for Rule 30(b)(6) deposition of RMA and Deliverance, LLC; confer regarding exhibits for Rule 30(b)(6) deposition.	0.60	384.00
03/19/19	S. Lee	Revise and finalize attorney notebooks with possible depo materials for use at upcoming depositions. [REDACTED] [REDACTED] Review	4.60	1,058.00
03/20/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	and finalize data sets for outgoing production. Communication with team and Litigation Support regarding same. Prepare for deposition of RMA by assisting with organizing documents and preparing documents for use; draft outline for Lousarian deposition; review motion to compel inspection of document; respond to communications from BRDDG counsel about BRDDG documents; respond to communications from opposing counsel about unproduced text messages.	6.50	2,242.50
03/20/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding text message discovery; analyze motion to compel from Defendants regarding original contract.	0.70	374.50
03/20/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence regarding fee affidavit and response to motion regarding discovery.	0.20	93.00
03/20/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding game plan for L. Lousarian and M. McClean depositions.	0.60	384.00
03/20/19	L. Friedemann	Edit declaration supporting fee request	0.20	128.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 40  
Matter No: 077376.0409

03/20/19	L. Friedemann	and confer regarding same. Analyze RMA motion to compel production of original Confidentiality Agreement for forensic inspection.	0.40	256.00
03/21/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Read and analyze Defendants' motion to compel inspection of the Confidentiality Agreement; confer regarding strategic response to motion; compose email to opposing counsel regarding motion; continue preparing for depositions, including drafting deposition outline of L. Lousarian.	8.10	2,794.50
03/21/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Finalize affidavit of attorneys' fees; respond to opposing counsel email regarding unproduced text messages from RMA employees.	0.10	34.50
03/21/19	G. Fairbairn	Continue analyzing motion to compel from Defendants regarding original contract; confer regarding opposition brief and timing; attention to correspondence with Defendants regarding meet-and-confer requirement and text message discovery; confer regarding change to T. Bransford deposition date and coverage; [REDACTED]	5.70	3,049.50
03/21/19	L. Friedemann	Consider arguments and strategy for brief in opposition to motion to compel inspection of original confidentiality agreement; telephone conference regarding same; edit email to RMA [REDACTED]	2.00	1,280.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 41  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/21/19	S. Lee	counsel proposing resolution of dispute; email to A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding motion and recommended approach; prepare for deposition of RMA/Deliverance, LLC.	0.70	161.00
03/22/19	Litigation Support Consulting	Collect additional materials for upcoming depositions. Communication with team regarding same.	1.00	195.00
03/22/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Copy case productions/case files to media.	6.60	2,277.00
03/22/19	G. Fairbairn	Prepare for depositions of L. Lousararian and RMA/Deliverance by organizing and finalizing all documents, [REDACTED]; draft outline for deposition of M. McClean; communicate with opposing counsel regarding request for inspection of original Confidentiality Agreement; assist with preparation of response to motion to compel inspection of the original Confidentiality Agreement, including pulling exhibits, locating and summarizing research [REDACTED] and beginning motion document drafts.	7.10	3,798.50
		Attention to correspondence regarding Defendants' collection of text messages; attention to correspondence from Defendants' counsel regarding proposed stipulation to expand number of experts to three to account for Defendants' desire to conduct a forensic investigation on Boxill's Indemnification Agreement; attention to continued correspondence regarding Defendants' motion to compel; analyze		

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 42  
Matter No: 077376.0409

		research [REDACTED] [REDACTED] begin drafting memorandum in opposition to Defendants' motion to compel; gather materials for fact section of opposition brief; analyze [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] analyze [REDACTED]		
		correspond with T. Guy regarding deposition preparation; telephone call with T. Bransford regarding deposition preparation; correspond with D. Crosby regarding Bransford deposition.		
03/22/19	L. Friedemann	Continue to analyze and select exhibits for deposition of RMA/Deliverance; confer regarding arguments for opposition to motion to compel inspection of original Confidentiality Agreement.	1.60	1,024.00
03/22/19	S. Lee	Update and finalize collections of materials for use at upcoming depositions. Communication with team regarding same.	3.90	897.00
03/22/19	T. Klukow	Update discovery and production logs to reflect recent discovery activity for third-party productions and collection and production of party materials; Locate and gather documents and information for upcoming depositions.	2.90	681.50
03/23/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Gather, review, and finalize printed documentation to be used in Lousarian deposition.	0.50	172.50
03/23/19	G. Fairbairn	Continue analyzing research on collateral estoppel effect of arbitration awards; continue drafting memorandum in opposition to Defendants' motion to	3.00	1,605.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 43  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/24/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	compel; continue gathering materials for fact section of opposition brief; [REDACTED]	7.50	2,587.50
03/24/19	G. Fairbairn	Travel to Los Angeles for depositions; prepare for Lousararian deposition by organizing documents, amending deposition outline, and preparing for possible re-direct topics; assist with response to motion to compel inspection of document by researching [REDACTED]	2.50	1,337.50
03/24/19	L. Friedemann	Continue drafting memorandum in opposition to Defendants' motion to compel; continue gathering materials for fact section of opposition brief; analyze research [REDACTED]	7.00	4,480.00
03/25/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Travel to Los Angeles for depositions of Lousararian, McClean and RMA/Deliverance; prepare for deposition en route.	6.10	2,104.50
03/25/19	G. Fairbairn	Prepare for and take deposition of L. Lousararian; review notes and confer regarding impact of Lousararian deposition on case issues, including follow up on document-specific issues; prepare for deposition of M.McCLean; confer regarding response to motion to compel production of documents.	8.70	4,654.50
03/25/19	G. Fairbairn	Analyze Defendants' subpoena to T. Bransford for documents and deposition; confer regarding deposition of L. Lousararian; continue drafting memorandum in opposition to Defendants' motion to compel; continue gathering		

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 44  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/25/19	L. Friedemann	exhibits for declaration and fact section of opposition brief; continue analyzing [REDACTED] develop deposition prep plan for witnesses. Attend deposition of L. Lousararian; meet with counsel for Rogers & Cowan and L. Lousararian; continue preparing for RMA and Deliverance, LLC deposition.	7.50	4,800.00
03/26/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Review text messages produced by Defendants for possible use in Deliverance/RMA depositions; communicate regarding status of depositions; review response to motion to compel inspection of Confidentiality Agreement; assist with preparation for Deliverance/RMA deposition by testing and preparing technology for displaying video exhibits; oversee and review communications regarding document production to third parties as required by the protective order; communicate with [REDACTED]	6.30	2,173.50
03/26/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding Defendants' subpoena to T. Bransford for documents; confer regarding contents of latest text message production from Defendants; continue drafting fact and argument sections of memorandum in opposition to Defendants' motion to compel; continue gathering exhibits for declaration; confer regarding confidentiality for exhibits; correspond with A. Bruce regarding memorandum.	5.50	2,942.50
03/26/19	L. Friedemann	Edit brief opposing RMA's motion to	4.50	2,880.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 45  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/26/19	S. Lee	compel inspection of original confidentiality agreement; continue to prepare for RMA and Deliverance LLC deposition Communication with Litigation Support regarding upcoming production. Download production received from Opposing. Circulate to team for reference. Communication with Litigation Support regarding processing Opposing production files. Revise production and collection log.	1.00	230.00
03/26/19	T. Klukow	Organize and prepare third-party's documents for production.	0.60	141.00
03/27/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Conduct cite check of response to motion to compel inspection of document and assist with finalization of motion; prepare documents for and attend deposition of RMA and Deliverance LLC; [REDACTED]	10.40	3,588.00
03/27/19	G. Fairbairn	Incorporate changes to memorandum in opposition to Defendants' motion to compel and finalize for filing; analyze draft declaration and exhibits and prepare for filing; draft supporting documents for memorandum; attention to filing of memorandum and supporting documents; confer regarding RMA deposition; confer regarding deposition preparation.	2.20	1,177.00
03/27/19	J. Beitz	Research and retrieve [REDACTED]	0.20	40.00
03/27/19	L. Friedemann	Final preparation for deposition of RMA and Deliverance, LLC; take deposition.	9.60	6,144.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 46  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/27/19	S. Lee	Update collection of cited exhibits. Create excerpts for filing with court. Finalize exhibits for filing. Draft declaration regarding same. Update production log. Communication with Litigation Support regarding client database access.	2.50	575.00
03/27/19	T. Klukow	Update indices to reflect re- production of document produced by a third-party pursuant to subpoena.	0.30	70.50
03/28/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Return travel from RMA/Deliverance and Lousararian depositions; confer regarding outcome of RMA/Deliverance deposition, including strategy [REDACTED] [REDACTED] organize next steps in discovery; begin collecting documents for Ann Wessberg deposition; [REDACTED] begin preparing for oral argument opposing motion to compel inspection of document by outlining salient issues.	8.00	2,760.00
03/28/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding preparation for A. Wessberg and K. Johnson depositions; attention to update regarding RMA deposition; attention to service of courtesy copies.	0.30	160.50
03/28/19	L. Friedemann	Return travel to Minneapolis; emails with A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding various PRN matters en route and confer regarding preparation of task list for discovery items and summary judgment.	6.60	4,224.00
03/28/19	S. Lee	Search database for possible documents for attorney review for possible use during witness deposition preparation meetings.	1.80	414.00
03/29/19	A. Rondoni	Confer and strategize regarding issues	4.90	1,690.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 47  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
	Tavernier	raised by RMA/Deliverance depositions and their impact on the case, [REDACTED]		
03/29/19	G. Fairbairn	communicate with court regarding upcoming hearing on motion to compel inspection. Confer regarding R&C deposition, RMA deposition, preparation for upcoming defensive depositions, subpoena to D. Small, cybersquatting claim, and RMA's tortious interference theories; continue preparing for K. Johnson and A. Wessberg depositions; correspond with D. Crosby regarding deposition preparation; attention to correspondence from Magistrate Judge Leung's clerk regarding hearing on motion to compel.	2.00	1,070.00
03/29/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding information obtained in depositions of Rogers & Cowan, RMA and Deliverance, LLC, and consider strategy with respect to same; [REDACTED] email to A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding [REDACTED] review and edit subpoena to Drew Small; confer regarding deposition preparation and strategy for K. Johnson depo.	2.30	1,472.00
03/29/19	S. Lee	Communication with team regarding	0.40	92.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 48  
Matter No: 077376.0409

03/30/19	G. Fairbairn	preparing and sending subpoenas to Drew Small. Coordinate logistics with court reporting vendor and location for Drew Small production responsive to subpoena. Continue preparing for K. Johnson, A. Wessberg, and T. Bransford depositions by reviewing materials for prep sessions.	1.40	749.00
03/31/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Communicate regarding document preparation for deposition of K. Johnson; prepare for oral hearing on motion to compel inspection by reading case law cited in response brief and outlining issues for argument.	2.50	862.50
03/31/19	G. Fairbairn	Continue preparing for K. Johnson deposition by reviewing potential exhibits and news articles; continue corresponding with D. Crosby regarding T. Bransford deposition.	3.20	1,712.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 49  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Total for Fees: 114,686.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/20/19	Metro Legal Metro Legal Services, Inc. - 3164719 - California Secretary of State Service Fee for Service of Matthew Wilson/Sidebar Legal	225.00
03/15/19	Airfare Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Airfare - 03/24/2019 - 03/28/2019 - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	1,006.60
03/15/19	Airfare Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Airfare - 03/24/2019 - 03/28/2019 - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	1,006.60
03/25/19	Airfare Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Airfare - 03/24/2019 - 03/28/2019 - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	30.00
03/18/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	238.28
03/18/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	(188.28)
03/24/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Meals Other - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	87.20
03/25/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	26.40
03/25/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Lunch - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	98.13
03/25/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Dinner - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	158.63
03/26/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Breakfast - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora	12.48

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 50  
Matter No: 077376.0409

03/26/19	Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Lunch - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	28.19
03/26/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Dinner - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	32.28
03/27/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Meals Other - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	7.90
03/27/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Meals Other - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	10.58
03/27/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Breakfast - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	26.50
03/27/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Dinner - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	102.41
03/28/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Breakfast - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	33.45
03/28/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Meals Other - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian - Lora Mitchell Friedemann, Anne E. Rondoni Tavernier	6.68
03/28/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Hotel - Lodging - 03/24/2019 - 03/29/2019 - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	1,854.93
03/28/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Public Transit - Attend deposition of RMA/Deliverance and Lori Lousararian	2.00
03/01/19	Prof Serv TransUnion Risk and Alternative Data Solutions Inc. - 572387-Mar19 - Public records searching	10.00
03/04/19	Prof Serv Patrick J. Thomas Agency - 9242179-20195 - Bond Premium	9,500.00
	eDiscovery Hosting Fee	575.00
	Postage Charges - Registered RR	16.80

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 51  
Matter No: 077376.0409

Research via Westlaw	264.00
----------------------	--------

<b>Total For Costs and Other Charges:</b>	<b>15,171.76</b>
---	------------------

<b>Total This Matter:</b>	<b>129,858.26</b>
---------------------------	-------------------

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 52

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0411  
**Regarding:** Paisley Park Museum Exhibiting Operating Agreement

03/05/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] per A. Aycock request; email to A. Aycock and A. Bruce regarding same.	1.20	618.00
03/13/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review emails [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	154.50
03/25/19	S. Helland	Reply to A. Aycock email regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] teleconference with A. Aycock regarding [REDACTED]	0.40	214.00

**Total for Fees:** 986.50

**Total This Matter:** 986.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 53

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0414  
**Regarding:** Kian Andrew Habib

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/01/19	L. Friedemann	Email to S. Salinger regarding settlement conference and continued deposition.	0.50	320.00
03/03/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with S. Salinger regarding continued deposition of K. Habib.	0.10	64.00
03/04/19	B. Marchevsky	Review and analyze Habib's second supplemental answers to interrogatories and second supplemental disclosures.	0.20	69.00
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Analyze supplemental initial disclosures and interrogatory answers; review order referring case to mediation; send emails to A. Bruce and A. Aycock with updates.	0.70	448.00
03/06/19	B. Marchevsky	Confer and strategize with L. Friedemann regarding the mediation statement and edits to the summary judgment brief.	0.60	207.00
03/06/19	L. Friedemann	Review notice of settlement conference; email to A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding same and regarding recommended strategy; email with E. Carnevale regarding settlement conference; confer regarding preparation of mediation statement and edits to draft summary judgment motion.	1.40	896.00
03/08/19	B. Marchevsky	Review and analyze [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer regarding the same.	0.60	207.00
03/08/19	L. Friedemann	Emails with S. Salinger regarding settlement conference and extension of case schedule to accommodate same; confer regarding preparation of joint motion to extend case schedule.	0.40	256.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 54  
Matter No: 077376.0414

03/08/19	L. Friedemann	Email with S. Salinger regarding settlement conference.	0.10	64.00
03/09/19	B. Marchevsky	Outline mediation statement; begin drafting the same; confer with local counsel regarding guidelines for the same.	3.00	1,035.00
03/09/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft joint motion to amend the scheduling order; review correspondence regarding the same.	0.80	276.00
03/10/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft mediation statement; revise the same.	4.00	1,380.00
03/11/19	A. Wessberg	Review correspondence from Comerica regarding Habib takedowns; correspond with L. Friedemann regarding same.	0.30	162.00
03/11/19	B. Marchevsky	Revise mediation statement section related to attorneys' fees; confer and strategize regarding the same.	1.40	483.00
03/11/19	B. Marchevsky	Revise joint motion to extend time and to amend the scheduling order; confer regarding the same.	0.30	103.50
03/11/19	L. Friedemann	Edit joint motion extending deadlines for Habib deposition and summary judgment brief; confer with E. Carnevale regarding same; send draft of joint motion to S. Salinger; edit mediation statement.	1.30	832.00
03/12/19	B. Marchevsky	Revise mediation statement to incorporate an updated attorneys' fees and costs figure.	0.20	69.00
03/12/19	L. Friedemann	Continue to draft and edit mediation statement.	3.00	1,920.00
03/12/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	128.00
03/13/19	B. Marchevsky	Review edits provided by A. Bruce to the draft mediation statement; confer regarding revisions to incorporate the same.	0.30	103.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 55  
Matter No: 077376.0414

03/13/19	L. Friedemann	Edit mediation statement to address Comerica comments; email to E. Carnevale regarding mediation statement.	2.40	1,536.00
03/14/19	L. Friedemann	Review and incorporate suggested edits to mediation statement from E. Carnevale; finalize mediation statement and coordinate with E. Carnevale on submission of same.	1.00	640.00
03/15/19	L. Friedemann	Follow up with S. Salinger regarding joint motion extending deadlines for Habib deposition and summary judgment motions.	0.60	384.00
03/18/19	J. Cassioppi	Strategize regarding settlement conference.	0.10	46.50
03/20/19	L. Friedemann	Telephone conference with E. Carnevale to plan for settlement conference; travel to Boston for settlement conference and prepare for RMA/Deliverance deposition en route.	5.40	3,456.00
03/21/19	L. Friedemann	Represent Estate at settlement conference; send email summarizing same.	6.00	3,840.00
03/22/19	L. Friedemann	Return travel from settlement conference; consider [REDACTED]; confer regarding review of flash drive from S. Salinger.	6.40	4,096.00
03/26/19	L. Friedemann	Email to S. Salinger regarding deposition date and joint status report.	0.10	64.00
03/26/19	S. Bell	Review [REDACTED]	2.50	450.00
03/28/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft motion to compel the continued deposition of Mr. Habib; legal research in support of the same; confer and strategize regarding the same; draft proposed order.	3.10	1,069.50
03/28/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding motion to compel Habib's continued deposition and preparation of	0.20	128.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 56  
Matter No: 077376.0414

03/29/19	B. Marchevsky	same. Draft declaration in support of the motion to compel Habib's deposition; confer and strategize regarding the motion; identify key exhibits; review local counsel edits; revise the brief to incorporate edits from A. Bruce; confer with local counsel regarding the filing of the same.	3.30	1,138.50
03/29/19	L. Friedemann	Review and edit motion to compel continued deposition of K. Habib and supporting declaration.	0.70	448.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 57  
Matter No: 077376.0414

Total for Fees: 26,319.50

### Costs and Other Charges

02/08/19	Airfare Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Airfare - 03/04/2019 - 03/05/2019 -	159.60
03/09/19	Airfare Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Airfare - 03/20/2019 - 03/22/2019 - Attend Mediation	333.60
03/05/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Hotel - Lodging - 03/04/2019 - 03/05/2019 -	398.29
03/20/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Train - Attend Mediation	2.00
03/20/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend Mediation	32.75
03/20/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend Mediation	24.36
03/21/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Breakfast - Attend Mediation - Lora Mitchell Friedemann	9.75
03/21/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Breakfast - Attend Mediation - Lora Mitchell Friedemann	5.05
03/21/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Breakfast - Attend Mediation - Lora Mitchell Friedemann	10.97
03/21/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend Mediation	7.38
03/21/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Taxi/Car Service - Attend Mediation	6.85
03/22/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Public Transit - Attend Mediation	2.00
03/22/19	Travel Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Hotel - Lodging - 03/20/2019 - 03/22/2019 - Attend Mediation	482.98
	eDiscovery Hosting Fee	450.00
	Photocopy Charges	4.40

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 1,929.98

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 58  
Matter No: 077376.0414

**Total This Matter: 28,249.48**

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 59

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0415  
**Regarding:** International Bootlegging

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/01/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	53.50
03/01/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	64.00
03/04/19	G. Fairbairn	Finalize [REDACTED] attention to	0.80	428.00
03/04/19	L. Friedemann	service documents for E. Ziani.	0.10	64.00
03/05/19	G. Fairbairn	Emails regarding service on E. Ziani.	0.30	160.50
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Attention to production from Google relating to E. Ziani and continuing investigation [REDACTED]	0.30	192.00
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Telephone conference with [REDACTED] from Google regarding response to subpoena and timing of same; send email update to team.	0.80	276.00
03/06/19	B. Marchevsky	Review Google production in response to the Estate's subpoena; confer regarding the same; research Ziani's time to respond to the Complaint.	0.50	267.50
03/06/19	G. Fairbairn	Correspond with A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding service on E. Ziani; attention to research on timing of response; confer regarding Google production.	0.70	161.00
03/06/19	S. Lee	Create production and collection log. Draft subpoena tracking chart. Communication with Litigation Support regarding uploading third party production files.	0.50	267.50
03/08/19	G. Fairbairn	Update case deadlines in light of service of E. Ziani [REDACTED] attention to subpoenas		

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycocock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 60  
Matter No: 077376.0415

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		remaining and potential for motion to serve M. Peters by alternate means.		
03/10/19	G. Fairbairn	Analyze responses to discovery into M. Peters in preparation for potential motion for alternate service.	0.20	107.00
03/12/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to translated Hague Certificate of Service and filing with the Court; confer regarding status of subpoenas.	0.40	214.00
03/12/19	L. Friedemann	Oversee filing of proof of service on E. Ziani and confer regarding preparation of motion for entry of default.	0.10	64.00
03/14/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding Rule 26(f) meeting with W. Safford, entry of default, motion for default judgment, and Rule 16 conference with L. Friedemann; begin outlining topics for Rule 26(f) discussion.	0.80	428.00
03/15/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to mail return from Lyon address of E. Ziani.	0.20	107.00
03/17/19	G. Fairbairn	Correspond [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review deadlines and assignments relating to entry of default, motion for default judgment, and the Rule 26(f) conference with W. Safford; analyze status of subpoena discovery.	0.70	374.50
03/18/19	G. Fairbairn	Correspond [REDACTED] [REDACTED] attention to execution copies of agreement and correspond regarding stipulation of dismissal; confer regarding entry of default.	0.40	214.00
03/18/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	64.00
03/19/19	B. Marchevsky	Confer regarding case strategy and near-term tasks.	0.30	103.50
03/19/19	G. Fairbairn	Continue corresponding [REDACTED]	0.90	481.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 61  
Matter No: 077376.0415

		[REDACTED] confer regarding upcoming tasks: entry of default against E. Ziani, motion for default judgment, Rule 26(f) conference with W. Safford, and follow up on subpoenas; analyze requirements for discovery conference.		
03/20/19	G. Fairbairn	Finalize stipulation and proposed order for P. Van Ryckeghem agreement; draft certificate of service; manage filing of stipulation, proposed order, and certificate of service; confer regarding failed email attempt to M. Peters.	0.70	374.50
03/21/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft application for entry of default for Ziani; draft declaration in support of the same.	0.80	276.00
03/21/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding motion for alternate service and M. Peters email address.	0.20	107.00
03/22/19	B. Marchevsky	Revise declaration in support of entry of default; confer and strategize regarding the same.	0.80	276.00
03/22/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding default process; analyze drafts of request for entry of default and declaration in support of request.	0.40	214.00
03/25/19	B. Marchevsky	Review and finalize application for entry of default documents for filing; serve the same on Ziani and Safford.	0.30	103.50
03/25/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding filing of request for entry of default; attention to filing and service on Defendants.	0.40	214.00
03/26/19	B. Marchevsky	Review Google production [REDACTED]; confer regarding the same.	0.30	103.50
03/26/19	G. Fairbairn	Attention to entry of default against E. Ziani and service on Defendants; analyze new materials from Google for M. Peters	0.50	267.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 62  
Matter No: 077376.0415

		accounts.		
03/26/19	L. Friedemann	Email to A. Bruce and A. Aycock regarding entry of default against E. Ziani.	0.10	64.00
03/27/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding new materials from Google for M. Peters accounts; attention to new email address for M. Peters.	0.20	107.00
03/27/19	S. Lee	Communication with Litigation Support regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	115.00
03/28/19	S. Lee	Communication with Litigation Support regarding loading production files received.	0.20	46.00
03/29/19	Litigation Support Consulting	Research and evaluate reporting produced in Google LLC subpoena response.	2.00	390.00
03/29/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft correction to application for default as to Ziani; oversee filing and service of the same.	0.40	138.00
03/29/19	G. Fairbairn	Confer regarding entry of default; attention to amended declaration for entry of default and service on E. Ziani.	0.20	107.00
03/29/19	S. Lee	Communication with Litigation Support regarding IP Logs received.	0.30	69.00

**Total for Fees: 7,063.50**

### Costs and Other Charges

03/11/19	Federal Express	18.67
03/05/19	Lora Mitchell Friedemann - Other - Translation from French to English of Proof of Service for Eric Ziani	350.00
	eDiscovery Hosting Fee	25.00

**Total For Costs and Other Charges: 393.67**

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 63  
Matter No: 077376.0415

**Total This Matter: 7,457.17**

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 64

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0417  
**Regarding:** Domain Capital Inc.

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
02/15/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding status of motion to approve settlement agreement.	0.10	64.00
02/26/19	L. Friedemann	Send email to Domain Capital counsel regarding status of motion to approve settlement.	0.10	64.00
03/01/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding approval of settlement agreement and execution of same.	0.30	192.00
03/04/19	L. Friedemann	Email executed settlement documentation to J. Schaeffer; review and execute [REDACTED] emails with A. Aycock regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	320.00
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Confirm [REDACTED] emails regarding same; email with [REDACTED]	0.60	384.00
03/06/19	L. Friedemann	Oversee transfer of domain name; emails in connection with same; confirm [REDACTED] begin process [REDACTED] update local [REDACTED] counsel.	0.40	256.00
03/07/19	L. Friedemann	Call to J. Schaeffer for [REDACTED]	0.10	64.00
03/08/19	L. Friedemann	Telephone conference with J. Schaefer [REDACTED]	0.10	64.00
03/11/19	L. Friedemann	Review and approve stipulation of dismissal.	0.10	64.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 65  
Matter No: 077376.0417

**Total for Fees: 1,472.00**

### Costs and Other Charges

02/05/19	PACER Service Center US Courts - Usage fee 10/01/2018 to 12/31/2018	1.50
----------	---	------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges: 1.50**

**Total This Matter: 1,473.50**

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 66

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0420  
**Regarding:** Sharon Nelson Claim

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
03/01/19	E. Unger	Draft letter to S. Nelson.	1.00	415.00
03/04/19	E. Unger	Legal research regarding [REDACTED] finish drafting letter to S. Nelson; draft motion to dismiss S. Nelson complaint.	7.20	2,988.00
03/04/19	J. Cassioppi	Prepare memorandum in support of motion to dismiss S. Nelson complaint.	0.40	186.00
03/05/19	E. Unger	Continue drafting motion to dismiss S. Nelson complaint.	8.60	3,569.00
03/05/19	J. Cassioppi	Prepare memorandum in support of motion to dismiss S. Nelson complaint.	0.20	93.00
03/05/19	J. Sharpe	Research related to Motion to Dismiss S. Nelson complaint.	1.20	354.00
03/06/19	E. Unger	Revise motion to dismiss, add citations, begin compiling exhibits for same, draft new argument [REDACTED] and add conclusion.	2.30	954.50
03/06/19	J. Cassioppi	Research, draft, and amend motion to dismiss S. Nelson complaint and email correspondence regarding the same; incorporate Comerica comments in motion to dismiss.	3.90	1,813.50
03/07/19	E. Unger	Revise motion to dismiss in response to comments from client; add note [REDACTED] finalize and file motion and supporting documents; call to court for hearing date on motion.	1.90	788.50
03/07/19	J. Baker	Review research and edit motion to dismiss brief.	2.20	770.00
03/07/19	J. Cassioppi	Research, amend, and finalize motion to dismiss S. Nelson complaint; review and	2.20	1,023.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 67  
Matter No: 077376.0420

		revise motion to dismiss based on Comerica comments.		
03/07/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney; review correspondence to court and S. Nelson; conference calls with client; correspondence to client; conference with J. Cassioppi.	1.80	1,215.00
03/08/19	E. Unger	Draft and amend notice of motion for sanctions; send motion with Rule 11 letter.	0.50	207.50
03/08/19	J. Cassioppi	Review and revise Rule 11 letter and motion and email correspondence regarding the same.	0.60	279.00
03/08/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney regarding motion to dismiss S. Nelson claim and Rule 11 filings and consult regarding same.	0.20	135.00
03/11/19	E. Unger	Coordinate compilation of record for service on court and filing of amended notice.	0.20	83.00
03/25/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence with A. Aycock and A. Bruce regarding notice.	0.10	46.50

**Total for Fees: 14,920.50**

**Costs and Other Charges**

MN E-File - Electronic Filing / Service Fee	380.00
Photocopy Charges	165.00
Postage Charges - 2 boxes	20.35

**Total For Costs and Other Charges: 565.35**

**Total This Matter: 15,485.85**

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 68

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0421  
**Regarding:** Lythcott and Walker NDA Breach

02/21/19	J. Beitz	Research and retrieve information regarding [REDACTED]	0.60	120.00
03/01/19	E. Unger	Analyze metadata from Lythcott; confirm strategy for addressing Lythcott and Walker violations.	0.90	373.50
03/01/19	J. Cassioppi	Telephone conference with A. Aycock and A. Bruce regarding document review, court filings, and next steps; review records produced by M. Lythcott and strategize regarding the same; analyze Court filings; analyze access log; finalize and send letter to S. Silton.	2.40	1,116.00
03/01/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney regarding document production and G. Walker contempt motion; review emails; review correspondence to S. Silton; correspondence with client; telephone conference with A. Aycock and A. Bruce; conference with attorney.	1.80	1,215.00
03/04/19	A. Sreekanth	Begin review of materials regarding access to and disclosure of Estate's confidential information by Walker & Lythcott for purposes of preparing report.	0.50	195.00
03/04/19	B. Marchevsky	Review and analyze documents regarding Estate confidential information disclosure for purposes of preparing timeline.	1.10	379.50
03/04/19	E. Unger	Edit draft motion for contempt and exhibits.	1.00	415.00
03/04/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Conference regarding document review.	0.30	154.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 69  
Matter No: 077376.0421

03/05/19	A. Sreekanth	Analyze issues and background documentation regarding release of Estate's confidential information; strategize regarding process for investigating scope and extent of breach.	2.70	1,053.00
03/05/19	B. Marchevsky	Review court filings related to the disclosures of Estate confidential information; confer and strategize regarding the same.	1.50	517.50
03/05/19	E. Unger	Confer regarding document review and report strategy; select and send background materials for A. Sreekanth and B. Marchevsky to review for project.	2.00	830.00
03/05/19	J. Cassioppi	Review records and meet with team to set parameters for review and report; prepare letter demanding response from counsel for Walker and Lythcott.	1.40	651.00
03/05/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Review and provide comments on letter to counsel.	0.30	154.50
03/06/19	A. Sreekanth	Begin review of agreements, pleadings, and documents produced by Lythcott to analyze scope of third-party disclosure and inform scope and direction of investigation.	2.30	897.00
03/06/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft summary of key individuals involved in the disclosure of confidential Estate information; draft chronology the same; confer regarding the same.	2.10	724.50
03/06/19	E. Unger	Prepare and assemble records related to M. Lythcott and G. Walker disclosing of records; consult regarding strategy and next steps; conducting Lythcott document review.	0.50	207.50
03/06/19	J. Cassioppi	Draft and amend opposition to A. Jackson and O. Baker motion to amend order; attention to process for obtaining records	1.50	697.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 70  
Matter No: 077376.0421

03/07/19	A. Sreekanth	back from third-parties. Continue review and analysis of documents regarding release of confidential Estate information by Lythcott and Walker; coordinate creation of mailing list for all third parties who received access to confidential information for purposes of sending demand letters; prepare demand letters.	3.00	1,170.00
03/07/19	B. Marchevsky	Identify next steps regarding disclosure of confidential Estate information; review documents provided by M. Lythcott regarding the same; continue drafting chronology regarding the same; confer regarding correspondence with third parties.	2.40	828.00
03/07/19	E. Unger	Redact memo in response to motion to amend court order, modify motion to file under seal, and prepare for filing; edit letter to Judge Eide and prepare redacted and under seal exhibits and motion to file under seal and complete filing/service of same; review letter from Lythcott's counsel regarding document production; confer with A. Sreekanth regarding research needed [REDACTED]	3.40	1,411.00
03/07/19	J. Cassioppi	discuss response to Lythcott's production with J. Cassioppi; coordinate processing; respond to Lythcott's counsel. Edit, finalize, and file opposition to A. Jackson and O. Baker motion to amend order regarding M. Lythcott; prepare letter to the Court regarding status and next steps regarding document review.	3.80	1,767.00
03/07/19	S. Lee	Communication with A. Sreekanth	0.20	46.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 71  
Matter No: 077376.0421

		regarding project scope and data collection; identify resources for relevant data.		
03/08/19	A. Sreekanth	Legal research regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] continue reviewing documents regarding release of confidential information, including newly produced documents; continue supervising creation of mailing list for third parties who received same.	3.10	1,209.00
03/08/19	B. Marchevsky	Review correspondence with the court regarding disclosure of confidential Estate information; confer regarding the same and next steps; continue drafting the chronology regarding the same.	1.30	448.50
03/08/19	E. Unger	Analysis of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	166.00
03/08/19	J. Cassioppi	Review supplemental production and email correspondence regarding the same; review M. Lythcott motion and email correspondence and telephone conferences regarding the same; analyze report to the Court regarding M. Lythcott and G. Walker.	2.10	976.50
03/08/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney regarding response to motion.	0.30	202.50
03/08/19	S. Lee	Communication with team regarding project scope and location of relevant files for team review.	0.60	138.00
03/10/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents produced by M. Lythcott dated December 2018 to the present.	3.20	1,104.00
03/10/19	S. Lee	Update draft master contact list for team	2.40	552.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 72  
Matter No: 077376.0421

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/11/19	A. Sreekanth	review. Review documents and analysis of funds received by Lythcott related to transactions with Heirs; continue to analyze documents regarding disclosure of confidential Estate information to third parties; begin drafting background section of report related to same.	1.50	585.00
03/11/19	B. Marchevsky	Confer and strategize regarding significant documents produced by M. Lythcott.	0.50	172.50
03/11/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence regarding improper filing; review letter from E. Ahrens; review letter from J. Robbins; review M. Lythcott motion and begin researching and drafting opposition to the same; attention to M. Lythcott document production.	3.60	1,674.00
03/11/19	S. Lee	Search databases, document management repositories and public sources for contact information needed for cease and desist letters. Update master contact list re same. Communication with team re same.	4.10	943.00
03/12/19	A. Sreekanth	Continue reviewing documents produced by Lythcott; analyze issues related to Lythcott's clawback attempt and waiver of privilege; legal research regarding same.	4.10	1,599.00
03/12/19	E. Unger	Follow up on claw back request; review multiple correspondence from Lythcott's counsel; review sample of documents Lythcott is claiming are privileged.	0.80	332.00
03/12/19	J. Cassioppi	Draft response to M. Lythcott motion and assemble document in support of the same; attention to sequestering documents in response to request from J. Robbins; email correspondence regarding letter to the court; review research	3.60	1,674.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 73  
Matter No: 077376.0421

03/12/19	S. Lee	regarding privilege waiver. Search databases and public resources for contact information on various individuals relating to NDA breach; update master contact list.	1.70	391.00
03/13/19	A. Sreekanth	Analyze investigation of scope and extent of breach of NDAs by Walker and Lythcott; review and analyze draft filings regarding production of documents regarding same.	2.00	780.00
03/13/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents produced by M. Lythcott dated 2016 to 2017.	3.00	1,035.00
03/13/19	E. Unger	Edit response to motion for return of documents; address issue of clawback.	2.20	913.00
03/13/19	J. Cassioppi	Research and draft opposition to motion to return flash drive; analyze response to letters from counsel for M. Lythcott and O. Baker.	7.20	3,348.00
03/13/19	M. Greiner	Review correspondence from counsel for M. Lythcott; conference with attorney.	0.40	270.00
03/13/19	S. Lee	Search databases and public resources for contact information on various individuals identified on Access Log relating to NDA breach. Update master contact list for team reference.	3.80	874.00
03/14/19	A. Sreekanth	Continue review of documents related to Lythcott/Walker NDA breach; continue drafting report related to same.	0.90	351.00
03/14/19	E. Unger	Prepare affidavit and exhibit showing Lythcott's dubious claim of privilege.	2.30	954.50
03/14/19	J. Cassioppi	Draft opposition to motion to return flash drive and email correspondence regarding the same; prepare exhibits in support of opposition.	3.20	1,488.00
03/14/19	S. Lee	Search databases and public sources for contact information on individuals relating to NDA breach. Update master contact	1.90	437.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 74  
Matter No: 077376.0421

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		information chart for team. Cross reference individual names with companies who signed NDA.		
03/15/19	A. Sreekanth	Verify non-privileged nature of documents provided to Court with motion to compel.	0.30	117.00
03/15/19	E. Unger	Redact exhibits to opposition to motion for return of flash drive and for costs; create motion to file under seal; file and serve responsive brief and supporting declaration and exhibits.	3.00	1,245.00
03/15/19	J. Cassioppi	Revise, finalize, and file opposition to M. Lythcott motion to return flash drive; email correspondence regarding edits to motion; draft declaration and supporting exhibits.	2.00	930.00
03/15/19	M. Greiner	Review response; conference with attorney regarding same.	0.70	472.50
03/15/19	M. Greiner	Conference with attorney; telephone conference with client.	0.50	337.50
03/16/19	B. Marchevsky	Create review and search strategy for M. Lythcott documents; memorialize the same.	1.40	483.00
03/17/19	J. Cassioppi	Draft letter in response to M. Lythcott March 11 and 12 letters; draft letter to counsel [REDACTED] draft certification of destruction; draft letter to parties who received confidential estate information.	2.60	1,209.00
03/17/19	S. Lee	Search database and public resources for various information for multiple individuals relating to NDA breach.	4.30	989.00
03/18/19	A. Sreekanth	Review and provide comments to draft letters to third parties and counsel regarding return of confidential estate information; review status of efforts to obtain contact information for third parties	0.60	234.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 75  
Matter No: 077376.0421

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		with access to data site established by Lythcott/Walker.		
03/18/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents from M. Lythcott dated in 2017; identify key events and information.	1.80	621.00
03/18/19	E. Unger	Edit letters and certification; coordinate with team on identifying and clearing third party recipients.	1.00	415.00
03/18/19	J. Cassioppi	Prepare and amend demand letters to parties who received confidential information; amend and send letter to counsel for M. Lythcott; email correspondence regarding hearing schedule; analyze records produced by M. Lythcott and report regarding same.	2.40	1,116.00
03/19/19	A. Sreekanth	Confer regarding and coordinate arrangements to mail letters to third parties in receipt of Estate confidential information.	0.80	312.00
03/19/19	B. Marchevsky	Confer and strategize regarding letters to third parties.	0.60	207.00
03/19/19	E. Unger	Coordinate with team on identifying and clearing third party recipients before sending notices and demands for destruction of documents.	0.60	249.00
03/19/19	J. Cassioppi	Edit and finalize demand letters and attention to sending the same; email correspondence regarding court hearing.	1.20	558.00
03/19/19	S. Lee	Meeting with team regarding status of collecting information on individuals relating to NDA breach. Update master contacts information chart.	1.90	437.00
03/20/19	S. Lee	Confirm list of employees for certain companies identified on DataRoom access log. Update master contact list re individuals relating to NDA breach.	1.40	322.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 76  
Matter No: 077376.0421

03/20/19	S. Lee	Search databases and public sources for contact information on various individuals relating to DataRoom access. Update master contact list. (actual time was 1.2)	0.60	138.00
03/21/19	A. Sreekanth	Attention to efforts to gather contact information for third parties with access to data site with Estate confidential information.	0.20	78.00
03/21/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents from M. Lythcott dated late 2017.	1.80	621.00
03/21/19	E. Unger	Review correspondence from Lythcott's counsel.	0.20	83.00
03/21/19	J. Cassioppi	Review letter from E. Ahrens and email correspondence regarding the same.	0.20	93.00
03/21/19	S. Lee	Edit and finalize master contact list re individuals relating to NDA breach.	3.00	690.00
03/22/19	Litigation Support Consulting	Assist case team with analysis of archived data room produced by opposing counsel.	1.00	195.00
03/22/19	A. Sreekanth	Review and analyze read-only version of data site produced by Lythcott; attention to letters to third parties regarding access to confidential information.	1.40	546.00
03/22/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents from M. Lythcott dated late 2017 through March 2018; draft chronology in this timeframe including key events and documents.	4.30	1,483.50
03/22/19	E. Unger	Identify and clear third party recipients on mailing of notices.	1.40	581.00
03/22/19	J. Cassioppi	Review and analyze archive copy of data site; attention to demand letters to parties who received confidential Estate information.	0.70	325.50
03/23/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents from M. Lythcott dated early 2018.	4.50	1,552.50
03/24/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft chronology with key events and	1.90	655.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 77  
Matter No: 077376.0421

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		documents from April 2017 to March 2018 based on the documents provided by M. Lythcott.		
03/25/19	A. Sreekanth	Attention to mailing of letters to third parties regarding return of Estate information.	0.60	234.00
03/25/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents produced by M. Lythcott dated April 2018; confer regarding key documents within the same.	1.70	586.50
03/25/19	E. Unger	Identify and clear third party recipients on mailing of notices.	1.50	622.50
03/25/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence regarding Cozen communication.	0.10	46.50
03/25/19	S. Lee	Search database and spreadsheet re individuals and potential conflicts checks. Communication with team re same.	0.60	138.00
03/26/19	A. Sreekanth	Attention to letters to third parties regarding return of Estate information, including proper list of recipients based on information available regarding access to data site.	0.70	273.00
03/26/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents produced by M. Lythcott dated from April 2018 to June 2018.	2.60	897.00
03/26/19	J. Cassioppi	Review letter from B. Brooks and email correspondence regarding the same.	0.30	139.50
03/27/19	A. Sreekanth	Review and finalize conflicts check and list of recipients of third-party letters regarding destruction of confidential information; supervise transmittal of same.	1.90	741.00
03/27/19	B. Marchevsky	Review nearly 1,200 relevant documents produced by M. Lythcott dated June 2018 to September 2018; identify key documents and events within the same.	5.80	2,001.00
03/27/19	E. Unger	Review response [REDACTED] and analyze options for actions in response;	0.80	332.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 78  
Matter No: 077376.0421

Date	Attorney	Description	Hours	Amount
		attention to mailing of notices to third parties.		
03/27/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence with [REDACTED] regarding demand letters.	0.20	93.00
03/28/19	A. Sreekanth	Attention to responses to third party letters.	0.20	78.00
03/28/19	B. Marchevsky	Review nearly 1,500 relevant documents produced by M. Lythcott dated September 2018 to November 2018, identifying key documents and events.	2.70	931.50
03/28/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence regarding communications with recipients of demand letters.	0.10	46.50
03/29/19	A. Sreekanth	Return messages from third parties regarding request to destroy estate confidential information and attention to responses to same; review chronology related to Lythcott and Walker's access to and distribution of estate confidential information.	1.10	429.00
03/29/19	E. Unger	Analyze [REDACTED] response and research needed; review responses from third parties agreeing to destroy documents.	1.50	622.50
03/29/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence regarding revised certification and responses to demand letters.	0.30	139.50
03/29/19	M. Williams	Research [REDACTED]	3.10	976.50
03/30/19	B. Marchevsky	Review documents produced by M. Lythcott dated November 2018 through February 2019; identify key documents and events.	5.00	1,725.00
03/31/19	B. Marchevsky	Draft chronology to include key evidence and events dated March 2018 to December 2018; identify key documents	6.10	2,104.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 79  
Matter No: 077376.0421

related to recent court filings; confer regarding the same; identify disclosures of confidential information by date and entity; confer regarding the same.

Total for Fees: 67,993.50

### Costs and Other Charges

eDiscovery Hosting Fee	825.00
Research via Westlaw	278.00

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 1,103.00

Total This Matter: 69,096.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 80

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0422  
**Regarding:** Walker Contempt Motion

03/01/19	J. Cassioppi	Research and draft motion to hold G. Walker in contempt.	1.20	558.00
03/02/19	J. Cassioppi	Research and draft contempt motion against G. Walker.	2.70	1,255.50
03/03/19	J. Cassioppi	Research and draft contempt motion against G. Walker.	1.10	511.50
03/04/19	E. Unger	Analysis of investigation and report needed to document Lythcott's breach of NDA.	1.30	539.50
03/04/19	J. Cassioppi	Research, draft, and amend motion for contempt; gather records regarding contempt motion; email correspondence and telephone conferences with Comerica regarding contempt motion; incorporate edits into contempt motion.	6.00	2,790.00
03/05/19	E. Unger	Prepare motion for contempt filing, redact memorandum and declaration, prepare motion to file under seal, file and serve motion and supporting documents.	1.80	747.00
03/05/19	J. Cassioppi	Finalize and file contempt motion.	1.40	651.00
03/12/19	J. Cassioppi	Email correspondence with S. Silton regarding accepting service.	0.10	46.50

**Total for Fees:** 7,099.00

**Total This Matter:** 7,099.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 81

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#: 077376.0500**  
**Regarding: Intellectual Property**

03/04/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding [REDACTED] breaches and infringements.	0.20	128.00
03/05/19	L. Friedemann	Confer regarding cease and desist letter to [REDACTED].	0.30	192.00
03/06/19	L. Friedemann	Further analysis of claims against [REDACTED] request internet research regarding [REDACTED] confer regarding draft cease and desist letter to [REDACTED] and draft same.	3.40	2,176.00
03/07/19	L. Friedemann	Prepare monthly update of pending litigation matters; edit cease and desist letter to [REDACTED].	1.40	896.00
03/08/19	L. Friedemann	Further edits to demand letter to [REDACTED] and emails regarding same.	0.40	256.00
03/11/19	L. Friedemann	Finalize demand letter to [REDACTED] and assemble exhibits; emails regarding additional takedowns and strategy with respect to same.	0.70	448.00
03/15/19	L. Friedemann	Email regarding response to demand letter to [REDACTED].	0.10	64.00
03/16/19	L. Friedemann	Analyze response to demand letter from [REDACTED] counsel; emails relating to next steps.	0.40	256.00
03/18/19	L. Friedemann	Emails regarding response to letter from [REDACTED] counsel; telephone conference with A. Bruce regarding same and regarding strategy with respect to remaining YouTube videos identified by K. Habib.	1.10	704.00
03/19/19	L. Friedemann	Draft letter to [REDACTED] use of intellectual property and [REDACTED]	2.30	1,472.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 82  
Matter No: 077376.0500

03/20/19	L. Friedemann	physical materials owned by Estate. Edit and circulate draft letter to counsel for [REDACTED]; draft summary of pending IP litigation cases.	0.70	448.00
03/21/19	L. Friedemann	Edit letter to [REDACTED] counsel regarding rights dispute; emails regarding same.	0.30	192.00
03/22/19	L. Friedemann	Edit and finalize letter to [REDACTED] counsel.	0.50	320.00
03/28/19	L. Friedemann	Investigation regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	128.00
03/29/19	L. Friedemann	Draft letters to [REDACTED] analyze letter and proposal from [REDACTED] counsel.	1.10	704.00

**Total for Fees: 8,384.00**

### Costs and Other Charges

Research via Westlaw 132.00

**Total For Costs and Other Charges: 132.00**

**Total This Matter: 8,516.00**

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 83

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.0605  
**Regarding:** PRN Licensing

03/01/19	E. Newby	Review and analyze PRN asset request e-mails from J. Murphy received from 2/22/19 to 3/1/19; record multiple request details into master license request log in preparation of reporting of same; email same to A. Bruce and others regarding same.	1.30	201.50
03/08/19	E. Newby	Review and analyze PRN asset request e-mails from J. Murphy received from 3/1/19 to 3/8/19; record multiple request details into master license request log in preparation of reporting of same; email same to A. Bruce and others regarding same.	1.20	186.00
03/15/19	E. Newby	Review and analyze PRN asset request e-mails from J. Murphy received from 3/8/19 to 3/15/19; record multiple request details into master license request log in preparation of reporting of same; email same to A. Bruce and others regarding same.	1.30	201.50
03/22/19	E. Newby	Review and analyze PRN asset request e-mails from J. Murphy received from 3/15/19 to 3/22/19; record multiple request details into master license request log in preparation of reporting of same; email same to A. Bruce and others regarding same.	1.80	279.00
03/29/19	E. Newby	Review and analyze PRN asset request e-mails from J. Murphy received from 3/22/19 to 3/29/19; multiple request details	1.20	186.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 84  
Matter No: 077376.0605

into master license request log in  
preparation of reporting of same; email  
same to A. Bruce and others regarding  
same.

Total for Fees: 1,054.00

Total This Matter: 1,054.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered  
as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn:  
Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 85

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.0608  
Regarding: [REDACTED]

03/14/19	S. Helland	Attention to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] email and document finalizing.	0.30	160.50
----------	------------	---	------	--------

Total for Fees: 160.50

Total This Matter: 160.50

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 86

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1000  
**Regarding:** Trademarks

03/05/19	C. Whittaker	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with A. Wessberg; update chart for clients review	1.00	140.00
03/05/19	E. Newby	Revise Upcoming Deadlines Report for monthly meeting with A. Bruce and others.	0.60	93.00
03/06/19	C. Whittaker	Review and revise [REDACTED]	0.40	56.00
03/06/19	S. Bell	Revise e-mail to A. Bruce regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	90.00
03/06/19	S. Bell	E-mail to A. Bruce regarding March portfolio.	0.20	36.00
03/07/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	18.00
03/11/19	A. Wessberg	Prepare for merchandise meeting; correspond with Comerica regarding alternative action when meeting was rescheduled after upcoming deadlines.	0.30	162.00
03/11/19	E. Newby	Revise and send monthly deadline report for phone call with A. Bruce and others; update deadline report with instructions from A. Bruce.	1.00	155.00
03/13/19	A. Wessberg	Review and revise charts to make recommendations to Comerica [REDACTED]	0.10	54.00
03/14/19	S. Bell	Finalize and send e-mail to A. Bruce regarding recommendations [REDACTED]	0.20	36.00
03/18/19	A. Wessberg	Review [REDACTED] from A. Bruce; double check against redundancies.	0.10	54.00
03/20/19	A. Wessberg	Review [REDACTED]	0.10	54.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 87  
Matter No: 077376.1000

		potential cause of action.		
03/20/19	C. Whittaker	Review e-mail from A. Bruce; draft e-mail to foreign associate instructing [REDACTED]	2.00	280.00
03/21/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding [REDACTED] research.	0.20	69.00
03/21/19	E. Newby	Request a [REDACTED]; revise chart regarding same.	0.50	77.50
03/21/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review tax advisors' advice [REDACTED] work on finding case regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	175.00
03/22/19	E. Newby	Revise and review [REDACTED] confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.50	77.50
03/25/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Research case law regarding [REDACTED]	1.20	414.00
03/25/19	A. Wessberg	communicate with A. Wessberg regarding same. Conference call with MarkMonitor and Comerica regarding annual report; provide direction to A. Rondoni-Tavernier regarding [REDACTED]	1.10	594.00
03/29/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	[REDACTED] review accountant team advice. Research case law [REDACTED]	2.40	828.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 88  
Matter No: 077376.1000

Total for Fees: 3,463.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/14/19	Federal Express for matter 1185	52.96
03/18/19	Federal Express for matter 2051	17.54
03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates for matter 1177	8.00
03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates for matter 1178	12.00
03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates for matter 1180	6.00
03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates for matter 1181	6.00
03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates for matter 2030	6.00
03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates for matter 2052	12.00
03/06/19	Prof Serv Corsearch Inc. - IN1030920 - Fees associated with worldwide trademark watch services for the marks PURPLE RAIN in International Classes 9, 25 and 41; PRINCE in International Classes 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44 and 45; and PAISLEY PARK in Research via Westlaw	4,732.00
		146.00

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 4,998.50

Total This Matter: 8,461.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 89

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1001  
**Regarding:** Copyright Matters

03/01/19	S. Helland	Analysis of [REDACTED] issue and next steps relative to [REDACTED]	0.50	267.50
03/03/19	S. Helland	Analysis of [REDACTED] and analysis of documents and emails related to [REDACTED]	1.20	642.00
03/04/19	A. Rondoni Tavernier	Confer with S. Helland regarding the [REDACTED]	0.50	172.50
03/04/19	A. Wessberg	Review office action for Copyright Office; correspond with Comerica regarding Copyright Office request [REDACTED]	0.50	270.00
03/04/19	S. Helland	Prepare for and teleconference with J. Boyarski and L. Menkes at Boyarski law firm regarding [REDACTED] analysis of [REDACTED]	2.80	1,498.00
03/05/19	S. Helland	Analysis of [REDACTED], and reply to A. Bruce email regarding same; Analysis of [REDACTED] direct letter drafting and claims regarding [REDACTED]	2.00	1,070.00
03/06/19	S. Helland	Draft revisions [REDACTED] cease and desist letter; teleconference with attorney for [REDACTED]	0.30	160.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 90  
Matter No: 077376.1001

03/10/19	S. Helland	Draft email to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	214.00
03/11/19	A. Wessberg	Review correspondence from Copyright Office regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	162.00
03/13/19	A. Wessberg	Review and respond to Copyright Office, [REDACTED]	0.30	162.00
03/16/19	S. Helland	Analysis of [REDACTED] and [REDACTED]	0.30	160.50
03/18/19	S. Helland	reply to A. Bruce regarding same; Reply to multiple emails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	160.50
03/18/19	S. Helland	Analysis of multiple email including from [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; draft email to attorney / representative for [REDACTED]	1.30	695.50
03/20/19	A. Wessberg	Review Copyright Office Action for specific action.	0.10	54.00
03/20/19	S. Helland	Reply to A. Aycok email regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] [REDACTED] teleconference with T. Guy re [REDACTED] Draft email to Comerica team re. [REDACTED]	0.80	428.00
03/22/19	S. Helland	Teleconference with A. Bruce regarding photography, copyright ownership, and [REDACTED]	0.40	214.00
03/25/19	A. Wessberg	Confer with S. Helland regarding interaction of [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	54.00
03/25/19	S. Helland	Analysis of [REDACTED]	2.10	1,123.50

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 91  
Matter No: 077376.1001

		[REDACTED] conference with A. Wessberg regarding trademark issues related to [REDACTED] draft email guidance to Comerica team regarding [REDACTED]		
03/26/19	S. Helland	Teleconference with Comerica team regarding [REDACTED] draft follow-up notes regarding same.	1.30	695.50
03/29/19	S. Helland	Reply to A. Bruce email regarding [REDACTED]	0.90	481.50

**Total for Fees: 8,685.50**

**Costs and Other Charges**

03/13/19	Federal Express			14.91
<b>Total For Costs and Other Charges:</b>				<b>14.91</b>

**Total This Matter: 8,700.41**

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 92

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1002  
**Regarding:** Domain Names

03/11/19	A. Wessberg	Review correspondence from [REDACTED] [REDACTED] request further documentation from J. Razcak.	0.20	108.00
----------	-------------	---	------	--------

**Total for Fees:** 108.00

**Total This Matter:** 108.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 93

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1003  
**Regarding:** Enforcement

03/04/19	S. Bell	<p>Review e-mails regarding opposition of Netgear's NPG mark in the European Union and potential assignment/re-assignment in Japan; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding same; review e-mails regarding settlement communications with [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; update enforcement chart regarding instructions [REDACTED]; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED]; update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] cease and desist letter; update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter to [REDACTED]; update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter sent to [REDACTED]; update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter sent to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails</p>	1.60	288.00
----------	---------	---	------	--------

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 94  
Matter No: 077376.1003

		regarding [REDACTED] continued infringement; update enforcement chart regarding same.		
03/06/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review infringing merchandise of [REDACTED] and call to his attorney regarding same.	0.40	140.00
03/07/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding same; update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same.	0.40	72.00
03/08/19	T. Deutmeyer	Call from counsel for [REDACTED]	0.10	35.00
03/11/19	S. Bell	Review watch notices; review e-mail from foreign associate regarding cease and desist letter sent to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same.	2.50	450.00
03/11/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and opine on trademark watch notices; review and confirm compliance [REDACTED] review for compliance [REDACTED] and report and advise Comerica regarding same.	1.20	420.00
03/12/19	T. Deutmeyer	Receive instructions from Comerica regarding [REDACTED]	0.30	105.00
03/14/19	S. Bell	Finalize and send e-mail to A. Bruce regarding watch notices; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement	0.70	126.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 95  
Matter No: 077376.1003

03/18/19	S. Bell	chart regarding same. Review watch notices; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter sent to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding status of cease and desist letters regarding [REDACTED]	1.60	288.00
03/18/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review for compliance the web site and social media pages [REDACTED] [REDACTED] advise Comerica on options [REDACTED]	0.70	245.00
03/19/19	S. Bell	Update enforcement chart regarding cease and desist letter to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] for confirmation of removal of mixes which include Prince music.	0.70	126.00
03/19/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review for compliance [REDACTED] [REDACTED] and web site of the [REDACTED]	2.60	910.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 96  
Matter No: 077376.1003

		<p>██████████ and draft follow-up demand to ██████████ review reply correspondence from ██████████ and report to Comerica that matter has concluded; receive instructions from Comerica regarding ██████████ review matter as to ██████████ review for compliance the web site of ██████████ review for compliance the web sites and social media pages of ██████████ and advise Comerica regarding same; review for compliance the web sites and social media pages of ██████████</p>		
		<p>review additional infringing prints on ██████████ and send to MarkMonitor.</p>		
03/20/19	S. Bell	<p>Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding watch notice; e-mail to foreign associate regarding no opposition to be filed; e-mail to foreign associate regarding ██████████</p>	0.50	90.00
03/20/19	T. Deutmeyer	<p>Advise MarkMonitor on basis for take-down request of web site ██████████ review MarkMonitor's status report.</p>	0.20	70.00
03/21/19	T. Deutmeyer	<p>Review monthly enforcement chart and review status ██████████ review status of ██████████ web site and send follow-up request to Comerica; calls and follow-up demand to ██████████ review Amazon links for ██████████ review matter as to ██████████ send follow-up demand to ██████████ review and</p>	1.90	665.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. ██████████

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 97  
Matter No: 077376.1003

		analyze status of [REDACTED] YouTube.		
03/22/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft argument to counsel [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; review infringing material sold by [REDACTED] and draft follow-up demand letter to counsel for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review infringing pin on web site for the store of [REDACTED] in Minneapolis and advise Comerica on takedown; review correspondence from agent for [REDACTED] [REDACTED] and draft further demand.	1.80	630.00
03/25/19	E. Newby	Perform research regarding the [REDACTED] gather [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.80	124.00
03/25/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter sent to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter sent to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart	2.10	378.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered  
as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A. Attn:  
Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484



**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 98  
Matter No: 077376.1003

regarding same; review e-mails regarding  
[REDACTED] infringing merchandise;  
update enforcement chart regarding same;  
review e-mails regarding cease and desist  
letter to [REDACTED] update enforcement  
chart regarding same; update enforcement  
chart regarding c [REDACTED]  
update enforcement chart regarding  
[REDACTED]  
update enforcement chart regarding  
[REDACTED] update  
enforcement chart regarding completion of  
[REDACTED] update  
enforcement chart regarding completion of  
[REDACTED] update enforcement  
chart regarding [REDACTED]  
update enforcement chart regarding  
completion of [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED] review e-mails regarding cease  
and desist letter to [REDACTED] update  
enforcement chart regarding same; update  
enforcement chart regarding [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED] review e-mails regarding  
[REDACTED] update  
enforcement chart regarding same; review  
e-mail regarding [REDACTED] update  
enforcement chart regarding same; review  
e-mails regarding [REDACTED] update  
enforcement chart regarding same; review  
e-mail regarding [REDACTED]  
[REDACTED] update enforcement chart  
regarding same; update enforcement chart  
regarding status of [REDACTED]

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 99  
Matter No: 077376.1003

03/25/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review status update from UK counsel regarding [REDACTED] review Dutch counsel opinion regarding [REDACTED]	2.10	735.00
03/27/19	S. Bell	Update enforcement chart; send same to T. Deutmeyer for review.	0.60	108.00
03/27/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review instructions from Comerica and instruct [REDACTED]; review and confirm final form of enforcement chart; recommend next action as to YouTube page for [REDACTED]	1.70	595.00
03/28/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail regarding [REDACTED] continued infringement; update enforcement chart regarding same; review e-mail regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; update enforcement chart regarding [REDACTED] cease and desist letter; update enforcement chart regarding [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding completion of [REDACTED]; review e-mails regarding cease and desist letter to [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same; review watch notices.	1.40	252.00
03/28/19	T. Deutmeyer	Correspond with [REDACTED] call to and	0.60	210.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 100  
Matter No: 077376.1003

		from [REDACTED] review web site of [REDACTED] and review Facebook page of [REDACTED] [REDACTED] and follow-up with MarkMonitor regarding same.		
03/29/19	S. Bell	Finalize and send enforcement chart to A. Bruce; finalize and send e-mails to A. Bruce regarding watch notices.	0.60	108.00
03/29/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review weekly watch notices; call with A. Bruce regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; draft response to follow-up question [REDACTED] review Facebook report as [REDACTED] and draft supplemental report for MarkMonitor to send.	2.00	700.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 101  
Matter No: 077376.1003

Total for Fees: 7,870.00

**Costs and Other Charges**

03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates	13.50
03/14/19	Banning - 14619/383957 - Foreign fees associated with receiving instructions regarding cease and desist letter [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review social media sites for [REDACTED] capture screen shots; draft cease and desist letter and acknowledgment and undertaking; email same to T. Deutmeyer; telephone conference with [REDACTED]	1,604.10
03/20/19	[REDACTED] revise cease and desist letter as well Potter Clarkson - 926290 - Foreign fees for reviewing email in relation to this matter; preparation of cease and desist letter; research [REDACTED] check status and respond accordingly with developments; further correspondence to the other side; respond to [REDACTED] and re-send original letter and undertakings; review response from [REDACTED] and respond, report same; review [REDACTED]	848.64
03/01/19	Julie Witt - Other - [REDACTED] [REDACTED] monitoring items offered for sale by retailer that continues to sell items that infringe on client's intellectual property.	15.00
03/22/19	Julie Witt - Other - [REDACTED] [REDACTED] retailer that continues to sell items that infringe on client's intellectual property.	15.00
03/28/19	Sara Bell - Other - [REDACTED] [REDACTED] that infringe on client's intellectual property [REDACTED]	103.70

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 2,599.94

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 102  
Matter No: 077376.1003

**Total This Matter: 10,469.94**

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 103

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1016  
**Regarding:** TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (1794869) (CA)

**Costs and Other Charges**

03/27/19	Bereskin & Parr - 900304759 - Reviewing an office action [REDACTED] [REDACTED] for TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (App. No. 1794869) in Canada.	265.56
<b>Total For Costs and Other Charges:</b>		<b>265.56</b>
<b>Total This Matter:</b>		<b>265.56</b>

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 104

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1017  
**Regarding:** TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (IC 14) (CN)

03/07/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 105

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1029  
**Regarding:** TM: PAISLEY PARK (1794862) (CA)

03/18/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding upcoming response deadline for PAISLEY PARK mark in Canada.	0.10	18.00
03/20/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding response to office action deadline for PAISLEY PARK mark in Canada.	0.10	18.00

Total for Fees: 36.00

Total This Matter: 36.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 106

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1039  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (1794871) (CA)

03/18/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding upcoming response deadline for PRINCE mark in Canada.	0.10	18.00
03/20/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding response to office action deadline for PRINCE mark in Canada.	0.10	18.00
03/26/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding Examiner's report for PRINCE mark in Canada.	0.60	108.00
03/26/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review Office Action and advise [REDACTED]	0.20	70.00

**Total for Fees:** 214.00

**Costs and Other Charges**

11/08/18	Bereskin & Parr - 900284394 - Foreign fees associated with preparation and filing of response to an office action relating to substantive and technical issues and reporting same; for TM: PRINCE (App. No. 1794871) in Classes 9, 25 and 41 in Canada.	874.33
----------	---	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 874.33

**Total This Matter:** 1,088.33

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 107

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1041  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (CN)

03/05/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding filing details for opposition filed by Prince Sports, LLC against PRINCE mark (CL 25) in China.	0.10	18.00
03/07/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding status of opposition filed against PRINCE mark (CL 25) in China by Prince Sports, LLC.	0.10	18.00

**Total for Fees:** 36.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/06/19	Western Union Business Solutions - 273 - Monthly wire transfer fee for foreign associates	6.00
----------	---	------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 6.00

**Total This Matter:** 42.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 108

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1044  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (Class 25) (2016083439) (JP)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Correspondence to foreign associate regarding [REDACTED] PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Japan.	0.30	54.00
03/07/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED] PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Japan.	0.10	18.00
03/11/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED] PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Japan.	0.10	18.00

**Total for Fees:** 90.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/04/19	Federal Express	45.29
01/22/19	Shusaku Yamamoto Co. - CR18111513 - Duplicate payment of invoice 18-111513 on check number 363313 and 363182	(909.00)

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** -863.71

**Total This Matter:** (773.71)

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 109

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1051  
**Regarding:** TM: VANITY 6 (86661729) (US)

03/07/19	E. Newby	Prepare [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.50	77.50
03/08/19	E. Newby	Revise [REDACTED] response to the Office Action received for VANITY 6 in Class 9;	0.40	62.00
03/11/19	E. Newby	[REDACTED] confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.40	62.00

**Total for Fees:** 201.50

**Total This Matter:** 201.50

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 110

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1057  
**Regarding:** TM: THE REVOLUTION (87390311) (US)

03/13/19	E. Newby	[REDACTED] confer with A. Wessberg regarding same; Draft, finalize, and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark THE REVOLUTION in Classes 9 and 41.	0.60	93.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 128.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	250.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 250.00

**Total This Matter:** 378.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 111

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1059  
**Regarding:** TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (87472940) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark Prince Symbol Design in Class 15.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark Prince Symbol Design in Class 15.	0.10	15.50
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 97.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 222.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 112

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1060  
**Regarding:** **TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (87472956) (US)**

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark Prince Symbol Design in Class 21.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark Prince Symbol Design in Class 21.	0.10	15.50
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 97.00

**Costs and Other Charges**

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 222.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 113

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1061  
**Regarding:** TM: Miscellaneous Design (1) (Prince Symbol) (87472977) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark Prince Symbol Design in Class 43.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark Prince Symbol Design in Class 43.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 114

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1064  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (87457731) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark NPG in Class 15.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark NPG in Class 15.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 115

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1065  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (87457733) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark NPG in Class 21.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark NPG in Class 21.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 116

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1068  
**Regarding:** TM: PAISLEY PARK (Class 15) (87457736) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PAISLEY PARK in Class 15.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the Third Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PAISLEY PARK in Class 15.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 117

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1071  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (Class 14) (87472987) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 14.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 14.	0.10	15.50
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 97.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 222.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 118

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1072  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (Class 16) (87472998) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 16.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 16.	0.10	15.50
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 97.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 222.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 119

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1073  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (Class 21) (87473003) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 21.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 21.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 120

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1074  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (Class 35) (87473022) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 35.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 35.	0.10	15.50
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 97.00

**Costs and Other Charges**

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 222.00

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 121

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1075  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (Class 41) (87473029) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 41.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 41.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 122

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1082  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (87472980) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 9.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 9.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 123

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1083  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (87472992) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 15	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 15.	0.10	15.50
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 97.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 222.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 124

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1084  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (87473006) (US)

03/12/19	E. Newby	Draft the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 25.	0.30	46.50
03/13/19	E. Newby	Finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark PRINCE in Class 25.	0.20	31.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and sign Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 112.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/13/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an Extension of Time	125.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 125.00

**Total This Matter:** 237.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 125

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1129  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (IC 9) (JP)

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED] NPG mark (CL 9) in Japan.	0.20	36.00
03/04/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review report from Japanese counsel of [REDACTED]	0.10	35.00
03/26/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED] NPG mark (CL 9) in Japan.	0.10	18.00
03/28/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review [REDACTED] ; instruct Japanese counsel [REDACTED]	0.30	105.00
03/29/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails from foreign associate regarding payment of registration fee for NPG mark (CL 9) in Japan.	0.10	18.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 126  
Matter No: 077376.1129

Total for Fees: 212.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/04/19	Shusaku Yamamoto Co. - 18-113114 - Foreign fees associated with reviewing Official Action and preparing comments regarding same; filing Amendment and Argument requesting stay of examination with respect to cited rejection for the pending application and reporting same; [REDACTED]	3,999.00
----------	--	----------

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 3,999.00

Total This Matter: 4,211.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 127

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1141  
**Regarding:** TM: THE REVOLUTION (Cl. 9, 41) (1860283) (CA)

**Costs and Other Charges**

02/28/19	Bereskin & Parr - 900301199 - Foreign fees associated with preparation and filing response to an office action relating to several substantive issues; reporting same; for TM: THE REVOLUTION (Class 9, 41) (App. No. 1860283) in Canada.	673.96
<b>Total For Costs and Other Charges:</b>		<b>673.96</b>
<b>Total This Matter:</b>		<b>673.96</b>

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 128

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1147  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (IC 9, 14, 15, 21, 25) (AU)

03/12/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding acceptance of NETGEAR's NPG application in Australia; e-mail to foreign associate [REDACTED]	0.20	36.00
03/12/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review inquiry from Estate's Australian counsel regarding NETGEAR's similar mark in Australia.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 71.00

**Total This Matter:** 71.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 129

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1152  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 9, 14, 15, 21, 25, 41) (AU)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding certificate of registration for PRINCE mark in Australia.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/22/19	Shelston IP - 509333 - Foreign fees associated with reviewing Notice of Acceptance; checking details of the accepted application; forwarding details with advice; updating records and policing for opposition; receiving, checking and forwarding the Certificate of Registration with advice; and updating records; for TM: PRINCE (Reg. No. 1880116) in Classes 09, 14, 15, 21, 25, 41 in Australia.	830.00
----------	---	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 830.00

**Total This Matter:** 848.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 130

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1155  
**Regarding:** TM: Prince (IC 9) (Refiled) (CN)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding certificate of registration for PRINCE mark (CL 9) in China.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	---	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 131

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1161  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (BR)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding publication of appeal for PRINCE mark (CL 9) in Brazil.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 132

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1162  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (BR)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding publication of appeal for PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Brazil.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	---	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson**  
& BYRON, P.A.**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 133

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1163  
**Regarding:** TM: PURPLE RAIN (IC 9) (BR)

03/14/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding payment of registration fees for PURPLE RAIN mark (CL 9) in Brazil; e-mail to foreign associate regarding instructions for same.	0.20	36.00
03/22/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding payment of registration fees for PURPLE RAIN mark (CL 9) in Brazil.	0.10	18.00

**Total for Fees:** 54.00

**Costs and Other Charges**

03/21/19	Guerra IP - 110819 - Foreign fees associated with arranging paying final registration fees, including official fees; for TM: PURPLE RAIN (App. No. 913749249) in Brazil.	594.32
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 594.32

**Total This Matter:** 648.32

**EXHIBIT B**

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com

Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 134

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1164  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (IC 9) (CA)

03/18/19	C. Whittaker	Prepare substantive draft e-mail regarding Office Action received for the mark NPG (Class 9) in Canada, outlining issues and strategy for response regarding same.	1.00	140.00
03/19/19	C. Whittaker	Continue to prepare substantive draft e-mail regarding Office Action received for the mark NPG (Class 9) in Canada, outlining issues and strategy for response regarding same.	0.50	70.00
03/20/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review Office Action [REDACTED]	0.60	210.00
03/22/19	C. Whittaker	Draft e-mail to foreign associate regarding response to office action.	0.50	70.00

**Total for Fees:** 490.00

**Total This Matter:** 490.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 135

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1165  
**Regarding:** TM: PURPLE RAIN (IC 9) (CA)

03/19/19	C. Whittaker	Prepare substantive draft e-mail regarding Office Action received for the mark PURPLE RAIN (Class 9) in Canada, outlining issues and strategy for response regarding same.	0.60	84.00
03/20/19	C. Whittaker	Continue to prepare substantive draft e-mail regarding Office Action received for the mark PURPLE RAIN (Class 9) in Canada, outlining issues and strategy for response regarding same.	0.60	84.00

**Total for Fees:** 168.00

**Total This Matter:** 168.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 136

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1169  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (MX)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails regarding final decision issued for PRINCE mark (CL 9) in Mexico.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 137

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1170  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (MX)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails regarding final decision issued for PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Mexico.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	---	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 138

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1171  
**Regarding:** TM: PURPLE RAIN (IC 9) (MX)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding certificate of registration for PURPLE RAIN mark (CL 9) in Mexico.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	---	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 139

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1179  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 25) (TH)

03/12/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding notary section for assignment/re-assignment of PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Thailand.	0.30	54.00
03/20/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding Prince Sports change of name document for PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Thailand.	0.20	36.00
03/22/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding confirmation of receipt of change of name documents for assignment of PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Thailand.	0.10	18.00
03/29/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails from foreign associate regarding recordation of assignment from Paisley Park to Prince Sports for PRINCE mark (CL 25) in Thailand.	0.20	36.00

**Total for Fees:** 144.00

**Total This Matter:** 144.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 140

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1206  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (IC 9) (ZA)

03/18/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding certificate of registration for NPG mark (CL 9) in South Africa.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	---	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

**Total This Matter:** 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 141

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1216  
**Regarding:** THE PRINCE ESTATE (87700341) (Cl. 25) (US)

03/05/19	E. Newby	Draft, finalize and electronically file the First Request for Extension to File a Statement of Use for the mark THE PRINCE ESTATE OFFICIAL & APPROVED & Design in Classes 14, 18, and 25.	0.90	139.50
03/05/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and execute Request for Extension of Time to File a Statement of Use.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 174.50

### Costs and Other Charges

03/05/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing an EOT	375.00
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 375.00

**Total This Matter:** 549.50

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 142

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1245  
**Regarding:** TM: THE PURPLE ONE (17922017) (IC 9, 41) (EM)

### Costs and Other Charges

03/20/19	Potter Clarkson - 926284 - Foreign fees associated with monitoring status of application during pendency; reviewing and checking Certificate of Registration; forwarding same upon receipt; for TM: THE PURPLE ONE (App. No. 17922017) International Classes 9, 41) in the European Union.	438.51
03/20/19	Potter Clarkson - 926286 - Foreign fees associated with c [REDACTED] TM: THE PURPLE ONE in International Classes 9 and 41.	112.80

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 551.31

**Total This Matter:** 551.31

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 143

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1260  
**Regarding:** TM: NEW POWER GENERATION (3341510) (Class 3341510) (GB)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding notice of publication for NEW POWER GENERATION mark (CL 9, 35, 41) in the United Kingdom.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 18.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/20/19	Potter Clarkson - 926287 - Foreign fees associated with advising [REDACTED] prepare response to Examination Report; review Examination Report from the UK Registry and objections raised; report same; receive instructions [REDACTED] prepare response to the UKIPO Office Action and report; report publication of application; for TM: NEW POWER GENERATION (App.	449.28
----------	--	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 449.28

**Total This Matter:** 467.28

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 144

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1261  
**Regarding:** TM: NPG (Class 9) (CN)

03/05/19	S. Bell	E-mail to foreign associate regarding filing details for NPG mark (CL 9) in China.	0.20	36.00
03/07/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding status of NPG mark (CL 9) in China.	0.10	18.00
03/26/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding certificate of registration for NPG mark (CL 9) in China.	0.10	18.00

**Total for Fees:** 72.00

**Total This Matter:** 72.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 145

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1262  
**Regarding:** TM: PURPLE COLOR MARK (Classes 9, 41) (US)

03/07/19	E. Newby	Gather additional evidence for the Response to the Office Action received for the PURPLE COLOR MARK in Classes 9 and 41.	0.70	108.50
03/29/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review [REDACTED] correspondence to A. Aycock regarding [REDACTED].	0.50	175.00

**Total for Fees:** 283.50

**Total This Matter:** 283.50

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 146

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1263  
**Regarding:** TM: CLOUD (App. No. 88141856) (Class 15) (US)

03/05/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] analyze [REDACTED] CLOUD GUITAR trademark rights.	2.40	840.00
03/18/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and analyze [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.90	315.00
03/20/19	A. Wessberg	Provide direction to T. Deutmeyer regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review documents from J. Raczak regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.30	162.00

Total for Fees: 1,317.00

Total This Matter: 1,317.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 147

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1264  
**Regarding:** TM: CLOUD GUITAR CONFIGURATION (Class 15) (US)

03/11/19	A. Wessberg	Internal telephone conference regarding [REDACTED] CLOUD GUITAR with K. Steinert, T. Deutmeyer and C. Moyer.	0.30	162.00
03/11/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Internal conference regarding [REDACTED] email to Comerica regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	257.50
03/11/19	T. Deutmeyer	Analyze [REDACTED]	0.40	140.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Call with Comerica regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; analyze [REDACTED]	0.40	140.00
03/14/19	T. Deutmeyer	Analyze [REDACTED] inquire with Comerica regarding same.	0.40	140.00

**Total for Fees:** 839.50

**Total This Matter:** 839.50

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered  
as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn:  
Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 148

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1265  
**Regarding:** TM: APOLLONIA 6 (Class 9) (App. No. 88145070) (US)

03/06/19	T. Deutmeyer	Work on [REDACTED]	1.20	420.00
03/19/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft follow-up demand to counsel [REDACTED]	0.30	105.00

**Total for Fees:** 525.00

**Total This Matter:** 525.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 149

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1267  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (JP)

03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails from foreign associate regarding recording assignment/re-assignment of PRINCE mark (CL 9) in Japan.	0.20	36.00
----------	---------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 36.00

### Costs and Other Charges

02/28/19	Shusaku Yamamoto Co. - 18-113024 - Foreign fees associated with reviewing assignment and Office Action and reporting same; preparation and filing of argument in response to Office Action; file Deed of Assignment, Power of Attorney and Assignment of Trademark Rights from Paisley Park Enterprises, Inc. to Nissan Motor Corporation; filing request for extension of time to respond to Office Action; official fees for the filings	2,588.00
----------	--	----------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 2,588.00

**Total This Matter:** 2,624.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 150

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1268  
**Regarding:** TM: PRINCE (IC 9) (Refiled 2018) (CN)

### Costs and Other Charges

03/11/19	Vivien Chan & Co. - AJ6152 - Foreign fees associated with initiating discussions with agents of marks cited for opposition (Mark Nos. 4100650; 6482970 and 6482975) for letters of consent; preparation and filing non use cancellation against mark no. 14675652 and reporting same; preparing, re-filing and reporting same for application TM: PRINCE in Class 9 in China.	1,630.00
<b>Total For Costs and Other Charges:</b>		<b>1,630.00</b>
<b>Total This Matter:</b>		<b>1,630.00</b>

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 151

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1269  
**Regarding:** TM: LOVE SYMBOL GUITAR (Class 15) (US)

03/04/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review correspondence regarding [REDACTED] correspondence to Comerica regarding same.	0.20	70.00
03/19/19	E. Newby	Draft email to A. Bruce regarding the [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.20	31.00

Total for Fees: 101.00

Total This Matter: 101.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 152

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1271  
**Regarding:** TM: JAMIE STARR (Class 41) (US)

03/11/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and analyze Comerica inquiry regarding [REDACTED] review findings of T. Guy regarding the same; advise Comerica regarding same.	0.50	175.00
03/15/19	E. Newby	Draft and finalize the First Response to Office Action for the mark JAMIE STARR in 41; confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.60	93.00
03/15/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review instructions from Comerica, and confirm final form and execute Response to Office Action; report to Comerica regarding filing of same.	0.40	140.00
03/18/19	E. Newby	Electronically submit the First Response to Office Action for the mark JAMIE STARR in 41; confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same	0.30	46.50
03/19/19	E. Newby	Draft email to A. Bruce regarding the convention deadline for JAMIE STARR in Class 41; confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.20	31.00
03/19/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and confirm final form of report on trademark convention priority deadlines.	0.10	35.00

**Total for Fees:** 520.50

**Total This Matter:** 520.50

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 153

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1272  
**Regarding:** TM: PAISLEY PARK (App. No. 88220053) (Class 43) (US)

03/19/19	E. Newby	Draft email to A. Bruce regarding the convention deadline for PAISLEY PARK in Class 43; confer with T. Deutmeyer regarding the same.	0.20	31.00
----------	----------	--	------	-------

**Total for Fees:** 31.00

**Total This Matter:** 31.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 154

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.1274  
**Regarding:** TM: VANITY 6 (86984309) (Class 9) (US)

03/07/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft Response to Office Action; analyze [REDACTED]	3.50	1,225.00
03/13/19	A. Wessberg	Review office action response and provide direction to T. Deutmeyer regarding same.	0.30	162.00
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft and file Response to Office Action.	0.50	175.00

**Total for Fees:** 1,562.00

**Total This Matter:** 1,562.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 155

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.2013  
Regarding: Dispute [REDACTED]

03/22/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding opposition of PRINCE FASHION P mark in Mexico.	0.10	18.00
----------	---------	---	------	-------

Total for Fees: 18.00

Total This Matter: 18.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson****& BYRON, P.A.****INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 156

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.2014  
**Regarding:** Dispute w [REDACTED]

03/29/19	C. Moyer	Review communication from Chinese firm about opposition to PRINCENB; review decision; review options.	0.30	156.00
03/29/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding opposition of NB.PRINCE mark in China; draft e-mail to A. Bruce regarding same.	0.40	72.00

**Total for Fees:** 228.00

**Total This Matter:** 228.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 157

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.2032  
Regarding: Dispute

03/01/19	C. Moyer	Telephone call to [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepare communication to attorney [REDACTED] [REDACTED] prepare communication to T. Deutmeyer regarding same; review response from U.S. attorney [REDACTED] [REDACTED] respond to same and update T. Deutmeyer.	0.70	364.00
03/01/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft update to Estate's UK counsel regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] review correspondence from U.S. counsel [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	35.00
03/04/19	C. Moyer	File 60-day request for extension of time to oppose on behalf of NPG Records, Inc.; File 60-day request for extension of time to oppose on behalf of Paisley Park Enterprises, Inc.; serve counsel with same; review order granting extension request.	0.90	468.00
03/04/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same.	0.20	36.00
03/06/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft correspondence to UK counsel as to [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	35.00
03/07/19	S. Bell	Review e-mails regarding [REDACTED]	0.10	18.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered  
as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn:  
Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 158  
Matter No: 077376.2032

03/08/19	T. Deutmeyer	[REDACTED] update enforcement chart regarding same. Review report from UK counsel on [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.10	35.00
----------	--------------	---	------	-------

Total for Fees: 991.00

### Costs and Other Charges

03/04/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing 60-day extension of time to oppose with consent on behalf of NPG Records, Inc	200.00
03/04/19	U.S. Patent and Trademark Office - Government fees associated with filing 60-day extension of time to oppose with consent on behalf of Paisley Park Enterprises, Inc.	200.00

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 400.00

Total This Matter: 1,391.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 159

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.2034  
**Regarding:** Dispute [REDACTED]

03/04/19	A. Wessberg	Confer with T. Deutmeyer and [REDACTED]	0.40	216.00
----------	-------------	---	------	--------

**Total for Fees:** 216.00

**Total This Matter:** 216.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 160

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.2035  
Regarding: Dispute [REDACTED]

03/04/19	T. Deutmeyer	Draft and analyze [REDACTED] [REDACTED] advise Comerica regarding same.	2.00	700.00
03/14/19	T. Deutmeyer	Call with counsel [REDACTED] and report to Comerica regarding same.	0.50	175.00
03/19/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review [REDACTED] [REDACTED] advise Comerica regarding same, and inquire as to [REDACTED]	0.40	140.00
03/31/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review comments from Comerica regarding [REDACTED] draft response to inquiries of J. Boyarski; phone message from counsel [REDACTED] [REDACTED] follow-up to Comerica regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]	0.40	140.00

Total for Fees: 1,155.00

Total This Matter: 1,155.00

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered  
as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn:  
Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 161

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.2037  
Regarding: Dispute [REDACTED]

03/04/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review and send to MarkMonitor for [REDACTED]; review inquiry from MarkMonitor regarding another event page bearing the Love Symbol.	0.60	210.00
----------	--------------	---	------	--------

Total for Fees: 210.00

Total This Matter: 210.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

**Fredrikson**  
& BYRON, P.A.**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 162

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.2038  
**Regarding:** Dispute with [REDACTED]

03/12/19	C. Moyer	Review documents from T. Deutmeyer; telephone call to [REDACTED]; [REDACTED]; prepare follow-up written communication to R. Rapp regarding same and [REDACTED]	0.50	260.00
----------	----------	--	------	--------

**Total for Fees:** 260.00

**Total This Matter:** 260.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 163

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.2045  
Regarding: Dispute [REDACTED]

	03/04/19	T. Deutmeyer	Demand that [REDACTED] surrender trade dress registration and cease [REDACTED] draft correspondence to counsel [REDACTED]	0.50	175.00
	03/05/19	C. Moyer	Telephone call with T. Deutmeyer regarding [REDACTED] review further email from T. Deutmeyer; review documents related to estate and sales.	1.50	780.00
	03/05/19	K. Sandler Steinert	Telephone conference with T. Deutmeyer regarding [REDACTED]	0.40	206.00
	03/05/19	T. Deutmeyer	Advise on and review [REDACTED]	0.50	175.00
	03/05/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review request for [REDACTED] and draft response to such counsel.	0.20	70.00
L140	03/08/19	K. Rogers	Research [REDACTED]	1.80	477.00
	03/11/19	C. Moyer	Review materials circulated by T. Deutmeyer before telephone conference call; participate in telephone call regarding [REDACTED] brief conference with A. Wessberg after telephone call.	0.90	468.00
L140	03/12/19	K. Rogers	Continue researching decisions [REDACTED]	4.10	1,086.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 164  
Matter No: 077376.2045

		[REDACTED] and		
		summarize results of same.		
03/13/19	C. Moyer	Review communication from T. Deutmeyer with research [REDACTED]	0.50	260.00
		[REDACTED] begin reviewing cases.		
03/13/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review [REDACTED]	0.40	140.00
		[REDACTED]		
03/14/19	C. Moyer	Review communication from T. Deutmeyer regarding [REDACTED]	0.70	364.00
		[REDACTED] review documents relating to same; review communication from K. Steinert regarding [REDACTED]		
		review [REDACTED]		
03/18/19	C. Moyer	Review information from client regarding [REDACTED]	0.20	104.00
03/29/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review case law and research regarding [REDACTED]	1.60	560.00
		[REDACTED]; review status [REDACTED]		
		[REDACTED] call to USPTO Senior Attorney requesting status update [REDACTED]		
03/30/19	C. Moyer	Review communication from T. Deutmeyer regarding research [REDACTED]	1.20	624.00
		[REDACTED] review some of the cases attached to communication.		

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 165  
Matter No: 077376.2045

Total for Fees: 5,489.50

### Costs and Other Charges

Research via Westlaw 450.00

Total For Costs and Other Charges: 450.00

Total This Matter: 5,939.50

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 166

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.2046

**Regarding:** Dispute [REDACTED]

03/18/19	A. Wessberg	Review [REDACTED]; provide direction to T. Deutmeyer regarding same.	0.20	108.00
----------	-------------	--	------	--------

**Total for Fees:** 108.00

**Total This Matter:** 108.00

## EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 167

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

**Client Account#:** 077376.2048  
**Regarding:** Opposition of THE PURPLE VISION (3307979) (GB)

### Costs and Other Charges

03/29/19	Potter Clarkson - 926285 - Foreign fees associated with finalizing agreement, forwarding for review and reviewing comments and instructions; reviewing amended agreement; send to opposing party with correspondence; review further instructions and respond accordingly; for Opposition of THE PURPLE VISION (App. No. 3307979) in Great Britain.	440.18
----------	---	--------

**Total For Costs and Other Charges:** 440.18

**Total This Matter:** 440.18

### EXHIBIT B

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, P.A., Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

## INVOICE DETAIL

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycock  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 168

For Previously Unbilled Professional Services Rendered Through March 31, 2019:

Client Account#: 077376.2056

Regarding: [REDACTED] NPG (2018-124299) (JP)

Date	Client	Description	Hours	Amount
03/01/19	T. Deutmeyer	Review [REDACTED] NPG mark in Japan; review and work on [REDACTED]; review status [REDACTED] draft analysis and inquiry to Japanese counsel for The Prince Estate.	0.80	280.00
03/04/19	T. Deutmeyer	[REDACTED] review advice from Paisley Park's Japanese counsel and [REDACTED]	0.50	175.00
03/11/19	S. Bell	Review e-mail from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED] e-mail to foreign associate regarding [REDACTED]; review e-mail from foreign associate regarding [REDACTED]	0.50	90.00
03/14/19	S. Bell	E-mail to [REDACTED] status of NPG mark in Japan.	0.20	36.00
03/15/19	S. Bell	E-mail to [REDACTED]	0.20	36.00

### EXHIBIT B

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484

# Fredrikson

& BYRON, P.A.

**INVOICE DETAIL**

Prince Rogers Nelson Estate  
c/o Angela W. Aycok  
Vice President  
Comerica Wealth Management  
411 W. Lafayette, 2nd Floor  
Detroit, MI 48226

Invoice: 1525887  
April 15, 2019  
Page: 169  
Matter No: 077376.2056

Total for Fees: 617.00

Total This Matter: 617.00

**EXHIBIT B**

Communications concerning disputed debts, including an instrument tendered as full satisfaction of a debt, are to be sent to Fredrikson & Byron, PA, Attn: Credit Department, 200 South Sixth Street, Suite 4000, Minneapolis, MN 55402

main 612.492.7000  
fax 612.492.7077  
www.fredlaw.com  
Tax ID No. [REDACTED]

Fredrikson & Byron, P.A.  
Attorneys & Advisors  
P.O. Box 1484  
Minneapolis, Minnesota  
55480-1484