

STATE OF MINNESOTA

FIRST JUDICIAL DISTRICT

COUNTY OF CARVER

DISTRICT COURT  
PROBATE DIVISION

---

In re:

Court File No. 10-PR-16-46

Judge Kevin W. Eide

Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson,

Decedent.

**AFFIDAVIT OF MATTHEW SHEA IN  
SUPPORT OF GRAY PLANT MOOTY'S  
APPLICATION FOR DETERMINATION  
AND ESTABLISHMENT OF  
ATTORNEY'S LIEN AND ENTRY OF  
JUDGMENT FOR LIEN AGAINST  
TYKA NELSON'S INTEREST IN THESE  
ESTATE PROCEEDINGS**

---

STATE OF MINNESOTA    )  
  ) ss.  
COUNTY OF HENNEPIN    )

Matthew J. Shea, being first duly sworn and upon oath, deposes and says as follows:

1. I am an attorney and a shareholder at Gray, Plant, Mooty, Mooty & Bennett, P.A. ("GPM") practicing in the Trust, Estate, and Charitable Planning practice group. I make this affidavit in support of GPM's Application for Determination and Establishment of Attorney's Lien and Entry of Judgment for Lien Against Tyka Nelson's Interest in These Estate Proceedings ("Application").

2. In April 2016, Tyka Nelson ("Tyka") retained GPM to represent her in connection with the administration of the Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson ("Estate"). On April 26, 2016, GPM commenced these proceedings on behalf of Tyka by filing a Petition for the Appointment of a Special Administrator. GPM served as counsel of record for Tyka in these proceedings until September 27, 2016, when the law firm of Holland & Knight filed its notice of substitution as her counsel. For some time thereafter, GPM worked with Holland & Knight to ensure a smooth

transition of the work and to seek reimbursement from the Estate for legal services GPM provided that benefitted the Estate as a whole.

3. In orders dated November 3, 2016 and March 10, 2017, the Court determined that much of the work GPM performed in connection with the Estate benefitted the Estate as a whole, as opposed to Tyka individually, and as such the Court authorized the Estate to pay GPM for this work, in the total amount of \$226,652.25.

4. In light of payments GPM received from the Estate for work that benefitted the Estate as a whole, a balance of \$116,652.11 remains due and owing to GPM from Tyka. This is the amount GPM asks the Court to determine and establish as the amount of GPM's attorney's lien against Tyka's interest in these Estate proceedings, and to enter judgment accordingly.

5. Attached as **Exhibits A and B** are true and accurate copies of time and expense reports generated by GPM that substantiate the balance due and owing from Tyka.

6. Exhibit A (matter 416262; balance of \$32,514 reflected on bill # 742573) relates to services GPM always believed were for the benefit of Tyka individually, as opposed to the Estate as a whole. GPM never sought to be reimbursed by the Estate for these services.

7. Exhibit B (matter 411771; balance of \$84,137.91 reflected on bill #s 734889, 742571, and 742597) relates to services GPM initially believed were for the benefit of the Estate as a whole, as opposed to Tyka individually. GPM sought to be reimbursed by the Estate for these services performed on or before September 27, 2016 (as reflected on bill 734889, which is of record with the Court as Exhibit A to the Affidavit of Matthew Shea dated Dec. 27, 2016, filed on Feb. 8, 2017). GPM's request was granted in part, and thus a balance remains due and owing.

8. I and other attorneys at GPM reviewed the original time and expense records regarding the legal work underlying this Application and affirm that the work was actually

performed for the benefit of Tyka, and that the fees and expenses are reasonable given: (a) the time, labor, and expertise required; (b) the complexity and novelty of problems involved; and (c) the extent of the responsibilities assumed and results obtained. Charges for any unnecessary or duplicative work has been eliminated.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NOT.

Dated: December 21, 2018

Sworn/affirmed before me this  
21st day of December, 2018.

/s/Laurie A. Lampman

Notary Public

Commission Expires: 1/31/19

/s/Matthew J. Shea

Signature

Name: Matthew Shea

Address: 500 IDS Center, 80 S. Eighth Street

City/State/Zip: Minneapolis, MN 55102

Telephone: (612) 632-3000

# **EXHIBIT A**

**(REDACTED)**



**GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

OFFICES:

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH 8TH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402  
PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444

THE WATERGATE –SUITE 700  
600 NEW HAMPSHIRE AVE NW  
WASHINGTON, DC 20037  
PHONE 202 295 2200  
FAX 202 295 2250

SUITE 500  
1010 WEST ST GERMAIN  
ST CLOUD, MN 56301  
PHONE 320 252 4414  
FAX 320 252 4482

474 45th STREET S  
FARGO, ND. 58105  
PHONE 701 356 9030  
FAX 701 356 9031

[WWW.GPMLAW.COM](http://WWW.GPMLAW.COM)

FEDERAL ID [REDACTED]

Tuesday, December 11, 2018

Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

GPM Client # 177910

## Statement of Account

Thank you for entrusting Gray Plant Mooty with your legal work. For your convenience, please find below a listing of all invoices on your account as of 12/11/2018.

### Current Outstanding Balance:

Matter 416262 - PRN Estate Matters (Personal)							
Bill Num	Bill Date	Fees	Disb	Total	Date Paid	Amt Paid	Bal Due
742573	3/20/2017	\$32,514.50	\$0.00	\$32,514.50	-	\$0.00	\$32,514.50
Totals		\$32,514.50	\$0.00	\$32,514.50		\$0.00	<b>\$32,514.50</b>

Total Balance: \$32,514.50

All amounts are billed in U.S. Dollars.

If you have any questions concerning this statement, please contact Lori Nelson-Reid at 612-632-3099 or [lori.nelson@gpmlaw.com](mailto:lori.nelson@gpmlaw.com).



GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402

PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444  
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154

WWW.GPMLAW.COM

FEDERAL ID



Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

GPM Client/Matter code: 177910/416262  
Total Amount Due This Invoice: \$32,514.50

Total Enclosed: \_\_\_\_\_

*Please return this page with your payment.*

---

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
AMOUNTS BILLED IN U.S. DOLLARS. CURRENT CHARGES ONLY, UNPAID BALANCES NOT  
INCLUDED. DISBURSEMENTS NOT YET RECORDED WILL BE INCLUDED IN FUTURE  
INVOICES.



GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402

PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444  
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154

WWW.GPMLAW.COM

FEDERAL ID [REDACTED]

Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

For Professional Services Rendered in Connection with:

416262

PRN Estate Matters (Personal)

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
05/02/16	B. Dillon	0.40	Attend to issues regarding T. Nelson's [REDACTED]
05/02/16	M. Shea	1.10	Work on securing [REDACTED]; consider issues with [REDACTED]; follow up with Bremer regarding [REDACTED].
05/03/16	M. Shea	1.00	Various conference calls with client relating to [REDACTED].
05/03/16	N. Harwood	1.50	(No Charge) Telephone conferences and emails regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; [REDACTED] [REDACTED].
05/04/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Update client regarding meetings.
05/04/16	M. Shea	1.30	Correspondence with client regarding right to publicity statute and other related matters; correspondence with Bremer regarding [REDACTED].
05/05/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Correspond with client regarding issues related to family tribute.
05/06/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with trustee relating to [REDACTED] [REDACTED].
05/09/16	N. Harwood	0.10	(No Charge) Phone conference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED].
05/11/16	B. Dillon	0.60	Telephone conference with T. Nelson and N. Harwood regarding [REDACTED].
05/12/16	B. Dillon	1.50	Telephone conference with C. Heaven-Young regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; in-office meeting with T. Nelson and M. Shea regarding case status and task list.
05/12/16	M. Shea	1.30	Prepare for and conduct meeting with client regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED].

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
AMOUNTS BILLED IN U.S. DOLLARS. CURRENT CHARGES ONLY, UNPAID BALANCES NOT INCLUDED. DISBURSEMENTS NOT YET RECORDED WILL BE INCLUDED IN FUTURE INVOICES.

G R A Y

P L A N T

M O O T Y

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 2March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
05/13/16	B. Dillon	0.60	Draft background <b>REDACTED</b> <b>REDACTED</b>
05/13/16	M. Shea	0.30	Review of T. Nelson <b>REDACTED</b>
05/16/16	B. Dillon	0.20	<b>REDACTED</b>
05/16/16	M. Shea	0.40	Review and revise <b>REDACTED</b>
05/17/16	M. Shea	0.20	Further revisions to <b>REDACTED</b>
05/17/16	N. Harwood	1.00	(No Charge) Telephone conferences with <b>REDACTED</b> <b>REDACTED</b>
05/19/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Emails with T. Nelson regarding task list, <b>REDACTED</b> <b>REDACTED</b>
05/19/16	C. Sjoberg	0.10	Telephone conference with M. Shea regarding <b>REDACTED</b> <b>REDACTED</b>
05/19/16	N. Harwood	0.50	(No Charge) Telephone conferences and emails with M. Shea and B. Dillon regarding Stinson review of <b>REDACTED</b>
05/22/16	B. Dillon	0.50	Email heirs' counsel regarding <b>REDACTED</b> <b>REDACTED</b>
05/23/16	B. Dillon	1.00	Telephone conference with T. Nelson regarding status of various matters, including <b>REDACTED</b> <b>REDACTED</b>
05/25/16	J. Debrow	1.00	Analyze issues regarding <b>REDACTED</b>
05/25/16	A. Ewald	2.70	Draft <b>REDACTED</b> strategize regarding and make edits to same.
05/25/16	B. Dillon	0.20	Confer with N. Harwood and A. Ewald on <b>REDACTED</b>
05/26/16	B. Dillon	0.20	Confer with A. Ewald <b>REDACTED</b> ; email Stinson/Bremer with request for update on estate administration issues.
05/27/16	B. Dillon	0.50	Debrief with T. Nelson.
05/27/16	M. Shea	0.80	Debrief with client; compose email to Stinson/Bremer regarding <b>REDACTED</b>
05/30/16	C. Sjoberg	0.40	Begin review and comment on <b>REDACTED</b>
05/31/16	B. Dillon	0.50	Telephone conference with T. Nelson related to issues regarding <b>REDACTED</b>
05/31/16	M. Shea	0.50	Telephone conference with client regarding same.



G R A Y

P L A N T

M O O T Y

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 3March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
05/31/16	C. Sjoberg	2.10	Review and revise REDACTED REDACTED
06/02/16	B. Dillon	0.40	Update email to T. Nelson regarding same.
06/03/16	C. Sjoberg	0.80	Review and revise REDACTED; email to M. Shea regarding the same.
06/06/16	M. Shea	0.30	Telephone call with T. Nelson regarding REDACTED REDACTED
06/09/16	M. Shea	0.30	Meet with T. Nelson REDACTED REDACTED
06/13/16	B. Dillon	0.10	Confer with M. Shea regarding REDACTED
06/15/16	B. Dillon	0.40	Confer with N. Harwood and T. Phelps on concerns regarding REDACTED REDACTED
06/15/16	M. Shea	0.20	Confer with team regarding options related to REDACTED REDACTED
06/17/16	B. Dillon	0.90	Telephone call with L. Krishnan regarding REDACTED REDACTED; email Stinson/Bremer team to request follow-up on estate administration matters; email T. Nelson with update on outstanding issues.
06/20/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Confer with M. Shea regarding REDACTED REDACTED.
06/20/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with T. Nelson related to various estate administration matters.
06/21/16	M. Shea	0.60	Correspondence with Bremer regarding REDACTED REDACTED
06/22/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Update T. Nelson regarding status of heirship claims.
06/22/16	K. Wass	1.00	(No Charge) Media survey for N. Harwood.
06/22/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with client related to special administration.
06/23/16	B. Dillon	1.10	Telephone conference with T. Nelson to discuss outstanding issues (substance and logistics for Monday's hearing, REDACTED REDACTED REDACTED; further consideration and analysis of REDACTED REDACTED
06/23/16	M. Shea	1.00	Prepare for and conduct telephone call with T. Nelson related to various administration-related matters.

**GRAY**  
**PLANT**  
**MOOTY**

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 4

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
06/24/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Telephone conference with J. Leviton and M. Shea regarding [REDACTED]
06/24/16	M. Shea	1.30	Prepare for and conduct telephone call with Bremer/Stinson relating to [REDACTED] administration matters; prepare for and conduct telephone call with T. Nelson relating to [REDACTED]
06/28/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with client relating to various matters.
06/29/16	B. Dillon	0.10	Correspond with T. Nelson on [REDACTED]
06/30/16	M. Shea	0.60	Correspondence with Bremer regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; correspondence with client regarding the same.
07/01/16	B. Dillon	1.00	Correspond with T. Nelson regarding [REDACTED]
07/05/16	B. Dillon	0.50	[REDACTED]
07/05/16	M. Shea	1.20	[REDACTED]
07/07/16	B. Dillon	1.40	Correspond with Stinson/Bremer on [REDACTED] [REDACTED] confer with T. Sjoberg on [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; correspond with T. Nelson and Stinson/Bremer on [REDACTED]
07/07/16	C. Sjoberg	1.80	Telephone conference with B. Dillon regarding [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; review and [REDACTED] [REDACTED]; email to B. Dillon summarizing [REDACTED]
07/08/16	B. Dillon	1.20	Confer with T. Nelson regarding estate administration issues [REDACTED]



G R A Y

P L A N T

M O O T Y

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 6March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
07/20/16	B. Dillon	0.80	Attend to issues regarding REDACTED
07/20/16	M. Shea	0.40	Review REDACTED
07/25/16	A. Ewald	0.30	Review REDACTED
07/25/16	B. Dillon	0.80	Confer with T. Nelson, A. Ewald, and J. Leviton on REDACTED
07/26/16	B. Dillon	2.40	Office conference with T. Nelson regarding estate administration issues REDACTED
07/26/16	N. Harwood	2.50	(No Charge) Conference at GPM offices with T. Nelson and B. Dillon to discuss numerous personal agenda items including REDACTED
07/27/16	A. Ewald	0.20	Review and respond to email from T. Nelson regarding REDACTED
07/29/16	B. Dillon	0.40	Confer with REDACTED update T. Nelson on heirship claims.
08/01/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Correspond with REDACTED correspond with T. Nelson on meeting to discuss REDACTED
08/02/16	B. Dillon	0.10	Correspond with T. Nelson on meeting to discuss REDACTED
08/03/16	B. Dillon	0.70	Meet T. Nelson, T. Phelps, and A. Hauck regarding REDACTED
08/03/16	N. Harwood	0.50	(No Charge) Review emails.
08/04/16	B. Dillon	0.20	Correspond with T. Nelson and REDACTED

G R A Y

P L A N T

M O O T Y

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 7March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
08/05/16	B. Dillon	0.40	Telephone call with N. Robertson on REDACTED
08/08/16	B. Dillon	3.50	Confer with T. Nelson and Stinson on REDACTED
08/08/16	M. Shea	1.00	Prepare for and conduct meeting with T. Nelson relating to estate administration matters.
08/09/16	M. Shea	0.50	Consider REDACTED
08/10/16	B. Dillon	0.20	Confer with T. Nelson.
08/11/16	M. Shea	1.00	Conference with T. Nelson regarding REDACTED
08/15/16	M. Shea	0.50	Research REDACTED
08/16/16	J. Anderson	1.10	Legal research regarding REDACTED
08/17/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Correspondence with Stinson regarding REDACTED
08/17/16	M. Shea	0.50	Prepare for and conduct telephone call with T. Nelson relating to update and other related matters.
08/19/16	B. Dillon	0.10	Email T. Nelson on REDACTED
08/22/16	M. Shea	0.10	Correspondence with client regarding REDACTED
08/23/16	M. Shea	0.10	Correspondence with T. Nelson regarding REDACTED
08/31/16	B. Dillon	1.50	Confer with REDACTED
08/31/16	M. Shea	0.20	Review correspondence from T. Nelson and B. Dillon regarding REDACTED
09/02/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Telephone conference with T. Nelson.
09/06/16	B. Dillon	1.00	Telephone call with T. Nelson with updates on REDACTED
09/08/16	B. Dillon	0.30	Update T. Nelson r REDACTED

G R A Y

P L A N T

M O O T Y

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 8March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Description</u>
09/09/16	N. Harwood	4.00	(No Charge) Work from 9/1 through 9/9 regarding client personal matters, REDACTED
09/12/16	B. Dillon	0.60	Correspond with T. Nelson on REDACTED
09/12/16	M. Shea	0.60	REDACTED; correspondence with Stinson regarding REDACTED
09/14/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with client relating to REDACTED.
09/15/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with client relating to REDACTED
09/16/16	M. Shea	0.30	Correspondence with T. Nelson and others relating to REDACTED
09/17/16	M. Shea	0.10	Correspondence with T. Nelson relating to REDACTED
09/22/16	B. Dillon	1.00	Telephone conference with T. Nelson regarding REDACTED
09/26/16	M. Shea	5.20	REDACTED
09/26/16	N. Harwood	5.00	(No Charge) Regarding period from 9/24 through 9/26, conferences and review emails regarding the following: REDACTED
09/27/16	B. Dillon	0.20	Confer with T. Nelson and M. Shea regarding coordination with Holland & Knight.
09/27/16	M. Shea	3.50	(No Charge) Continue work on withdrawal; REDACTED
		Total Hours	95.40
		Total for Services	\$32,514.50
		Total This Statement	\$32,514.50



Nelson, Tyka  
Page 9

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742573



# **EXHIBIT B**

**(REDACTED)**





**GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.**  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

OFFICES:

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH 8TH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402  
PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444

THE WATERGATE –SUITE 700  
600 NEW HAMPSHIRE AVE NW  
WASHINGTON, DC 20037  
PHONE 202 295 2200  
FAX 202 295 2250

SUITE 500  
1010 WEST ST GERMAIN  
ST CLOUD, MN 56301  
PHONE 320 252 4414  
FAX 320 252 4482

474 45th STREET S  
FARGO, ND. 58105  
PHONE 701 356 9030  
FAX 701 356 9031

[WWW.GPMLAW.COM](http://WWW.GPMLAW.COM)

FEDERAL ID [REDACTED]

Tuesday, December 11, 2018

Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

GPM Client # 177910

## Statement of Account

Thank you for entrusting Gray Plant Mooty with your legal work. For your convenience, please find below a listing of all invoices on your account as of 12/11/2018.

### Current Outstanding Balance:

Matter 411771 - Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson							
Bill Num	Bill Date	Fees	Disb	Total	Date Paid	Amt Paid	Bal Due
716008	5/17/2016	\$57,392.25	\$2,506.30	\$59,898.55	11/4/2016	\$59,898.55	\$0.00
721835	7/25/2016	\$13,572.95	\$531.37	\$14,104.32	4/7/2017	\$14,104.32	\$0.00
734889	12/16/2016	\$214,953.00	\$1,589.79	\$216,542.79	4/7/2017	\$152,649.38	\$63,893.41
742571	3/20/2017	\$16,649.50	\$214.00	\$16,863.50	-	\$0.00	\$16,863.50
742597	3/20/2017	\$3,381.00	\$0.00	\$3,381.00	-	\$0.00	\$3,381.00
	Totals	\$305,948.70	\$4,841.46	\$310,790.16		\$226,652.25	<b>\$84,137.91</b>

Total Balance: \$84,137.91

All amounts are billed in U.S. Dollars.

If you have any questions concerning this statement, please contact Lori Nelson-Reid at 612-632-3099 or [lori.nelson@gpmlaw.com](mailto:lori.nelson@gpmlaw.com).



GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402

PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444  
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154

WWW.GPMLAW.COM

FEDERAL ID



Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742571

GPM Client/Matter code: 177910/411771  
Total Amount Due This Invoice: \$16,863.50

Total Enclosed: \_\_\_\_\_

*Please return this page with your payment.*

---



GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402

PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444  
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154

WWW.GPMLAW.COM

FEDERAL ID [REDACTED]

Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742571

For Professional Services Rendered in Connection with:  
411771  
Administration of the Prince Rogers Nelson Estate

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
10/31/16	M. Shea	2.30	[REDACTED]	Analysis of allocation of expenses and attorney fees of items that should be charged to the estate as a whole.
11/16/16	M. Shea	0.50	[REDACTED]	Analysis of asset distributions.
11/29/16	M. Shea	0.70	[REDACTED]	Consider various items with estate administration, beneficiary representation, and [REDACTED]
12/12/16	B. Dillon	0.40	[REDACTED]	Confer with R. Barton regarding case status and fee petitions; confer with M. Shea regarding same.
12/12/16	M. Shea	0.30	[REDACTED]	Confer with B. Dillon regarding fee petitions.
12/13/16	B. Dillon	4.60	[REDACTED]	Work on motion to approve payment of attorney's fees for work benefiting the estate as a whole; prepare supporting affidavit; review and annotate invoices that are at issue in motion; review prior fee petitions approved by the Court; confer with M. Shea regarding all of the above.
12/14/16	B. Dillon	4.50	[REDACTED]	Strategize with M. Shea regarding motion for payment of fees by estate; continue assessing bills and work on motion papers and supporting affidavit; confer with A. Burns regarding positions taken.
12/14/16	M. Shea	3.00	[REDACTED]	Review invoices in preparation for fee petition; strategize with B. Dillon regarding motion for payment of fees by estate and supporting affidavit; compose email to L. Halferty regarding payment of fees by estate.
12/15/16	B. Dillon	2.20	[REDACTED]	Continue working on fee petition and supporting affidavit; confer with M. Shea and A. Burns and billing staff regarding same.

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
AMOUNTS BILLED IN U.S. DOLLARS. CURRENT CHARGES ONLY, UNPAID BALANCES NOT INCLUDED. DISBURSEMENTS NOT YET RECORDED WILL BE INCLUDED IN FUTURE INVOICES.

**GRAY**  
**PLANT**  
**MOOTY**

Nelson, Tyka  
Page 2

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742571

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
12/15/16	M. Shea	1.40	REDACTED	Detailed review and revisions to Petition and Affidavit to approve attorney fees; telephone conference with L. Halferty relating to procedure for approving attorney fees and other related matters.
12/16/16	B. Dillon	2.80	REDACTED	Make final edits to fee petition, supporting affidavit, and notice of motion/motion; confer with M. Shea and support staff regarding same; confer with R. Barton regarding same.
12/16/16	M. Shea	2.00	REDACTED	Review and revise fee petition and supporting affidavit; review invoice detail to submit with petition; confer with B. Dillon regarding fee petition and supporting documents.
12/20/16	B. Dillon	0.60	REDACTED	Work on fee petition.
12/23/16	M. Shea	0.60	REDACTED	Review, revise, and finalize petition invoices and affidavit.
01/04/17	M. Shea	1.00	REDACTED	Consider issues with estate administration and attorneys fees; call with K. Abdo and Foxrothschild people regarding estate matters.
01/10/17	B. Dillon	1.00	REDACTED	Review filings on motions for payment of attorneys fees; work on letter to court requesting clarification of status on GPM motion; confer with M. Shea regarding same.
01/10/17	M. Shea	0.40	REDACTED	Consider procedural posture of petition for fee approval.
01/11/17	B. Dillon	1.80	REDACTED	Work on motion for clarification of court's intent to rule on GPM's petition for attorney fee reimbursement; confer with M. Shea regarding same.
01/11/17	M. Shea	0.80	REDACTED	Analysis of next steps with fee petition; conference with various interested parties relating to fee petitions and other related matters; review pleadings before filing.
01/25/17	B. Dillon	1.10	REDACTED	Review court order regarding filings under seal; review fee petition; strategize with M. Shea and A. Burns regarding motion to file under seal.



Nelson, Tyka  
Page 3

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742571

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
01/25/17	M. Shea	0.30	REDACTED	Review court order regarding filings under seal; analysis and strategy regarding motion to file under seal.
01/29/17	B. Dillon	1.00	REDACTED	Review invoices for supplemental brief justifying redactions.
01/30/17	B. Dillon	1.70	REDACTED	Work on resubmission of petition for payment of attorneys fees.
01/31/17	B. Dillon	0.90	REDACTED	Review recent motions to accept filings under seal; begin working on motion to allow under seal filing of fee petition.
		Total Hours	35.90	
			Total for Services	\$16,649.50

#### Other Charges

<u>Description</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Filing Fee - Various Counties - 10-PR-16-46 - In re the Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson, Deceased. This case consists of additional volumes. For documents filed 04-26-16 to 10-09-16, see file number 10-PR-16-46AFor documents filed 10-10-16 and later, see file number 10-PR-16-46	107.00
Filing Fee - Various Counties - 10-PR-16-46 - In re the Estate of Prince Rogers Nelson, Deceased. This case consists of additional volumes. For documents filed 04-26-16 to 10-09-16, see file number 10-PR-16-46AFor documents filed 10-10-16 and later, see file number 10-PR-16-46	107.00
Total Other Charges	\$214.00
Total This Statement	\$16,863.50



Nelson, Tyka  
Page 4

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742571

Summary by Time Recorder

Time Recorder	Hours Billed	REDACTED	Bill Amount
Matthew Shea	9.80	REDACTED	
Matthew Shea	3.50	REDACTED	
Brian Dillon	22.60	REDACTED	
<b>Total Services</b>	<b>35.90</b>		<b>16,649.50</b>

Total This Statement

\$16,863.50

GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444  
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154

WWW.GPMLAW.COM

FEDERAL ID [REDACTED]

Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742597GPM Client/Matter code: 177910/411771  
Total Amount Due This Invoice: \$3,381.00

Total Enclosed: \_\_\_\_\_

---

*Please return this page with your payment.*

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT  
AMOUNTS BILLED IN U.S. DOLLARS. CURRENT CHARGES ONLY, UNPAID BALANCES NOT  
INCLUDED. DISBURSEMENTS NOT YET RECORDED WILL BE INCLUDED IN FUTURE  
INVOICES.



GRAY, PLANT, MOOTY, MOOTY & BENNETT, P.A.  
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

500 IDS CENTER  
80 SOUTH EIGHTH STREET  
MINNEAPOLIS, MN 55402

PHONE 612 632 3000  
FAX 612 632 4444  
VOICE/TTY 612 632 3154

WWW.GPMLAW.COM

FEDERAL ID [REDACTED]

Nelson, Tyka  
539 Newton Avenue N.  
Minneapolis, MN 55405

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742597

For Professional Services Rendered in Connection with:

411771

Administration of the Prince Rogers Nelson Estate

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Description</u>
02/01/17	B. Dillon	3.20	[REDACTED]	Continue working on motion to seal records.
02/01/17	M. Shea	1.20	[REDACTED]	Review and revise redacted invoices seeking approval for payment; review and revise memorandum in support of payment of attorneys fees.
02/02/17	B. Dillon	2.10	[REDACTED]	Finalize motion to keep fee petition under seal; incorporate edits from M. Shea.
02/02/17	M. Shea	0.50	[REDACTED]	Review and revise memorandum and other documents related to fee petition.
02/22/17	M. Shea	0.40	[REDACTED]	Analysis of next steps with fee petitions; consider proper response to objections.

Total Hours 7.40

Total for Services \$3,381.00

Total This Statement \$3,381.00





Nelson, Tyka  
Page 2

March 20, 2017  
Invoice # 742597

Summary by Time Recorder

Time Recorder	Hours Billed	REDACTED	Bill Amount
Matthew Shea	2.10	REDACTED	
Brian Dillon	5.30	REDACTED	
<b>Total Services</b>	<b>7.40</b>		<b>3,381.00</b>

Total This Statement

\$3,381.00